07/22/2003 Page 130

AGENDA ITEM 28

Consider awarding bids received for culverts - precast box to the low bidder meeting specifications - NewBasis.

Moved: Commissioner Heiligenstein
Seconded: Commissioner Limmer

Motion: To award bid received for culverts - precast box to the low bidder meeting specifications - NewBasis.
Vote: 5-0

< Attachment >

Joe M. England, P.E.
County Engineer

3151 SE Inner Loop, Suite B
Georgetown, Texas 78626
Telephone (512) 930-3330

Fax (512) 930-3335

Williamson County
Unified Road System
Memorandum
Date: July 16, 2003
From: Joe M. England, P.E.
To: Ginny Atkinson, Assistant Purchasing Director

Greg Bergeron, Road Administrator
Subject: Annual Bid: Culverts - Precast Box
Upon review of the Hanson Pipe and the NewBasis bids, NewBasis is lower than Hanson Pipe on 46 of
the 50 items. Hanson Pipe’s bid stated award of all items or none. Therefore it is my recommendation

that NewBasis be awarded the contract.

Should you have any further questions or need any further information, please call me.
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BID TABULATION

CULVERTS - PRECAST BOX

BID NUMBER 03WC053

DESCRIPTION HANSON PIPE| NEWBASIS
ITEM # WIDTH |HEIGHT UNIT UNIT PRICE |UNIT PRICE
BID LOW OR ALL BASIS ALL LOW

1 3 1 LF NO BID $77.11
2 3 1.5 LF NO BID $77.11
3 3 2 LF $71.82 $79.30
4 3 3 LF $83.20 $89.80
5 4 1 LF NO BID $89.90
6 4 2 LF $93.02 $94.31
7 4 3 LF $104.25 $99.81
8 4 4 LF $109.93|  $114.26
9 5 1 LF NO BID $96.50
10 5 2 LF $112.77 $101.06
11 5 3 LF $124.03 $111.96
12 5 4 LF $150.76 $125.51
13 5 5 LF $164.85 $135.41
14 6 1 LF NO BID $114.26
15 6 2 LF $152.09 $118.67
16 6 3 LF $164.52 $133.21
17 6 4 LF $176.95 $143.11
18 6 5 LF $192.04 $158.91
19 6 6 LF $207.26 $169.91
20 7 1 LF NO BID $132.11
21 7 2 LF $172.67 $172.31
22 7 3 LF $152.04 $151.21
23 7 4 LF $211.42 $161.11
24 7 5 LF $232.22 $172.11
25 7 6 LF $247.42 $180.90
26 7 7 LF $265.30 $190.81
27 8 1 LF NO BID $156.71
28 8 2 LF $205.88 $161.11
29 8 3 LF $225.26 $169.91
30 8 4 LF $244.65 $180.91
31 - 8 5 LF $264.03 $190.81
32 8 6 LF $277.73 $212.52
33 8 7 LF $287.36 $222.42
34 8 8 LF $309.42 $232.32
35 9 1 LF NO BID $169.91
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07/22/2003

BID TABULATION

CULVERTS - PRECAST BOX

BiD NUMBER 03WC053

36 9 2 LF NO BID $173.90
37 9 3 LF $263.80 $199.08
38 9 4 LLF $281.80 $208.98
39 9 5 LF $299.79 $218.97
40 9 6 LF $317.79 $228.78
41 9 7 LF $335.79 $238.68
42 9 8 LF $357.84 $251.77
43 10 1 LF NO BID $200.00
44 10 2 LF NQ BID $203.00
45 10 3 LF NO BID $225.25
46 10 4 LF $320.68 $238.45
47 10 5 LF $339.96 $245.05
48 10 6 LF $359.24 $256.06
49 10 7 LF $377.23 $265.95
50 10 8 LF $396.50 $281.35
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AGENDA ITEM 29

Consider approving a change order for the oversight and application of concrete sealer at the Juvenile Services
building.

Moved: Commissioner Heiligenstein

Seconded: Judge Doerfler

Motion: To table this agenda item until next week.
Vote: 5-0

AGENDA ITEM 30

Consider approving Victims Assistant Grant Resolution for Victims Services.

Moved: Judge Doerfler
Seconded: Commissioner Limmer
Motion: To approve Victims Assistant Grant Resolution for Victims Services.
Vote: 5-0
<Attachment>



