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AGENDA ITEM 21

Consider closing Liberty Walk from North Field to O'Connor on July 4th from 9:15 a.m. to 10:15 a.m. for
Brushy Creek Women's Forum parade.

Moved: Commissioner Hays
Seconded: Judge Doerfler
Motion: To approve closing Liberty Walk from North Field to O'Connor on July 4th from 9:15 a.m. to 10:15
a.m. for Brushy Creek Women's Forum parade.
Vote: 4-0

AGENDA ITEM 22

Consider approving Waiver of Penalty and Interest as determined by Tax Assessor/Collector.

Moved: Commissioner Hays
Seconded: Judge Doerfler
Motion: To approve Waiver of Penalty and Interest as determined by Tax Assessor/Collector.
Vote: 4 - 0

< Attachment>
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Date: May 28, 2002

To: Members of the Commissioners Court

~
From: Deborah M. Hunt, CTA

Subject: Waiver of Penalty & Interest

In accordance with Section 33.011 of the Texas Property Tax Code, "The
Governing Body of a taxing unit shall waive penalties and may provide
for the waiver of interest if interest on a delinquent tax is an act or
omission of an officer, employee, or agent of the taxing unit or the
appraisal district in which the taxing unit participates caused or
resulted in the taxpayer's failure to pay the tax before delinquency and
if the tax is paid within 21 days after the taxpayer knows or should
know of the delinquency."

Account # Name P&I + Attornev Description
R023016 Shamin Farhat $16.27 + $0.00 Clerical error by

& Ghulam- WCTO.
Akbar

P311907 La Fiesta $154.23 + $0.00 Error by WCTO,
Restaurant never received

any delinquent
notice.

R390116 Aleksei M. Rae $31.92 + $0.00 Clerical error by
WCTO.
Statement ID on
check, did not
research far
enough.
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RC334311 Sajjad A. $847.74 + $0.00 Clerical error by
Salemonhmed Travis County,

never mailed
delinquent
notices.

P419696 Cisco Systems $28.07 + $0.00 Clerical error by
Capital Corp. WCAD.

Main Office and Mailing Address:
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AGENDA ITEM 23

Consider approving Property Tax Refunds as determined by Tax Assessor/Collector.

Moved: Commissioner Hays
Seconded: Judge Doerfler
Motion: To approve Property Tax Refunds as determined by Tax Assessor/Collector.
Vote: 4 - 0

< Attachment>

William%on QCountp
Tax Assessor/Collector

Deborah M. Hunt, eTA

Date: May 28, 2002

To: Commissioner's C~u.rV

From: Deborah Hunec;:A

Subject: Property Tax Refunds

In accordance with Section 31.11 of the Property Tax Code, the court
needs to approve all refunds in excess of $500.00. We are presenting
the attached list which includes these property tax refunds for your
approval.

Please contact me at 943-1601, ext. 7015, if you have any questions.

Thank you.

Main Office and Mailing Address:
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