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AGENDA ITEM 13

Consider awarding various annual bids.

Moved: Judge Doerfler
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To award bids as recommended by the Auditor’s office. (See attached list.)

Vote: 4-0

< Attachment >

ANNUAL BIDS FOR FISCAL YEAR 2002

LIST OF RECOMMENDED AWARDS

AGGREGATE 02WCAO002
1ST: SHALLOW FORD CONSTRUCTION
ITEMS 1-3
2ND: CENTEX MATERIALS
ITEMS 1-3
3RD: SUNSHINE SAND & GRAVEL
ITEMS 1&2
VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
ITEMS 4-9

PHARMACY SERVICES FOR INDIGENT CARE 02WCA008
CEDAR PARK AREA
WALGREENS

FLUIDS & GREASE 02WCA012
ARNOLD OlL
ITEMS 1-8 & 10
ALLIED SALES COMPANY
iTEMS 9 & 11-13

HEAVY EQUIPMENT PARTS & SERVICE/LABOR 02WCA015
TEXANA MACHINERY
HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS
COOPER EQUIPMENT COMPANY
WAUKESHA-PEARCE INDUSTRIES
WILLIAMSON COUNTY EQUIPMENT CO.
TAYLOR EQUIPMENT

MEDICAL SUPPLIES FOR EMS 02WCA021
(AWARD AS PER ATTACHED BID RESULTS)
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP.
BLUE RIDGE MEDICAL
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
GALLS dba DYNA MED
HENRY SCHEIN
MDS MATRX ( MATRX MEDICAL)
MEDICAL SUPPLIES DEPOT

MOORE MEDICAL CORP 4.2 5-0/
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP ) \

PMX MEDICAL .. L
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT

SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES

ZOLL MEDICAL CORP.

COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA  9/25/01
PAGE 1of2
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MEDICAL SUPPLIES FOR JAIL
(AWARD AS PER ATTACHED BID RESULTS)

ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP.
HARRIS GLOVE & MEDICAL SUPPLY
HOME AID HEALTHCARE
MDS MATRX (MATRX MEDICAL)
MERCY SURGICAL DRESSING GROUP
MOORE MEDICAL CORP.
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP
PMX MEDICAL
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT

ROAD BASE MATERIALS

ZONE 1: M.E. RUBY
ITEMS 1 &2

ZONE 2: CENTEX MATERIALS
ITEMS 1-4 & 7-12

ZONE 3: L.D. WITT MATERIALS
ITEM 1

ZONE 4: TEXAS CRUSHED STONE
ITEMS 1-5 & 7-12

ROAD SIGNS & MARKERS
PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS
ROADRUNNER TRAFFIC SUPPLY
ROCAL INC
SOUTH TEXAS POWER WASH & STRIPING

CONTRACT TOWING SERVICES FOR SO
SOUTHEAST AREA 1
CEN-TEX TOWING
SOUTHEAST AREA 2
RANDY'S WRECKER SERVICE

ASPHALT MIXES
AUSTIN ASPHALT
ITEMS 1 &2
VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
ITEMS 3 &4

ASPHALT CEMENT & CUT BACK ASPHALT
GULF STATES ASPHALT

ASPHALT EMULSIONS
18T: KOCH MATERIALS
2ND: GULF STATES ASPHALT

COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA  9/25/01
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02WCA026

02WCA027

02WCA028
02WCA039
02WCA042

02WCA043

02WCA044

J
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ANNUAL BIDS RE-AWARDED FOR FISCAL YEAR 2002

LIST OF RECOMMENDED RE-AWARDS
VEHICLE INSURANCE
TEXAS ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES (TAC)

PROPERTY & CASUALTY INSURANCE
LEIBOWITZ INSURANCE

EMS MALPRACTICE INSURANCE
LEIBOWITZ INSURANCE

COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA  9/25/01
PAGE 1 of1
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BID NUMBER: 02WCA002

Page 105

WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303

GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://www.williamson-county.org/Procurement

BID TABULATION

AGGREGATE FOR UNIFIED ROAD AND BRIDGE SYSTEM
BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 15, 2001 - 2:00 PM
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 1°7

2ND:
3RD;

SHALLOW FORD CONSTRUCTION —-Items 1 -3
CENTEX MATERIALS - Items 1-3

SUNSHINE SAND & GRAVEL - ltems 1 & 2
VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS —items 4 -9

ITEM DESCRIPTION ONIT SHALSY | cEnTex SUNSEINE | VULCAN CONST.
# CONST. MATERIALS GRAVEL MATERIALS
1 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302,
Type B, Grade 3 Ton 8.95 6.50 7.50 NO BIC
2 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302,
Type B, Grade 4 Ton 7.45 6.50 7.50 NO BIC
3 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302,
Type B, Grade 5 Ton 5.95 6.50 NO BID NO BIC
4 Pre-Coat Aggregate,
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 3 Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID DPELIVERED COST
GRANGER 32.8(
5 Pre-Coat Aggregate, FLORENCE 32.8(C
6 Pre-Coat Aggregate, TAYLOR 31.47
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 5 Ton NO BID NOEID NO BID
7 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 3 Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID
DELIVERED COST
8 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 4 Ten NO BID NO BID NO BID GRANGER 27 8.
9 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 5 FLORENCE 26.9-
Ton NO BID NO BID NOBID | LIBERTY HILL 26.2.
TAYLOR 25.8

b
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://www.williamson-county.org/Procurement

BID TABULATION

PHARMACY SERVICES FOR INDIGENT CARE ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR CEDAR PARK AREA

BID NUMBER: 02WCA008 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: SEPTEMBER 18, 2001 — 2:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002

RECOMMENDED AWARD: WALGREENS
AREA VENDOR vk DISPENSING FEE
Walgreens 2.00
Cedar Park Alberisons 2.50

**** Average Wholesale Price (AWP) minus 10 percent (%) plus a $ dispensing fee.
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BID NUMBER: 02WCAG12

BID TABULATION

FLUIDS & GREASE ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR UNIFIED ROAD & BRIDGE SYSTEM

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 15, 2001 ~ 2:00 PM
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002

Page 107

WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://www.williamson-county.org/Procurement

RECOMMENDED AWARD: ARNOLD OIL - ITEMS 1-8 & 10
ALLIED SALES COMPANY - ITEMS 9 & 11-13
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PER 1 # PRICE #
ITEM 55 GALLON PER 5§ GALLON GALLONS PER 1 QUART
VENDOR # DESCRIPTION DRUMS GALELON CASE LOT PER CASE QUART S PER
PAIL CASE CASE
LOT
1 15W40 Engine Oil for Diesel 223.56 21.90 20.08 4 16.68 12
2 10W30 Engine Qil for Gas
Engines 194.94 20.78 N/A 14.18 12
3 Trans Fluid, Dexron
NiMercon 197.51 2277 N/A 14.72 12
4 Hydrautic Fluid, AW 68
20W20 143.92 16.02 N/A N/A
5 Gear Oif, 80W390 APl GL-5 246.92 25.77 N/A N/A
ARNOLD
OIL 6 Anti-Freeze Coolant Mixture 139.55 N/A 17.18 6 N/A
7 Universal Traclor Fluid 192.08 19.56 N/A N/A
g | Extended Life Coolant 177.14 N/A 19.38 6 N/A
9 Transmission/Drive Train Qil 258 10 N/A N/A N/A
10 syﬂthetlc Transmission Qil 839.50 75.27 N/A N/A
5W-20 Engine Oil for Gas
11 Engines 337.76 N/A N/A 22.58 12
Synthetic Blend Dexron Il
12 | Mercon V 417.26 N/A N/A 26.07 12
T PRICEPER | PRICE # '
CARTRIDGE PER CARTRIDGE
CASE PER CASE
1 G
3 | Grease 1.583 15,83 10
ITEM#8 BiD A PREMIX ITEM#12 BID NON-SYNTHETIC MERCON

BID 15 SUBJECT TO REFINERS PRICE INCREASES. ONLY THE AMOUNT OF THE REFINERS INCREASE WILL BE PASSED ON.
THIRTY (30) DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE WILL BE GIVEN BEFORE ANY INCREASES WILL BE ACCESSED. A COPY OF THE REFINERS NOTICE

WILL BE PROVIDED.

FLUIDS & GREASE BID TAB
PAGE {1 of 4

¥
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PRICE PER PRICE | PRICE PER 1 # PRICE #
— 55 GALLON PER 5 GALLON GALLONS | PER1 | QUART
VENDOR p DESCRIPTION DRUMS GALLON | CASELOT | PERCASE | QUART | SPER
PAIL CASE CASE
LOT
1 | 15W40 Engine Ol for Diesel 209.04 23.90 30.12 6 15.12 12
2 éowao Engine Oil for Gas 194.11 N/A N/A N/A 14.64 12
ngines
3 | Trans Fluid, Dexron 227.15 N/A N/A N/A 13.98 12
li’'Mercon
4 gg\j’v*'gg"c Fluid, AW 68 191.45 N/A N/A NIA na | A
ALLIED 5 | Gear Oil, B0WS0 API GL-5 256.41 24.78 N/A N/A 21.24 12
SALES . ]
53 Anti-Freeze Coolant Mixture 147.32 N/A, 20.94 6 N/A N/A
COMPANY
7 | Universal Tractor Fluid 217.41 22.71 N/A N/A NA|  NA
8 | Extended Life Coclant 512.60 N/A 11.33 6 N/A N/A
g | Transmission/Drive Train Oil 249.86 25.37 N/A N/A N/A N/A
1 | Synthetic Transmission Oil 895.03 86.32 N/A N/A NA | NA
5W-20 Engine Oil for Gas
11 | Engines 321.25 N/A N/A N/A 20.28 12
Synthetic Blend Dexron lil
12} Mercon V 389.40 N/A N/A N/A 24.84 12
PRICE PER PRICE #
CARTRIDGE PER CARTRIDGE
CASE PER CASE
1
3 | Grease 1.03 41.20 40

$12.00 DRUM DEPOSIT OR EXCHANGE
EXCEPT ANT! FREEZE DRUMS — NO DEPOSIT REQUIRED

FLUIDS & GREASE BID TAB
PAGE 2 of 4
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PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PER 1 # PRICE #
ITEM 55 GALLON PERS GALLON GALLONS PER 1 QUART
VENDOR # DESCRIPTION DRUMS GALLON CASE LOT PER CASE QUART S PER
PAIL CASE CASE
LoT
1 15W43 Engine Oil for Diesel 264.00 N/A 23.52 4 16.53 12
2 10W30 Engine Oil for Gas
Engines 293.70 N/A N/A N/A 18.24 12
3 Trans Fluid, Dexron
[1/Mercon 287.10 33.00 N/A N/A 14.55 12
4 Hydraulic Fluid, AW 68
20W20 22110 23.40 N/A N/A NIA N/A
T.R 5 | Gear O, 80W90 APl GL-5 312.00 33.06 N/A NIA NA | NA
WHITED ! .
6 Anti-Freeze Coolant Mixture 212.00 N/A 26.40 6 N/A N/A
OIL, LLC
7 Universal Tractor Fluid 273.35 27.15 N/A N/A N/A N/A
g | Extended Life Coolant 632.50 N/A N/A N/A NA | NA
9 Transmission/Orive Train Qil 265.65 26.95 N/A N/A N/A N/A
10 | Synthetic Transmission Oil N/A 86.10 N/A N/A N/A NiA
5W-20 Engine O for Gas
1 Engines 300.30 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Synthetic Blend Dexron 1il
12 Mercon V 481.80 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PRICE PER PRICE #
CARTRIDGE PER CARTRIDGE
CASE PER CASE
13 | Gresse 1.38 13.80 10

BID ALL ITEMS OR NONE BASIS

EXXON PRODUCTS DO NOT HAVE DRUM DEPOSITS.

MOBIL PRODUCTS REQUIRE $20.00 DRUM DEPOSITS.

FLUIDS & GREASE BID TAR
PAGE 3 of 4
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PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PER 1 # PRICE #
ITEM 55 GALLON PER 5 GALLON GALLONS PER 1 QUART
VENDOR ¥ DESCRIPTION DRUMS GALLON CASELOT | PERCASE | QUART S PER
: PAIL CASE CASE
LOT
1 15W40 Engine Oil for Diesel 379.04 39.52 8.36 N/A N/A
2 10W30 Engine Qil for Gas
Engines N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
3 Trans Fiuid, Dexron
ll/Mercon N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
4 Hydraulic Fiuid, AW 68
20W20 N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A
5 Gear Oit, B0WS0 API GL-5 468.28 45,59 N/A N/A N/A N/A
HOLT CO,
OF TEXAS ] Anti-Freeze Coolant Mixture 445.87 N/A 10.86 N/A N/A
7 Universal Tractor Fluid 407.63 42.26 N/A N/A N/A NIA
g | Extended Life Coolant 310.93 31.91 7.80 NA | A
g Transmission/Drive Train Oif 354.11 40.32 N/A N/A N/A N/A
10 | Synthetic Transmission Of N/A N/A N/A N/A NA T NA
5W-20 Engine Qi for Gas
11 1 Engines N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Synthetic Blend Dexron it
12 | Mercon v N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PRICE PER PRICE #
CARTRIDGE PER CARTRIDGE
CASE PER CASE
13 | Crease 2.77 27.70 10
FLUIDS & GREASE BID TAB h

PAGE 4 of 4
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http:/iwww.williamson-county.org/Procurement

BID TABULATION

HEAVY EQUIPMENT PARTS AND SERVICE/LABOR ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR
UNIFIED ROAD AND BRIDGE SYSTEM

BID NUMBER: 02WCAO015

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 15, 2001 ~ 2:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002

RECOMMENDED AWARD:

TEXANA MACHINERY

HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS

COOPER EQUIPMENT COMPANY
WAUKESHA-PEARCE INDUSTRIES
WILLIAMSON COUNTY EQUIPMENT CO.
TAYLOR EQUIPMENT

THESE BID TAB SHEETS ARE FOR THE FOLLOWING HEAVY EQUIPMENT:

BARBER-GREENE, DYNAPAC, FERGUSON, & ROSCO Bid Tab Page 2
FORD AGRICULTURAL MACHINERY Bid Tab Page 2
JOHN DEERE INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT Bid Tab Page 2
CHAMPION MOTOR GRADERS, WALDON SWEEPERS Bid Tab Page 2
CASE CONSTRUCTION MACHINERY Bid Tab Page 3
CATERPILLAR HEAVY EQUIPMENT Bid Tab Page 4
CHAMPION ROLLERS, ETYNYRE, BROCE BROOMS Bid Tab Page &
BOMAG, GRADALL Bid Tab Page 6
INTERNATIONAL — CASE AGRICULTURAL MACHINERY Bid Tab Page 7
MASSEY FERGUSON & BUSHHOG AGRICULTURAL MACHINERY Bid Tab Page 8
HEAVY EQUIPMENT PARTS & SERVICE/LABOR BID TAB %(’&

PAGE 1 of 8
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NO BIDS

RECEIVED FOR THE FOLLOWING:

BARBER GREENE, DYNAPAC, FERGUSON, & ROSCO
FORD AGRICULTURAL MACHINERY

JOHN DEERE INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT

CHAMPION MOTOR GRADERS, WALDON SWEEPERS

VEHICLE REPAIR PARTS VENDOR NAME: E‘

ATTACHMENT

Page 2 of 8
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TEXANA MACHINERY FOR
CASE CONSTRUCTION MACHINERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT

# PRICE
PARTS

1 List Less Discount Percentage (%):
SERVICE/LABOR

2
Shop Mechanic hour 60.00
Field Mechanic hour 65.00
Shop Welder & Machinist hour 65.00
Field Welder & Machinist hour 0.00
Truck Engine Mechanic hour 0.00
FIELD SERVICE TRUCK

3
Mileage mile 1.00 / MILE
Labor hour 1 60.00 / HOUR
Plus expense - actual cost
SERVICE TRUCK - CRANE

4
Mileage mile 1.00
L

abor hour 60.00

Plus expense - actual cost
HAUL TRUCK

5 =+ CONTRACT HAUL AT ACTUAL COST
Mileage loaded P

mile
Permits - actual cost
Minimum charge
VEHICLE REPAIR PARTS VENDOR NAME: w
ATTACHMENT Page 3 of 8
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HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS FOR
CATERPILLAR HEAVY EQUIPMENT
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT
# PRICE
PARTS
1 List Less Discount Percentage (%):
SERVICE/LABOR
2
Shop Mechanic hour 65.00
Field Mechanic hour 80.00
Shop Welder & Machinist
op Welder achinis hour 65.00
Field Welder & Machinist hour 75.00
Truck Engine Mechanic hour 68.00
FIELD SERVICE TRUCK
3
Mit i
leage mile 1 450/ MILE
Labor hour 0.00
= NO CHARGE FOR DRIVE TIME .
Plus expense - actual cost
SERVICE TRUCK - CRANE
4
Mileage mile
Labor hour 0.00
**** NO CHARGE FOR DRIVE TIME -
Plus expense - actual cost
HAUL TRUCK
5 et MINIMUM
Mileage loaded 3.50/ SMALL
mile 7.50 / LARGE
Permits - actual cost
BASED ON MACHINE
Minimum charge
SMALL $125.00 LARGE $350.00
VEHICLE REPAIR PARTS VENDOR NAME: Q—
Page 4 of 8 !
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COOPER EQUIPMENT COMPANY FOR

CHAMPION ROLLERS, ETYNYRE, BROCE BROOMS

UNIT
M DESCRIPTION
IT§ UNIT PRICE
PARTS
1 List Less Discount Percentage (%): LIST PLUS 6%
SERVICE/LABOR
2
Shop Mechanic hour 60.00
Field Mechanic hour 65.00
Shop Welder & Machinist hour 60.00
Field Welder & Machinist hour 65.00
Truck Engine Mechanic hour 65.00
FIELD SERVICE TRUCK
3
Mileage mile 195
Labor hour 30.00
Plus expense - actual cost
N/A
SERVICE TRUCK — CRANE
4
Mileage mile N/A
Lab
abor hour N/A
Plus expense - actual cost
N/A
HAUL TRUCK
5
Mileage loaded
mile 2.00
Permits - actual cost
$81.00 OVERWEIGHT $31.00 OVERWIDTH
Minimum charge
$200.00
VEHICLE REPAIR PARTS VENDOR NAME: %‘L
ATTACHMENT Page 5 of 8
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WAUKESHA-PEARCE INDUSTRIES FOR

BOMAG, GRADALL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT
# PRICE
PARTS |
1 List Less Discount Percentage (%): 0
SERVICE/LABOR
2
Shop Mechanic hour 65.00
Field Mechanic hour 65.00
Shop Welder & Machinist hour 75.00
Field Welder & ini
ield Welder & Machinist hour 75.00
Truck Engine Mechanic hour N/A
FIELD SERVICE TRUCK
3
Mileage mile 1.50
Labor
hour 65.00
Plus expense - actual cost
SERVICE TRUCK - CRANE
4
Mileage mile 1.50
Labor h
our 65.00
Plus expense - actual cost
HAUL TRUCK
5
Mileage , loaded
mile N/A
Permits - actual cost
N/A
Minimum charge
N/A

VEHICLE REPAIR PARTS VENDOR NAME:
ATTACHMENT Page 6 of 8 !
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY EQUIPMENT CO. FOR
INTERNATIONAL - CASE AGRICULTURAL MACHINERY

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT
# PRICE
PARTS
1 List Less Discount Percentage (%): 0%
SERVICE/LABOR
2
Shop Mechanic hour 50.00
Field Mechanic
ie hour 50.00
Shop Weider & Machinist
op d a hour 50.00
Field Welder & Machinist hour N/A
R .
Truck Engine Mechanic ho
g ur N/A
FIELD SERVICE TRUCK
3
Mileage mile
NO CHARGE
Labor hour
DRIVING TIME PLUS LABOR TIME 50.00
Plus expense - actual cost
$25.00 PER SERVICE CALL
SERVICE TRUCK - CRANE
4
Mileage i
ileag mile N/A
Labor
l hour N/A
Plus expense - actual cost
HAUL TRUCK
5
Mileage loaded
mile 3.00
Permits - actual cost
Minimum charge
$100.00 EACH TRIP
VEHICLE REPAIR PARTS VENDOR NAME:

ATTACHMENT Page 7 of 8
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TAYLOR EQUIPMENT FOR
MASSEY FERGUSON & BUSHHOG AGRICULTURAL MACHINERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT
# PRICE
| PARTS 0% DISCOUNT ON CRDERS UNDER $1,000.00
1 List Less Discount Percentage (%): 10% DISCOUNT ON ORDERS OVER $1,000.00
SERVICE/LABOR
2
Shop Mechanic hour 57.50
- . hour
Field Mechanic 67.50
hini h
Shop Welder & Machinist our N/A
Field W & hinist h
ield Welder & Machinis our N/A
Engi :
Truck Engine Mechanic hour N/A
FIELD SERVICE TRUCK
3
Mil i
ileage mile N/A
Labor h
our N/A
Plus expense - actual cost
N/A
SERVICE TRUCK - CRANE
4
Mileage il
ileag mile N/A
Lab h
abor our N/A
Plus expense - actual cost
N/A
HAUL TRUCK
5
Mileage loaded
mile N/A
Permits - acfual cost
N/A
Minimum charge
NIA
VEHICLE REPAIR PARTS VENDOR NAME: %"9

ATTACHMENT Page 8 of 8
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09/25/2001

WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://www.williamson-county.org/Procurement

WILLIAMSON COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID RESULTS

MEDICAL SUPPLIES FOR EMS ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA021 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 16, 2001 — 2:00 PM
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002

RECOMMENDED AWARD:
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP., BLUE RIDGE MEDICAL, EMERGENCY MEDICAL
PRODUCTS, EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY, GALLS dba DYNA MED, HENRY
SCHEIN, MDS MATRX, MEDICAL SUPPLIES DEPOT, MOORE MEDICAL CORP.,
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP, PMX MEDICAL, SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY
EQUIPMENT, SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES, & ZOLL MEDICAL CORP.




Page 120

09/25/2001

Medical Supplies for Williamson County EMS

VENDOR

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT

ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP

BAG VALVE MASK WITH RESERVOIR-DISPOSABLE, ADULT WITH 02 TUBING

TOWELS, DISPOSABLE (UP TO BATH TOWEL SIZE) 102 PACKAGE

ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP. DEXTROSE 2.5GM/10ML PFS (NEEDLELESS} 201 EACH
ALLIANGE MEDICAL CORP. ECG ELECTRODES, PEDI - HUGGABLES 483 BOX
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP. LV. CATHETER 14 GA X 2" TERUMO SUREFLO (PROTECTIVE CATHETER SYSTEM) NO BID
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP. 1.V. CATHETER 16 GA X 1.25" TERUMO SUREFLO (PROTECTIVE CATHETER SYSTEM) 2136 EACH
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP. LV. CATHETER 18 GA X 1.25" TERUMO SUREFLO (PROTECTIVE CATHETER SYSTEM) 2.136 EACH
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP. 1.V. CATHETER 20 GA X 1.25" TERUMO SUREFLO (PROTEGTIVE CATHETER SYSTEM) 2138 EacH
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP. L.V. CATHETER 27 GA X 1.75" TERUMO SUREFLO (PROTECTIVE CATHETER SYSTEM) 2136 EACH
ALLIANCE MEDICAL GORP. L.V. CATHETER 24 GA X 1.25" TERUMO SUREFLO (PROTECTIVE CATHETER SYSTEM) 2237 EAGH
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP. LIDOCAINE JELLY 2% 10 ML, PFS 8.09 EACH
ALLIANCE MEDIGAL CORP. PILLOW CASES, DISPOSABLE 1314 EACH
BLUE RIDGE MEDICAL MAGNESIUM SULFATE PREMIX, 4GM/50ML BAGS 284 EACH
BLUE RIDGE MEDICAL PROCARDIA 10MG CAPSULE 2.32 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS 10 GALLON BIQHAZARD INFECTION WASTE BAGS 20.00 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS 4X 4 STERILE GAUZE 28.56 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS 4" X 4* NON-STERILE SPONGES 8 PLY 33.2 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS ACCU-CHECK GLUCOMETER SIDE TOUCH TEST STRIPS, BOTTLES 3520 BoX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS ADENOCARD 6 MGIVIAL 269.90 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL. PRODUCTS AMIODARONE 150MGIVIAL OR AMPULE 74.29 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PROBUCTS ASHERMAN CHEST SEAL 7.27 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS ATROPINE 1MG/OML PFS, NEEDLELESS 1.60 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS ATROPINE 1MGHML VIAL .525 EACH
_|EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS 7.92 EACH

Page 1 of 15
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Medical Supplies for Williamson County EMS

VENDOR

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT .

EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS

DILTIAZEM 25MG/SML POWDER (NON REFRIGERATED)

BAG VALVE MASX WITH RESERVOIR-DISPOSABLE, PEDI, W)TH 02 TUBING 927 EAGH

EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS BENADRYL (DIPHENHYDRAMINE) 50 MG VIAL (BIDGER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 45 EacH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS BLANKETS - DISPOSABLE POLYESTER 3.18 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS BLOOD ADMIN SET WITH PUMP CHAMBER, DRIP CHAMBER, INJECTION SITE & 170 FILTER 1.86 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS BLOOD COLLECTION NEEDLES, MUTIPLE SAMPLE J PLASTIC HUB / THIN WALL 5.67 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS BLUNT CANNULA - 18 GUAGE {METAL} FOR NEEDLELESS IV USE. 2299 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PROBUCTS CALGIUM CHLORIDE 10%, PFS (NEEDLELESS) 1.34 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS CALCIUM CHLORIDE 10% VIAL 68 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS CARBON DIOXIDE DETECTOR (EASY CAP BRAND) ATTACHES TO ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE, ADULT SIZE 8.44 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS CARBON DIOXIDE DETECTOR (EASY CAP BRAND) - PEDIATRIC SIZE 8.44 EACH|
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS CHILD RESTRAINT SYSTEM FOR CHILD UP TO ABOUT 40 LBS. TO REPLACE CHILD SAFETY SEAT FROM CAR WRECKS. INFLATABLE. 184.28 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS COMBITUBE ADULT 33.45 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS COMBITUBE SWALL ADULT 33.45 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS CONFORMING ROLLER BANDAGE - STERILE 4" X 757 2272 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS CONTACT LENS REMOVAL KIT 1.34 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS CONVENIENCE BAG/DISPOSABLE EMESIS BAG 8.85 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS COTTON TIP APPLICATORS - NON STERILE 33.00 CASE.
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS COTTON TP APPLICATORS - STERILE 26.30 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS DEFIBRILLATOR ELECTRODE GEL 2 0Z. TUBES 10.32 BOx
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS DEFIBRILLATOR PADS 26.35 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS DEMAND VALVE RESUSCITATOR (40LPM) W/ ADULT MASK AND &' HOSE (LSP BRAND PREFERRED) 174.83 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS DEXTROSE 256H/50ML PFS (NEEDLELESS) 1.80 EACH
|emercENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS 22.80 EACH

Page 2 of 15




Page 122

09/25/2001

Medical Supplies for Williamson County EMS

VENDOR

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT

EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS

DOPAMINE PREMIX 400MG/250ML BAG

EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS

EAR PROBE FOR HAND HELD PULSE OXIMETER - MUST BE COMPATIBLE WiTH BMI BRAND PULSE OXIMETER 144.32 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS EM PACK CASE PLUS, TRAUMA BAG (BIDDER TO SEND EXAMPLE OR PICTURE OF BAG WITH B0} 4227 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS ENDO-TROL (TRIGGER TUBE) TRACHEAL TUBES, ASST SIZES. 8.54 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS EPI AUTO INJECTION PEN, ADULT 39.59 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS EPI AUTO INJECTION PEN, PED) 349.59 m.>0:1
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS EPINEPHERINE 1:1000 1MG/1ML VIAL OR AMPULE 31 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS EPINEPHRINE 1:10,000 1MG/HOML PFS (NEEDLELESS) 144 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS ET TUBE RUSCH UNCUFFED SIZE RANGES - 2.5, 3.0,3.5,4.0,4.5,5.0 MM 98 BACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS EYE PROTECTION GLASSES W/ ANSI 287.1 COMPLIANGE - UVEX ASTRO SPEC 3000 3.39 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS FUROSEMIDE (LASIX) 100MG/10ML PFS (NEEDLELESS) BIDDER TC SPECIFY WHICH. 281 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS FUROSEMIDE {LASIX) 100MG/10ML VIAL {BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 54 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS GLOVES, LATEX, MICROFLEX DIAMOND GRIP; MEDIUM POWDER FREE 4.95 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS GLOVES, LATEX, MICROFLEX DIAMOND GRIP; SMALL POWDER FREE 4.85 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS GLOVES, LATEX, MICROFLEX DIAMOND GRIP; EXTRA LARGE POWDER FREE 4.95 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS GLOVES, LATEX, MICROFLEX DIAMOND GRIP; LARGE POWDER FREE 495 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS HANDHELD PULSE OXiMETER WITH FINGER PROBE { BMI BRAND) 426.00 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS HELMET, FIREFIGHTER STYLE, WITH IMPACT RESISTANT FACE SHIELD 106.87 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS I.V. ADMIN. SET 10 GTT WITH 2 NEEDLELESS INJECTION SITES, 100" 1.59 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS I.V. ADMIN. SET 15 GTT. WITH 2 NEEDLELESS INJECTION SITES, 100" LENGTH - LIFESHIELDCLAVE 502 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS LV, ADMIN. SET 60 GTT WITH 1 INJECTION SITES 185 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS LV, ADMIN. SET 60 GTT WITH 2 NEEDLELESS INJECTION SITES, 70™ 222 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS 1.29 EACH

LV, EXTENSION SET WITH 2 INJECTION SITES, NEEDLELESS, UP TO 34" LENGTH

Page 3 of 15




Page 123

09/25/2001

Medical Supplies for Williamson County EMS

VENDOR

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT

EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS

INFECTION CONTROL, BOOT COVERS, FLUID RESISTANT, (APPROX. 18" TALL).

EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS

INTRAOSSEOUS/ASPIRATION NEEDLE 16 GA MONOJECT 8.54 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS INTRAOSSEQUS/ASPIRATION NEEDLE 18 GA JAMA SHIDI 8.24 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS [PATROPIUM BROMIDE OR ATROVENT 0.02 % IN 2.5 ML UNIT DOSE {BIDDER TO SPECIEY WHICH) ‘84 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS IV PRESSURE INFUSER WITH GAUGE, DISPOSABLE 1081 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS LARYNGOSCOPE BLADES, DISPOSABLE, COMPATABLE WITH RUSCH STANDARD OR SMALL HANDLES. 361 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS LIDOCAINE (XYLOGAINE) 2% 100MG/SML. PFS, NEEDLELESS (BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 150 EACH|
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS LIDOCAINE (XYLOCAINE) 100MG/SML VIAL (BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 162 m>nz_
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS LIDOCAINE PREMIX: 2GH/500ML BAGS 480 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS LUER LOCK CANNULAS COMPATIBLE WITH PRE-PIERCED GATHETER PLUGS 42 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS MALE ADAPTER PLUG FOR CONNECTION TO CATHETER HUB, PRE-PIERCED, COMPATIBLE WITH BLUNT CANNULA SYSTEM 111 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS MAST TROUSERS, ADULT WITH PRESSURE RELIEF VALVES, PUMP ASSY, AND CASE: DOWNSIZEABLE TO CHILD SIZE 318.5¢ EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS METHYLPREDNISOLONE (SOLUMEDROL) 1 GM/ 8 ML VIAL (BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 1538 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS MORPHINE SULFATE 10MGHML VIAL 17.70 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS MULTI GRIP. ROUND DISPOSABLE Cib 3.30 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NACL 0.8% 10 ML VIAL 49 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NAGL 0.9% PREFILLED SYRINGE, SML VOLUME 61 EACH|
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NALBUPHINE (NUBAIN) 10 OR 20MGHML AMPULE (BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 52 EACH
{EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NALBUPHINE (NUBAIN) 10 OR 20MG/4ML. VIAL (BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 379 EACH
leMerceNcY meicAL PRODUCTS NALOXONE (NARCAN) 2MG/2ML PFS, NEEDLELESS (BIDDER TO SPECIEY WHICH) 773 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NASAL CANNULA, ADULT, CURVED TP 28 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NASAL CANNULA, PEDI, GURVED TiP .41 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS 19.00 BOX

NEEDLE, 18 GA LUER LOCK 1", W/ SAFETY PROTECTED POINT (SEND PICTURES OR SAMPLE}
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DESCRIPTIONOFPRODUCT .~ o . - BOXICASE,

EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NEEDLE, 25 GA LUER LOCK 5/8", W/ SAFETY PROTECTED POINT (SEND PICTURES OR SAMPLE) 20.00 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NITRO SPRAY, 200 UNIT DOSES - Aerosol 27.15 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NON REBREATHER MASK {TOTAL) WiTH RESERVOQIR, ADULT, WITH TUBING 83 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS NORMAL SALINE, 1000 CC BAGS 83 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS OB KIT, HARD PACK, SEALED 4.19 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS OHIO ADAPTOR FOR OXYGEN 11.31 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDIGAL PRODUCTS ORAL PHARYNGEAL AIRWAYS - SIZE RANGES: 40,50,60,70,80,90,100,110 MM 8.5 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS OXY-CLIP (STRETCHER FRONT MOUNT) 58.70 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS OXYGEN CYL WRENGH, ALUMINUM, SMALL 41 EACHI
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS OXYGEN NEBULIZER WITH TUBING, MASK AND MEDICATION ADMINISTRATION BODY - CHILD SIZE 74 BACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODVUCTS OXYGEN STEM AND NUT 23 EACH|
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS PENLIGHT, DISPOSABLE 4.11 PACKAGE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS PHENERGAN (PROMETHAZINE) 25MG/1ML VIAL OR AMPULE {BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH} 1.87 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS PITOCIN (QOXYTOCIN) 40 UNITS VIAL (BIDDER TQ SPECIFY WHICH) 51 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS PULSE OXIMETER PROBE, PED| DISPOSABLE, MUST BE COMPATIBELE WITH BM) BRAND PULSE OXIMETER 14.23 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS PULSE OXIMETER SOFT CASE FOR BMI BRAND PULSE OXIMETER 18.99 EACH
Lmzmxmmsz‘ MEDICAL PRODUCTS PULSE OXIMETER W/ ADULT FINGER PROBE, HAND HELD, BM{ BRAND 429.00 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUGTS RES-CUE PUMP, HAND HELD SUCTION UNIT. 31.98 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS RING GUTTER REPLACEMENT BLADE 52 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SAGER SPLINT INFANT/CHILD BILATERAL 205.16 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SAGER SPLINT SUPER BILATERAL 248.45 EACH]
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SALEM SUMP TUBES, SIZES 8FR TO 18FR 1.66 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SALINE LOCK - CLAVE PORT MALE ADAPTER PLUG 1.55 EACH
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VENDOR DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT ' 'BOXICASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SALINE LOCK - LIFESHIELD INJECTION PORT 136 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SALINE LOCK HUBS, LONG - COMPATIBLE WITH BLUNT NEEDLES 1-11 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SHARPS CONTAINER - 5 QUART, POINT OF USE COLLECTOR 181 EACH
EMERGENGY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SHARPS CONTAINER MIDDEN BRACKET 258 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SODIUM BICARB. 4.2 % 10 ML PFS (NEEDLELESS) 180 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SODIUM BICARB. B.4 % 50 ML PFS (NEEDLELESS) 1.80 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SPLINTS 16", PADDED BOARD 2.00 EACH
leMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SPLINTS 36", PADDED BOARD 320 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SPLINTS 54, PADDED BOARD 4.50 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SPLINTS 6", PADDED 1V, ARM BOARD A1 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SPLINTS, AIR INFLATABLE, VELCRQ ADJUSTABLE. 4119 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS STERILE WATER FOR IRRIGATION 1000 CC BOTTLES 88 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS STERILE WATER FOR IRRIGATION 250 CC BOTTLES 85 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS STETHOSCOPE ADC PROSCOPE 670 SERIES 3.09 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS STETHOSCOPE ADC PROSCOPE 675 PEDIATRIC SERIES 438 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS STETHOSCOPE DUAL HEAD, GENERIC 3.08 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS STRETCHER NET FOR FERNO MODEL 93 ES (HARTWELL MEDICAL CATCH ALL) 3634 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SUCTION TUBING 116" X & 80 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDIGAL PRODUCTS SYRINGE. 10112 CC LURE LOCK 0.67 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SYRINGE, 1cc TB STYLE W/ 27ga X 1/2* REMOVABLE NEEDLE 7.08 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SYRINGE, 3 CC LUER LOCK 4,84 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS SYRINGE, 35 CC SLP TiP 15.48 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS TETRACAINE 0.5%, 1ML YUBE; SINGLE USE DOSE 2.70 EACH
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DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT e TR
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS THERMOMETER COVERS, DIGITAL 1.80 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS 327.84 EACH
TOD MAST HI-AT MODULAR AND TRANSPARENT WITH INFLATION BULB, AND RELIEF VALVE (PNEUMATIC ANTI-SHOCK GARMENT)
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS TRACTION SPLINT, FARE TECH ADJUSTABLE ADULTICHILD COMBO - 10330 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS TUBEX INJECTOR 3.50 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS U.P. PACK CASE PLUS WITH iIMPERVAGARD SHELL (BIDDER TO SEND EXAMPLE OR PiCTURE OF BAG WITH BID) 4528 EACH
[EMERGENGY MEDICAL PRODUCTS VALIUM (DIAZEPAM) 10MG/2ML VIAL (BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 5789 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS 14.26 BOX
VALIUM (DIAZEPAM) 10MG2ML PFS, NEEDLELESS (BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH)

EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS VENI-GARD BRAND ADULT 3" X 2.5 IV SITE SECURING DEVICE 2018 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS VENI-GARD BRAND JUNIOR 2.5™ X 1.825" IV SITE SECURING DEVICE 26.18 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS VERSED (MIDAZOLAM) 10MG/2ML. VIAL (BIDDER TQ SPECIFY WHICH) 2186 BOX
ngm_ﬂmmzo‘ﬁ MEDICAL PRODUCTS V-VAC MANUAL SUCTION UNIT 52.81 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS V-VAC REPLAGEMENT CARTRIGE 9.31 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS WHISTLE TIP ADAPTERS FOR ET TUBES 5.16 EACH
|EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS ZOLL MULTI-FUNCTION PADS (DEFIB-PACING) FOR M SERIES, PEDI 18.36 PAIR
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 1 GALLON BIOHAZARD INFECTION WASTE BAGS 2278 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY ALUMINUM FOIL, STERILIZED 44.84 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY BANDAID 1~ X 3% PLASTIC STRIP 1.48 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY BED PANS, FRACTURE STYLE .74 EACH|
_mgmwﬁmzo< MEDICAL SUPPLY BLOOD COLLECTION NEEDLES, MULTIPLE SAMPLE - LUER ADAPTABLE 10.00 BOX
_m’ammﬂﬂmzo< MEDICAL SUPPLY B8LOOD COLLECTION TUBES, LAVENDER TOP, 5 ML DRAW 0778 .m.)OI
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY BLOOD COLLECTION TUBES, BLUE TOP, 2.7ML DRAW W/3.2% SODIUM CITRATE COAGULATE {(VACUTAINER BRAND - # 366-393) ‘785 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY BLOOD COLLECTION TUBES, LAVENDER TOP, 7ML DRAW 0825 EACH
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EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY

BLOOD COLLECTION TUBES, RED TOP, 7ML DRAW 0795 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
BURN SHEETS, STERILE, DISPOSABLE. 3.24 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 09 EACH
EMESIS BASIN DISPOSABLE SMALL i
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
EMS SHEARS (SCISSORS) 90 EACH]
|EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 2.52 EACH
ET TUBE RESTRAINT ADULT, THOMAS BRAND i
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 2.52 EACH
ET TUBE RESTRAINT CHILD, THOMAS BRAND ’
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 98 EACH
ET TUBE RUSCH CUFFED SIZED RANGES - 5.5,6.0,6.5,7.0,7.5,8.0,6.5,9.0 MM ’
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 1.04 EACH
GOGGLES FOR SPLASH PROTECTION WITH SIDE VENTS AND ANTI-FOG LENS, DISPOSABLE i
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
HEAD BED Il, DISPOSABLE CID 2.28 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
1.V. POLE STRETCHER MOUNT 19925 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 141.00 EACH
IMMOBILIZATION BOARDS FOR PEDI AND CHILD WIVELCRO CLOSURES. i
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 0322 EACH
INFECTION CONTROL, HEAD BOUFFANT COVERS; FLUID RESISTANT, "
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 31 EACH
INFECTION CONTROL, PERSONAL PROTECTION GOWN, FLUID RESISTANT, LONG SLEEVED i
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY INFECTION ISCLATION KIT, UNI-SIZE WITH LONG SLEEVED PERSONAL PROTECTIVE GOWN, N-95 TYPE MASK, HEAD BOUFEANT, 275 EACH
SHOE COVERS, AND INFECTIOUS WASTE BAG IN A PROTECTIVE BAG OR POUCH. )
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
K Y JELLY .08 OZ FOIL PACK 3.20 EAGH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
KENDRICK EXTRICATION DEVICE, FERNO MODEL 125 82.50 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
LANCETS - NON SPRING LOADED 225 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
LANGETS - SPRING LOADED 11.00 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
LARYNGOSCOPE BLADES (MAGINTOSH STYLE, RUSCH] -NOT DISP, NOT FIBER OPTIC #0,1,2,3,4 1140 EAGH
EMERGENGY MEDICAL SUPPLY
LARYNGOSCOPE BLADES (MILLER STYLE, RUSCH) - NOT DISP, NOT FIBER OPTIC #1,2,3,4 1140 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 9.50 EACH
LARYNGOSCOPE HANDLE, RUSCH LARGE -
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
LARYNGQSCOPE HANDLE, RUSCH SMALL, 9.50 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
c MAGILL FORCEPS, ADULT 2.28 EACH
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EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY

MAGILL FORGEPS, PEDI 2.28 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 66.00 EACH
MAXI DUFFLE BAG WITH 4 SEPARATE 2IPPERED COMPARTMENTS: COLOR - BLUE :
IEMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
MEDICAL EYE SHIELDS - PLASTIC -28 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
MEDICAL KIT, PLANO 747 76.40 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY MEGA DUFFLE Q2 VERSION WITH 6 SEPARATE ZIPPERED EXTERNAL COMPARTMENTS (PURCHASER TO DEFINE LOCATION OF 82.95 EACH
COMPARTMENTS) "
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
MULTI TRAUMA DRESSING 10 X 30" 1.08 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 2.18 BOX
NAIL POLISH REMOVER PACKS "
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 88 EACH
NON REBREATHER MASK WITH RESERVOIR, PEDI, WITH TUBING i
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 14.79 EACH
OXYGEN FLOW METER GRADUATED 0 LPM TO 25 LPM "BALL-TYPE" i
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
OXYGEN NEBULIZER WITH TUBING AND MOUTH PIEGE 57 EACH|
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 835 EACH
OXYGEN NEBULIZER WITH TUBING, MASK AND MEDICATION ADMINISTRATION BODY- ADULT SIZE ’
JEMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 41.50 EACH
PRESSURE REDUCER REGULATOR HIGH FLOW REGULATOR FOR H,K,5,M,T SIZE TANKS
EMERGENCY MEDRICAL SUPPLY
PROVIDINE IQDINE PREP PADS 24.00 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 81.00 CASE
RES-CUE PUMP, HAND HEL.D SUCTION REPLACEMENT CANISTERS
EMERGENCY M PPLY
Gl EDICAL SU RING CUTTER 2.91 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY i
$COOP STRETCHER: FERNO MODEL 65 350.78 EACH
|EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
SHARPS 2 GAL. 260-280 SYRINGE CAPACITY 2.35 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
SOFT STRETCHER, USED AS A PATIENT MOVING DEVICE FROM STRETCHER TO BEDS. 20.95 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY 6.95 EACH
SPHYGMOMANOMETER ANEROID WITH BULB, BLADDER AND GAUGE ADULT .
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
SPHYGMOMANOMETER ANEROID WITH BULB, BLADDER AND GAUGE CHILD 6.05 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
SPHYGMOMANOMETER ANEROID WITH BULB, BLADDER AND GAUGE INFANT 8.95 EACH
Y PPLY
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPL SURGICAL FACE MASK, FLUID RESISTANT (N85 STYLE) 9.22 BOX
- [EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY
SURGIPAD STERILE 8" X 10" 3.43 TRAY
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EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY

SYRUP OF IPECAC 1 0Z BOTTLES 32.04 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY TINCTURE OF BENZOIN SWAB AMPULES 10-10 BOX
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY TOURNIQUET, NON-LATEX 132.00 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY TOURNIQUET, LATEX 152.00 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY TRACTION SPLINTS FERNGTRAC ADULT 152,50 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY TRACTION SPLINTS FERNGTRAC CHILD 152.50 EACH
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY TRIANGULAR BANDAGES MUSLIN CLOTH 54" X 27" WIO SAFETY PINS 57.00 CASE
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLY VASELINE DRESSING 3° X 9" 6.36 BOX
GALLS dba DYNA MED DUTY BELT, NYLON, WITH PLASTIC BUCKLE; ADJUSTABLE SIZES, 18.28 EACH
GALLS dba DYNA MED RAINCOATS Wi HOODS AND EMS LOGO, 48" PVC VINYL sizes-S to XXL; COLOR YELLOW. 1280 EACH
HENRY SCHEIN ACETOMINOPHEN SUPPQSITORY 325 MG 3.04 BOX
HENRY SCHEIN ALBUTEROL 0.083 % UNIT DOSE 483 BOX
HENRY SCHEIN BULB SYRINGE 2 OZ. .61 EACH
MDS MATRX [MATRX MEDICAL) ACCU-CHECK {ADVANTAGE} GLUCOMETER 40.00 EACH
MDS MATRX (MATRX MEDICAL} 8.84 EACH

BAG VALVE MASK WITH RESERVOIR-DISPOSABLE, CHILD, WITH 02 TUBING
MDS MATRX (MATRX MEDICAL) HEAD VISE II, DISPOSABLE CID 3.28 EACH
MDS MATRX (MATRX MEDIGAL) INSTANT ICE PACKS 6* X g 2T EACH
MDS MATRX (MATRX MEDICAL) LIFE PACK BATTERY 5/10 1.3 VOLTS 29.28 EACH
MEDICAL SUPPLIES DEPOT BLOOO COLLECTION TUBES, RED TOP, 5§ ML DRAW 08 EACH
MEDICAL SUPPLIES DEPOT BLOOD COLLECTION TUBES, BLUE TOP, 4.5ML DRAW, W/3.2% SODIUM CITRATE COAGULATE {(VACUTAINER BRAND # 368-714) 083 EACH
MEDICAL SUPPLIES DEPOT BLOOD COLLECTION TUBES, GREEN TOP, 5 ML DRAW 138 EACH
Emu.n.p.. SUPPLIES DEPOT BLUNT CANNULA - PLASTIC FOR NEEDLELESS IV USE. 20.00 BOX
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MEDICAL SUPPLIES DEPOT LARYNGOSCOPE BULB - LARGE

MEDICAL SUPPLIES DEPOT LARYNGOSCOPE BULB - SMALL 346 BOX
MEDICAL SUPPLIES DEPOT NASO-GASTRIC { NG} SUCTION TUBING: SIZES: 8,10,12,14,16818 ERENCH 35 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL ACCU-CHECK GLUCOMETER, ACCURACY TESTING SUPPLIES {SETS) 7.50 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL ASPIRIN, BABY CHEWABLE TABLETS 50 BOTILE
MOORE MEDICAL BACK BOARDS, WOOD - 72", WIO PINS. 5130 EACH,
MOORE MEDICAL BITE STICK, POLYETHYLENE 13 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL BLOOD COLLECTION NEEDLES "ADAPTER" TO LUER LOCK OR SLIP TIP SYRINGE 4.59 EACH
[MOORE MEDICAL BLOOD COLLECTION NEEDLE TUBE HOLDER 147 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL CHARCOAL, ACTIVATED - 50 GM (bottles only) 702 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR HARD PLASTIC DISPOSABLE SIZE - INFANT 3.05 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR HARD PLASTIC DISPOSABLE SIZE - NO NECK 3.05 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR HARD PLASTIC DISPOSABLE SIZE - PEDIATRIC 3.05 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR HARD PLASTIC DISPOSABLE SiZE - REGULAR 305 BACH
MOORE MEDICAL EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR HARD PLASTIC DISPOSABLE SIZE - SHORT 305 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR HARD PLASTIC DISPOSABLE SiZE - TALL 3.05 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL INSTANT GLUGOSE 15 GRAMS (TUBE ONLY) 6.33 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL MALE URINAL, PLASTIC .32 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL MAST TROUSERS PUMP ASSEMBLY WITH HOSES 89.42 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL NALOXONE {(NARCAN) 4MG/10ML VIAL (BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) 173 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL OXYGEN CYL. WRENCH, ALUMINUM, LARGE 312 BACH
MOORE MEDICAL OXYGEN HUMIDIFIER, DISPOSABLE - PREFILLED 129 BACH
MOORE MEDICAL SHARPS SHUTTLES, SINGLE USE CONTAINERS 145 EACH
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VENDOR

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT
MOORE MEDICAL STRETCHER SHEET, FITTED BOTTOM DIPOSABLE, POLYPROPYLENE, FLUID RESISTANT 20.28 EACH
NO BID ADAPTER - NEBULIZER TO BVM NOBID
NO BID BLOOD COLLECTION TUBES, TIGER TOP, 4.5ML DRAW NO BID
NOBID BUNKER COAT {ROYAL BLUE & WHITE) VARIOUS SIZES NO 81D
NO BID HELMET, HARD HAT STYLE W/ IMPACT RESISTANT FACE SHIELD AND CHIN STRAP (NOT ELECTRICAN STYLE) ADVENT BRAND N0 8ID
NOBID LV. EXTENSION SET WITH 2 NEEDLELESS INJEGTION SITES, 6" (AMSINO OR EQUIVELENT) NG BID
N0 BID LMA (LARYNGEAL MASK AIRWAY) - SIZE 1, 1.5, 2, 2.5, 3, 4, 5 [DISPOSABLE] NOBID
NO BID MESH TRAFFIC VESTS, REFLECTIVE MTL, VINYL-COATED KNIT FABRIC, VELCRO CLOSURE: Wi "EMS" LOGO NG BID
NOBID PERTRACH, ASSORTED SIZES NO BID
NOBID SHARPS CONTAINER - 2GALLON, POINT OF USE COLLECTOR NO BID
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP CONFORMING ROLLER BANDAGE - NON-STERILE 4* X 75* 1229 CASE
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP FAGE SHIELD MASK WiTH VISOR 367 EAGH
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP SOFT TIP SUCTION CATHETERS; SIZES SFR TO 16FR. 211 EACH
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP TAPE 1° HYPOALLERGENIC CLEAR 561 EACH
PMX MEDICAL BABY BEANIE, FOR NEW BORNS 81 EACH
PMX MEDICAL BACKBOARD RESTRAINT STRAPS, SINGLE USE [TWO PIECE - ORANGE) WOVEN MATERIAL 278 EACH
PMX MEDICAL CANVAS TARP WITH STRAPS 99.84 EACH
PAX MEDICAL CHILD RESTRAINT SYSTEM FOR CHILD UP TO ABOUT 40 LBS. TO REPLACE CHILD SAFETY SEAT FROM CAR WRECKS. NON 158.33 EACH
INELATABLE.

PMX MEDICAL CHILD TRANSPORT SEAT, FERNO PEDI PAL 580.00 EACH
PMX MEDICAL CLIP LOCK CANNULA (PLASTIC) 29 EACH
PMX MEDICAL EMESIS WASH BASINS, DISPOSABLE, LARGE 7 1/4 QUART 52 EACH
PMX MEDICAL EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR, HARD PLASTIC; ADJUSTABLE: INFANT AND PED. 598 EACH
. __ix MEDICAL EXTRICATION CERVICAL COLLAR, HARD PLASTIC; 16 SIZE - ADJUSTABLE: ADULT 812 EACH
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VENDOR : . .
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT
PMX MEDICAL HEAD HUGGER DISPOSABLE HEAD IMMOBILIZER 304 EACH
PMX MEDICAL LV. ADMIN. SET 15 GTT, WITH 2 NEEDLELESS INJECTION SITES, 100" LENGTH - LIFESHIELD 148 EACH
PMX MEDICAL LV. CATHETER 14 GA X 1.25” TERUMO SUREFLO (PROTECTIVE CATHETER SYSTEM) 184 EACH
PMX MEDICAL INTUBATION CASE TO CARRY BLADES, TUBES, HANDLES, BATTERIES, ETC. {such as SRP brand) 55.28 EACH
PMX MEDICAL NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAYS, SIZE RANGES - #20,22,24,26,28,30,32,34,38 1.39 EACH
PMX MEDICAL NDM PROFILE DIAPHORETIC FOAM ELECTRODE 420 BOX
PMX MEDICAL OXY-CLIP, FERNC STRETCHER SIDE MOUNT 84.34 EACH
PMX MEDICAL OXYGEN CYLINDER MOUNT, FOR SINGLE MOUNT; "KKK APPROVED MOUNT" 13289 EACH
PMX MEDICAL PARA SHIELD FACE SHIELD WITH MASK 64 EACH
PMX MEDICAL PEDIATRIC IMMOBILIZATION BOARD, WOOD 4214 EACH
PMX MEDICAL PILLOWS, DISPOSABLE (150z. OR THICKER) 1.54 EACH
PMX MEDICAL PREP RAZORS, SURGICAL STYLE DOUBLE BLADED, DISPOSASLE 4 EACH|
PMX MEDICAL PULSE OXIMETER PROBE, ADULT NON-DISPOSABLE, MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH BMI BRAND PULSE OXIMETER 13088 EACH
PMX MEDICAL SPHYGMOMANOMETER ANEROID WITH BULB, BLADDER AND GAUGE LARGE ADULT 815 EACH
FMX MEDICAL STAIR CHAIR, FERNOQ MODEL 107 631.74 EACH
PMX MEDICAL STERILE FLUFF GUAZE 4" ROLLS 28 EACH
PMX MEDICAL STRETCHER REPLACEMENT STRAP; FERNO - 5FT. 2 PIECE (BURGANDY) 827 EACH
PMX MEDICAL STRETCHER REPLACEMENT STRAP; FERNO - SHOULDER HARNESS {BURGANDY) 3144 EACH
PMX MEDICAL STRETCHER SHEET, FLAT TOP, DISPOSABLE. 18.80 CASE
PMX MEDICAL STYLETTE SATIN SLIP TYPE LARGE (ADULT) 1.73 EACH
PMX MEDICAL STYLETTE SATIN SLIP TYPE SMALL (PEDI) 1.73 EACH
PMX MEDICAL SUCTION, BATTERY POWERED: S-SCOR KIT 1ll 37749 BACH
“|PMX MEDICAL SURGIPAD STERILE 8* X 3 225 BOX
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VENDOR o
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT
PMX MEDICAL TAPE 2~ WATERPROOF CLEAR 320 EACH
PMX MEDICAL TECNOL N35 RESPIRATOR LARGE 57 EACH
PMX MEDICAL TECNOL N85 RESPIRATOR SMALL. 57 EAGH
PMX MEDICAL TINCTURE OF BENZOIN SWABSTICKS 850 BOX
PMX MEDICAL TRIAGE TAGS CFCA 23.50 BOX
PMX MEDICAL YANKAUER SUCTION TIP WITH WHISTLE-TYPE CONTROL VALVE 27.00 CASE
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT ALCOHOL PREF PADS 1.20 ROX
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT BLANKETS - DISPOSABLE, LAMINATED FOAM 1.80 EACH
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT ECG ELECTRODES ADULT {MEDI-TRACE 200-30 OR EQUIVELANT} FOR 12 LEAD USE 420 BOX
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT NU TRAKE - BIVONA 120.00 EACH
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT OXYGEN CYL, HAND WHEEL 2.55 EACH
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENGY EQUIPMENT OXYGEN CYLINDER MOUNT, FOR CARRYING ONE "D" CYL. BOTTLE 2295 EACH
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENGY EQUIPMENT OXYGEN CYLINDER MOUNT, FOR CARRYING TWO "D” CYL. BOTTLES. 4685 EACH
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUPMENT | CONTENTS GAUGE & TWO HIGH FLOW PORYS, 1§ YEAR OF LOMGER WARRAIS (oo MNUM CONSTRUCTION W/ PROTEGTED 124580 EACH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES DELEE MUCOUS TRAP 10 FR 1.58 EACH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES DELEE MUCOUS TRAP 8 FR 1.58 EACH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES ECG ELECTRODES MEDI-TRACE MINi 58.20 BOX
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES GLOVES, NITRILE LATEX FREE; EXTRA LARGE POWDER FREE 450 BOX
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES GLOVES, NITRILE LATEX FREE; LARGE POWDER FREE 4.50 BOX
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES GLOVES, NITRILE LATEX FREE; MEDIUM POWDER FREE 4.50 BOX
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES GLOVES, NITRILE LATEX FREE; SMALL POWDER FREE 450 BOX
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES LACTATED RINGERS 1000cc BAGS 78 EACH
" [SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES MINI DIGITAL ELECTRONIC THERMOMETER; ORAL AND RECTAL STYLES 249 EACH
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VENDOR

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT

SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES

OHIO OXYGEN QUICK CONNECT ADAPTER WITH 1/8" MALE NPT OUTLET 10.78 BacH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES OHIOQ OXYGEN QUICK CONNECT ADAPTER WITH DISS MALE QUTLET 1227 EACH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES REPLACEMENT MANOMETER, FOR BP CUFF 4.88 EACH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES SPHYGMOMANOMETER ANERQID WITH BULS, BLADDER AND GAUGE THIGH 841 EACH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES SUCTION CONTAINERS DISPOSABLE 1200 CC (BEMIS SYSTEM Il) 1.51 EACH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES SYRINGE, 20 CC LURE LOCK 7.86 BOX
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES SYRINGE, 60 CC CATHETER TIP 40.68 CASE
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES SYRINGE, 60 CC LUER LOCK 40.68 CASE
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES SYRINGE, 60CC SLIP TIP 40.68 CASE
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES TAPE 1" HYPOALLERGENIC CLOTH 545 EACH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES TAPE 2" HYPOALLERGENIC CLOTH 1.00 EACH
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES TAPE 3" HYPOALLERGENIC CLOTH 1635 EACH)
SOUTHERN SAFETY SALES ZOLL MULTIFUNCTION PADS {DEFIB-PACING) FOR M SERIES, ADULT 1633 PAIR
ZOLL MEDICAL CORP ZOLL ECG MONITOR BATTERY 85.00 EACH
ZOLL MEDICAL CORP ZOLL ECG MONITOR CABLES FOR M SERIES 270.00 EACH
ZOLL MEDICAL CORP ZOLL ECG MONITOR PAPER FOR M SERIES 340 PACKAGE
ZOLL MEDICAL CORP 425,00 EACH

ZOLL MONITOR CASE FOR M SERIES
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://www.williamson-county.org/Procurement

WILLIAMSON COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID RESULTS

MEDICAL SUPPLIES FOR JAIL ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA026 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 16, 2001 — 2:00 PM
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002

RECOMMENDED AWARD:
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CORP., HARRIS GLOVE & MEDICAL SUPPLY, HOME AID
HEALTHCARE, MDS MATRX, MERCY SURGICAL DRESSING GROUP, MOORE
MEDICAL CORP., OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP, PMX MEDICAL, &
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT
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* |ovanmiry per]:

VENDOR DESCRIPTION OF _uzouc.wu BOXICASE - o.om. .wmw.woanwmm.
ALLIANCE MEDICAL CALCIUM CHLORIDE 10%, PFS (NEEDLELESS) EACH 1.67 EACH
HARRIS GLOVE & MEDICAL SUPPLY GLOVES MICROFLEX DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER FREE - SMALL 100/BOX 5.00 BOX
HARRIS GLOVE & MEDICAL SUPPLY GLOVES MICROFLEX DIAMOND GRIP, FOWDER FREE - MEDIUM 100/BOX 5.00 BOX
HARRIS GLOVE & MEDICAL SUPPLY GLOVES MICROFLEX DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER FREE - LARGE 100/BOX 5.00 BOX
HOME AID HEALTHCARE ADALAT CC 30mg ! 60mg 100/BOTTLE 119.47 BTL/212.81 BTL
HOME AID HEALTHCARE ALBUTEROL INHALER 80 MCG-17GM EACH 15.74 EACH
HOME AID HEALTHCARE IBUPROFEN 400 MG 500/BOTTLE 10.50 BOTTLE
HOME AlD HEALTHCARE {BUPROFEN 600 MG 500/BOTTLE 13.50 BOTILE
HOME AID HEALTHCARE IBUPROFEN 800 MG 500/BOTTLE 19.85 BOTTLE
HOME AID HEALTHCARE LANCETS - SPRING LOADED 150/BOX 23.50 BOX
HOME AID HEALTHCARE ORABASE WITH BENZOCAINE 5 GM TUBE 6.49 TUBE
HOME AID HEALTHCARE VECURONIUM 10 MG/10 ML VIAL 71.67 VIAL
MDS MATRX ACCU-CHECK GLUCOMETER EACH 40.00 EACH
MERCY SURGICAL DRESSING GROUP ELITE GLUCOMETER TEST STRIPS 50/BOX 28.15 BOX
MERCY SURGICAL DRESSING GROUP ENSURE PLUS -8 OZ CHOCOLATE & VANILLA | STRAWBERRY 24/CASE 28.26 CASE [30.14 CASE
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION 30" X 42 EXAMINATION GOWNS 50/CASE 12.97 CASE
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION 4.5 OZ STERILE SPECIMEN GUPS 100/CASE 15.88 CASE
MOORE MEDICAL GORPORATION 40" X 48" DRAPE SHEETS 100/CASE 11.25 CASE
MOORE MEDICAL GORPORATION ACETAMINOPHEN 500 MG 100/BOTTLE 100 BOTTLE
MODRE MEDICAL CORPORATION ALCOHOL BOTTLE - PINT EACH .51 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION ASPIRIN, BABY CHEWABLE TABLETS 36/80TTLE .53 BOTTLE
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION CHEM STRIP - 10 TEST STRIPS 100/PACKAGE €0.40 PACKAGE
- |MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION GiTRU Il CLEANER - GALLON GALLON 12.24 GALLON
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QUANMITY BER|

VENDOR DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT BOXICASE : ooﬂ .mm. mox\gpmm -

MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION DISPOSABLE GTOSOPE SPECULA 1000/BAG 22.42 BAG
|MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION GENTAMIGINE OPTHALMIC SOLUTION 3 MG/ML 5 ML EACH 2.59 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION HYDROCGRTISONE CREAM - 1 OZ TUBE EACH 88 EACH
MOOQRE MEDICAL CORPORATION HYDROXYZINE 25 MG 100/BOTTLE 2.42 BOTTLE
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION _zénox«uzm 50 MG 100/BOTTLE 3.41 BOTTLE
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION __w:_umommz 200 MG 100/BOTTLE 206 BOTTLE
MOGRE MEDICAL CORPORATION INSTANT GLUCOSE - 15 GRAMS/TUBE 3PACKAGE 6.73 PACKAGE
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION LINDANE SHAMPOO 1% - ONE PINT EACH 23.82 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION MICONAZOL NITRATE VAG CREAM - 7 2% 45 GM EACH 5.18 EACH
MOURE MEDICAL CORPORATION NON-STERILE COTTON TIPPED APPLICATORS 1600/80X 4.15 BOX
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION ONE STEP HCG PREGNANCY TEST 30/80X 51.78 BOX
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION PRENATAL VITAMIN NATALINS-RX 200/BOTTLE 7.35 BOTTLE
_zoozm MEDICAL CORPORATION SHOWER BENGH WITH BAGK EACH 33.4% EACH
|MoORE MEDICAL CORPORATION SUTURE REMOVAL KIT S0/CASE 2535 CASE
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC CREAM - 1 OZ TUBE EACH 98 EACH
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION VACUTAINER BLOOD COLLECTION TUBES, 10 ML RED 100/BOX 15.25 BOX
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION VACUTAINER TUBES, STERILE PRELABELED, COLOR CODED RUBBER STOPPERS, RED & ML 100/BOX 13.38 BOX
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION VELCRO FINGER SPLINTS 10/BOX 24.12 BOX
MOORE MEDICAL CORPORATION WHITE PETROLATUM JELLY - 13 0Z EAGH 2.68 EAGH
NO BID ASA 325 MG NO BID NQ BID
NO BID BEGLOVENT INHALER NO BID NO BID
NO BID CORTOMYCIN OTIC SOLUTION NO BID NO BID
|noBID DR D HOT PEPPER - 16 OZ NO BID NO BID
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VENDOR DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT
NO BID LINDANE 1% LOTION - ONE GALLON NO BID NO BID
—20 8o FPENTOTHAL OR (THIOPENTAL} SYRINGE 500 MG {BIDDER TO SPECIFY WHICH) NO BID NO BID
_zo BIO PHENERGAN 25MG/ML SYRINGE, NEEDLELESS OR ADAPTABLE NO BID NOBID
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP #10 DISPOSABLE SCALPELS 10M30X 2.98 BOX
OFFSHQRE MEDICAL GROUP #11 DISPOSABLE SCALPELS 10/BOX 2.98 BOX
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP 2" X 5" ELASTIC BANDAGES 50/CASE 13.50 CASE
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP 4 X 4 NON-STERILE GAUZE 4000/CASE 37.60 CASE|
OFFSHORE MEDICAL GROUP #15 SCALPEL 10/BOX 2.98 BOX
_17; MEDICAL ACCU-CHECK GLUCCOMETER SIDE TOUCH TEST STRIPS 50/80X 38.50 BOX
_v!x MEDICAL BECK AIRWAY AIRFLOW MONITOR EACH 5.68 EACH
—_uz_x MEDICAL CANVAS TARP WITH STRAPS EACH 99.94 EACH
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT INSTANT ICE PACKS 6 X 9= 24/CASE 6.35 CASE
SOUTHEASTERN EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT SPHYGMOMANOMETER ANERQID WiTH BULE, BLADDER AND GAUGE LARGE ADULT EACH 7.05 EACH
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BID NUMBER: 02WCAO027
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://www.williamson-county.org/Procurement

BID TABULATION

ROAD BASE MATERIALS ANNUAL CONTRACT
BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 15, 2001 - 2:00 PM

RECOMMENDED AWARD: ZONE 1:
ZONE 3:

M.E. RUBY - ITEMS1 &2

ZONE 2: CENTEX MATERIALS - ITEMS1-4&7~12
L.D. WITT MATERIALS - ITEM 1
ZONE 4: TEXAS CRUSHED STONE - ITEMS1-5&7 -12

SEE ATTACHED MAP FOR ZONE BOUNDARIES.

ITEM DESCRIPTION P B ZONE 2 L.Z;h“:l:r TEXAZSo:REU4SHED
# ME. RUBY | CENTEXMATERIALS [ =D WITT STONE
I eyt Bl Y
) _l;_;;e:;b: Base, TxDot tem 247, ton | FO8 PLQ% 3.00 NO BID 3.60
3| i aard Stone. Ton NO BID 5.25 NO BID 6.10
g |3 x5 Hard Store, Ton NO BID 5.25 NO BID 6.10
5 | 12" Rip Rap, TxDot Item 432.3 Ton NO BID NO BID NOBID 6.10
6 | 18" Rip Rap, TxDot ltem 432.3 Yon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 g;‘;sehggr:z"ﬁfég”e' Ton NO BID 3.00 NO BID 2.25

ROAD BASE MATERIALS BID TAB }"‘9
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ZONE 1 ZONE 2 ZONE 3 ZONE 4
ITEM L.D. WITT TEXAS CRUSHED
DESCRIPTION UNIT .D.
# ME.RUBY | CENTEXMATERIALS | | ~oio s STONE
Crushed Limestone, NO BID 5.00 6.70
8 Washed Screenings Ton NO BID
9 Crushed Limestone, Ton NO BID 3.50 NO BID 2.25
Dry Screenings '
Crushed Limestaone, NO BID 4.50
10 | Fil Materiat Ton NO BID 3.60
1 1/2" Concrete Aggregate, NO BID 6.50
1 TxDot item 421 Ton NOBID 4.95
12 | 3" Crushed Base Ton NO BID 3.25 NO BID 4.75
13 | 24"Rip Rap Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ROAD BASE MATERIALS BID TAB ' L&
PAGE 2 of 2 % '
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://'www.williamson-county.org/Procurement

BID TABULATION

TOWING SERVICE FOR THE SHERIFFS DEPARTMENT ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR SOUTHEAST AREAS 1 AND 2

BID NUMBER: 01WCAO039 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: SEPTEMBER 18, 2001 - 2:15 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002

AWARDED VENDORS: SOUTHEAST - AREA 1
CEN-TEX TOWING
SOUTHEAST - AREA 2

RANDY’'S WRECKER SERVICE

CEN-TEX TOWING RANDY'S WRECKER SERVICE
AREA BEING BID SOUTHEAST — AREA 1 SOUTHEAST — AREA 2
LOCAL ACCESS 863-7633 CELL - 512/917-1699
TELEPHONE NUMBER PAGER - 512 /483-6639
“PER HAUL” PRICE
INCLUDES THE USE OF ANY
NEEDED EQUIPMENT & DISTANCE 75.00 75.00
TRAVELED
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BID NUMBER: 02WCA042

09/25/2001

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002
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710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://www.wiliamson-county.org/Procurement

BID TABULATION
ASPHALT MIXES ANNUAL CONTRACT

WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR'’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: SEPTEMBER 18, 2001 - 2:30 PM

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 1ST: AUSTIN ASPHALT - ITEMS1 &2
2ND: CAPITOL AGGREGATES - ITEMS1&2
VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - ITEMS 3 &4
VULCAN CLEVELAND
e DESCRIPTION UNIT | AUSTINASPHALT | , CABTOL | consTRuCTION ASPHALT
MATERIALS PRODUCTS
Black Base, FOB PLANT FoB FOB PLANT - _FoB
1 | TxDot Item 330, Type A Ton 2350 [ PLANT | 55,09 o AT nosip
To reach 95% Lab density GEORGETOWN SH 29 NO BID NO BID
Asphalt Concrete, NO
2 | TxDot Iltem 330, Type C Ton | GEORGETOWN | 2450 | SH29 | 2500 NO BID gp | NOBID [ NOBID
To reach 95% Lab density
Hot Mix Cold Lay, GRANGER 36.80
3 | TxDot ltem 334, Type D Ton | GEORGETOWN | 35.00 | SH29 | as00 | [LORENCE ) 3880 | nopip | NoBID
To reach 95% Lab density TAYLOR 35:47
Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base, GRANGER 36.80
4 | TxDot item 334, Type A Ton | GEORGETOWN | 3500 | SH2a | 3500 | FLORENCE 1 38801 wopip | noBD
To reach 95% Lab density TAYLOR 35:47
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http://lwww.williamson-county.org/Procurement

BID TABULATION
ASPHALTY CEMENT & CUT BACK ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BiD NUMBER: 02WCA0Q43 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 15, 2001 - 2:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002

RECOMMENDED AWARD: GULF STATES ASPHALT

ITEM DESCRIPTION GULF STATES | PERFORMANCE | CLEVELAND

# UNIT ASPHALT GRADE ASPHALT

ASPHALT PRODUCTS

AC-5 FOB. | FOB | FOB | FOB. | FOB. |[F.0B

1 | TxDot ltem 300.2, Table 1 Gal | PLANT | SITE | PLANT | SITE | PLANT | .SITE

71 81 .68 ] NOBID | NOBID | .8930
AC-10

2 | TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 Gal 71 81 68 { NOBID | NOBID | 8630
RC-250

3 | TxDot item 300.2, Table 4 Gal .98 1.07 | NOBID} NOBID | NOBID | 1.163
MC-30

4 | TxDot Item 300.2, Table 5 Gal 93 1.00 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| 1.063
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BID NUMBER: 02WCA044

BID TABULATION
ASPHALT EMULSIONS ANNUAL CONTRACT
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY AUDITOR’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
710 MAIN STREET - SUITE 303
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

http:/lwww.williamson-county.org/Procurement

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 15, 2001 - 2:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: QCTOBER 1, 2001 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2002

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 1ST - KOCH MATERIALS
2ND - GULF STATES ASPHALT
ITEM F.O.B. F.0.B.
VENDOR # DESCRIPTION UNIT SITE PLANT
HFRS2
1 TxDot ltem 300.2, Table 7 & 8 Gal 6781 64
w KOCH HFRS-2P
MATERIALS TxDot ltem 300.2, Table 9 Cal 8681 83
SS5-1 Emulsion Gal 6781 .64
HFRS2
T | TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8 Gal 73 83
GULF STATES HFRS-2P
ASPHALT 2 | TxDot ltern 300.2, Table 9 Gal 90 -80
3 $5-1 Emulsion Gal 75 .65
HFRS2 OR CRS2,
' | TxDot ltem 300.2, Table 7 & 8 Gel 7030
CLEVELAND HFRS-2P OR CRS-2P
ASPHALT 2 | TxDot ltem 300.2, Table 9 Gal 9780
PRODUCTS 2,
3 $S-1 Emulsion Gal 7030
CRS-2
1| TxDot ltem 300.2, Table 7 & 8 Gal 12
PERFORMANCE
CRS-2P
GRADE 2 Gal 885
ASPHALT TxDot ltem 300.2, Table 9
3 S58-1 Emulsion Gal a5

***  KOCH>>>FREIGHT CHARGE: .0381/GAL, RETURN FREIGHT: .01905/GAL, 40,000 LB MINIMUM FREIGHT CHARGE, PUMP/HOSE

CHARGE: $15.00/LOAD, RESTOCKING FEE: $50.00/LOAD, DROP CHARGES-DIVERSION CHARGES: $30.00/LOAD

CARRIER WILL BILL DEMURRAGE DIRECTLY TOQ THE COUNTY, DEMURRAGE CHARGES: $40.00-50.00 PER HOUR
15T TWO HOURS ARE FREE STARTING AT TIME OF DELIVERY

¥
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