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AGENDA ITEM 30
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Consider authorizing advertising and setting date to receive proposals for the county depository contract.

Moved: Judge Doerfler
Seconded: Commissioner Limmer
Motion: To authorize advertising and to set the date to receive proposals for the county depository contract for
10:00 a.m. on May 15,2001.
Vote: 3 - 0 with Commissioner Heiligenstein and Commissioner Hays absent from the dais.

AGENDA ITEM 31

Consider re-awarding/extending contract with LW2 Custom Rock Products for crushing rock for URS.

Moved: Commissioner Boatright
Seconded: Judge Doerfler
Motion: To extend the contract with LW2 Custom Rock Products for crushing rocks for URS.
Vote: 3 - 0 with Commissioner Heiligenstein and Commissioner Hays absent from the dais.

AGENDA ITEM 32

Consider awarding, rejecting or extending bid for roofing at new Juvenile Facility.

Moved: Commissioner Limmer
Seconded: Commissioner Boatright
Motion: To award bid for roofing at the new Juvenile Facility to Guest Roofing, Inc.
Vote: 4 - 0 with Commissioner Heiligenstein absent from the dais.

< Attachment>
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FlWOODS
Construction

I-Wi-Il-ia-m-so-n-eo-u-n-ty-eo-m-m-iSS-io-n-e-"-s-c-o-u-rt--"General
Contractors

Construction
Managers

DesignIBuilders

po box 122
georgetown, Ix 78627

Phone 5121930-2607
Fax 512/930-3469

www.ltwoods.com

April 17,2001 FTW Job No. 2007DATE:

PROJECT: New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County

FROM: FTWOODS Construction (Construction Manager)

Requested Motlon<!lli

1.) Award Contracts to the following apparent lowest and best
bidders for the indicated Bid Packages.

Bid Packaae Connctor Connct Amount

7.6- Combined Roofing Peckage Guest Roofing, Inc. $485,323

4.5 - Athletic Equipment AALCO Manufacturing Co. $33,085

http://www.ltwoods.com
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BID FORM for
Bid Package 7.6 - Combined RoofJ..ID!Packge for th~
Modified Bitumen Roofiq2, Metal Roofing and Sidin&

M...... 13,2001

Date: tJ/KJI ........OI--"
PROPOSAL OF: _A .b. w; Ij,':5 funpQ1} ¥ i T-IK-

(Name)

_tfL{;(P ~ Iter UJne. At!sl-I'n 1><. 18'ltftf
(Address) I (

Te\ephoneNo.:61l- 38S -..:f"9't3 Fax No.: 512-38.5"-3133

New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County
WWiam50n County Bid NUDlber: OlWC311

Georgetown, Texas

TO: Williamson County

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the Bidding Documents which also inchide the General Conditions.
Instruelions to Bidders, Prevailing Wage Rates, Worlcers Compensation and General Liability Insurance
Rtqllirements, Performance and Pa)'l1lellt Bond Requilements, Geotechnical Investigation Data. Sullllllaty
of Work, Allowan=, A1tmla1cs, Products and Substitutions, anti all Addenda as well as the premises and
all conditions affeelinglhe Work, lite wulersigned will furnish all labor, matcrill1a, equipment, supervision
and applicable taxes required to complete the enlife Work described in the Scope of Work. The Bidder
also agrees that the Work proposed is In complete compliance and in accordance wilb the Blddin&
Doc:uments ellcept and if identified othetwise bclein:

ACKNQWIJmGEMENT OF ADDENDA: Nos. I. Z,
Dated: Z(S/(;( 11i!Ili?f-_

(lanaaI}' 31, 20(1)

512 385 3733 MAR.21'2001 13:11 RECEIVED FROM: 5129303469 #0463-003
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Bid l'ackage 7.6 - Combined Roofmg Package for the Modified Bitumen
Roormg, Metal Roofing and Siding
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County, Bid Number OlWC3ll

PERFORMANCE AND fA YMENT BONDS: Chapter2253.021of the Tex$S Oovemmt:nl Code
governs !he requiremenl$ for perfonnance and paymenl bonds for government entities makinll public work
contracts .. Doneb must be from a surety Iisled In the most current Department of'I'reasury Federal
Register. A performam:e bond is required it the contract is III """""' of $50,000 ud Is to be mHe tor
the full amount of the contract. A payment bond is required it the contract Is In~ of $25,000
and is to be made for the full amount of the contract. The bonds are 10 be ex~ted prior to !>egjnojog
~ on the projecl on the forms included ill these bid doc:urnents and muS! be executed by a corporare
surety or sureties in accoxclance with the Texas Insurance Code. If the contract is less than $50,000 the
performance bond will nol be required as long all the contrael provides thaI paymenlls nOI due until the
work i.completed and accepled by lhe County.

(If the bid O/7IQuntis less than $50.000. tlul{ollowillg bond in{ormtltion is optpmal.)
If required, can you furnish paymenl and .c;.e s1 YES,--:+-=v.",/-1"r.;-
If so, provide name Surety Company: Pr . 51<
Provide name of local Jondln(: Agency a(( ~ () ,Sit (a()a..
Bonding Agency's phone number ~",3~V:J..,;i3~O~_-..a.i!!.3~O~=-=-_-r:~='K""-':;;;:;-__
Bond PremiUlD amout (nol included in !he base bid amount): ADD ' 00

BID ALTERNATES: There are no bid alternales thalatreel this scope of work.

VO',UNTARY ALTERNATElS) - Acceptance or refusal of Voluntary AlternalC(s) rests solely wilh
Williamson County Commissioner', Court and FrWOODS Conslnlction, the COlISlrUe!ion Manaser.
Attach additional pages on your letterhead to thoroughly explain each Alternate. Yon must note
specification section(s) and paragraph number(s) thaI your Alternate revises. If you have more lhan one
Voluntary Allematc. make a notation (such as "see attached") In the area below.Dcscription: _

ADDIDEDUcr $ _

REFERENCES: Prov.'
OlI1Q em (namclcompany/pbone nUJllber) from a similar project

lie 51b 3'26 - J
OS-I

5

II is undentood lhililhe CommissioDel1 Court of Williamson County, Tellas n:scrves the righlto accept or rejecl any
and/or all Bids for any or all materials UIdIor services covered in lh;' Bid request, end to waive informalities or
defecl$ln!he Bid or to accept such Bid It shall deem to be in the best interest of Williamson County. It is further
understood that all proposals shall be valid for a period of ninety (90) clays from the date bids are due and may not be
withdrawn during that period.

(end of Bid Form)

Bid Form. Pqe 2 of 2 (JanUSIy 31, 20(1)

51Z 3 85 373.:3 :.:.::.:.:.::;..;:.;:.:~:.::.;:..:.:~::::::.:.:.:.:...;,.;;;;;r;....-.:.:.:;.:.:.:..:.:..:.;-----..::..:..:...:..:-'-.:..c...----MAR.Z1'ZOOl 13:11 RECEIVED FROM: 5129303469 #0463-004
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BID FOR.,,"lfor
Bid Packaee 7.6 - Cgmbined Roofing Pack"Bllefor the
Modified Bitumen Roann". Metal Roofing and Siding

Matdl 13.1001

..'; .

New Juvenile FaclUty for Williamson County
WUliaDlSOftCOU1ltyBld Number: OlWC311

Georgetown, Texas

PROPOSAL OF: D./J..
/If/3

TO: Williamson County

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined 1M Biddinl Documents which also include 1M General COIldidons.
Instructions 10 Bidden. Prevailing Wage Rates, Workers Compensation and General Liability Insurance
Requlremems, Performance and Payment Bond Requirements. Geotechnicallnvestieation Data. Summary
of Wvrk, Allowances, Alternates. Products and Substitutions. and all Addenda lIS well8.l the premises and
all conditions affecting the Work, the Wlderslgned will furnish all labor, materials. equipmen~ supervision
and applicable taxes required to complete the entire Work described in the Scope of Work. The Bidder
also agrees that tlle Work proposed is in complete complian.:e and in accordance with the Bidding
Documenm excepr and if idtJllified otherwise herein:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA: Sos. ~t./l1lO"'d-.
D~Wl:-S-l~7., ""~ :JI'Y/ 0/

!!1l
BASEBID AMOUNT Lump Sum Base Bid $ (;;, fCf, 70'1.
~BldwrilteDamoWlt ~,~·H.,>J01.Id~ ~it..r't.p,' ..{ ~At'4, S"~A-J

""All) M" 1t[/1 orr 1JOv':'ft,S

Bid Form· Page 1of 1 (January 31. 2001)
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Hid l'ackage 7.6 - t:omblnea J(OOIlng .. acnge lor tDe lvloouleo numnen
Roofing, Metal Roofing and Siding
New Juvenile Fil¢ility for WiUiamson County. Bid Number OlWC311

PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BONDSj Chapter 2253.021 of !he T~xas Oovenunent Code
ioverm the teqummenls fOI perfOlllllllce and paymenl bonds for govemlllent entities maldng public work
concncls. Bonds mll5t be from a surety IisUd in the IIKIit current Department of Trea.ury Federal
Register. A perfor1ll8llCe bond is required If the conllact is In exc:essof SSO,OOOalld Is to be made for
tbe fun amount or the contract. A payment bond Is required If tbe contrad is InellteSS of $15,000
and is 10 lie made for the ruu amount of the contract. The bonds are 10 be executed prior lQ beg/ODin:
1I>'0rk00 the project on the fonn! included in the~e bid documents and mUSIbe execuled by • corporalt:
,urely Or sureties in accordance with the Texas Insurance Code. If the contract is less than $50,000 the
pcrfonnance bond will nOl be requited as long as the COJllractproVides thou paymOhlis not due undllhe
work is completed and acc<pted by the Counly.

(If rhe bM otruJun/ is us. rhan $$0.000, rh. following bond in[ormado. is opti!JP(11.)

:~:::;;~d:a;;= :~: r::~;~d perfOnna~~;bo~ndS?~' ~£.. NO
Provide Dame of local Bonding A~~C)' ~:.4 -==-ci#;;;;fl<.&m:t:J;:c.r
Bondlnll Allency's phone number(;5IZ _ L-:-:--:-"-"'-""--~-:'-"l"""=:-:---:;=::::-::-~...,,,,,,r--__
Bond Premium amount (nOI included In lIIe base bid lUnounl): ADD·,,-$--,n'-'~"'''''''''''!-:IIi_'--- _

BID ALTERNATES: Then: arc no bid alternates thaI affeCI this scope of work.

VOLUN'!ARYALTERNA!E(SJ - Aceepl8Jlce or refusal of VolunlMy Allemate(s) re.u solely with
Williamson County Commlssloner's Court and Fl'WOOOS Construction, the Construction Manlier.
Attach additional pages on your leuerhead 10 thorouply e~plain each Alremare. You must note
specification seclion(s) and parall~h number(s) thai your AI1ernate revises. If you have more than One
Voluntary Alternale, make a notation (auch as ",e.= anached") in the area below.Description: _

ADDIDEDUCT S _

R!j:FERENCES: Provide all .... t3 references (namclcompany/phon. number) from a similar project.

II is understood that the Conunissioners Court of WiDiamson County. Texas reserves the n,ht to accepr or rejcci any
andlor all Bi.1s for any or all materials andlor s~ices covered in this Bid reques~ and to waive Infonnalitics or
defect! in the Bid or to accept such Bid It shall deem to be in the bes' Intelest of Williamson County. It is further
underslood th.1 all proposals shall be valid for a period of ninery (90) days from the date bids are due and may not be
withdraw uring thaI period.

\
:?<~Ub : e.

Res

BY'_+-"'~:T-.lJ:looC:~------

(end of Bid Fonn)

Bid Fonn· Page 2 of2 (January 31. 2(01)
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D.R. KIDD COMPANY, INC.
Residential & Commercial Roofing Professionals

Telephone: (512) 671-7791 Fax: (512) 671-8707 E-mail: drkidd@flash.net
P.O. BOX 99-Round Rock, Texas 78680

Date: April 10,2001
To: Mike Mason, FTWOODS Construction

From: Carl Morse and Jeff Clark

Re: Roofing quote for Williamson County Juvenile Justice Center

Install a new modified bituminous roofing system as manufactured by Johns Manville as
follows:

• Mechanically attach tapered polyisocyanurate and perlite fill for crickets where
designated on the roof for the proper drainage around buildings and RTU' s.

• Mechanically attach Johns Manville Vensulation felt to light fill concrete deck. Concrete
deck by others.

• Mop Johns Manville Dyna-Base base sheet over Vensulation felt.
• Mop Johns Manville Dyna-Glas FR cap sheet over Dyna-Base ply sheet.
• Mop in perlite cant at perimeter walls and at expansion joint.
• Mop Johns Manville Dyna-Clad Aluminum reinforcing membrane for base wall flashing.
• Fabricate and install pitch pans for RTU's and flash around.
• Install expansion joint cover and flash around.
• Using adhesive, install walkway pads on roof where indicated.
• Using adhesive, install roof pads for pipe supports.
• Install metal flashing around roof edge, cleats, roof hatch and soil pipes.
• Fabricate and install leads for soil pipes.
• Install counter flashing around roof perimeter.
• Fabricate and install gutters and downspouts.
• Install cast iron boots at base of downspouts.
• Install splash blocks for downspouts.
• Upon completion, provide 10 year, N.D.L. warranty by manufacturer.

Install a new standing seam metal roof system and wall panels as manufactured by MBCI as
follows:

• Mechanically attach 3" polyisocyanurate insulation to metal deck. Metal deck by others.
• Install 30# felt and ice and water shield membrane over polyiso.
• Seam and install 24 gauge 16" Batten-10k roof panels over roofing membranes.
• Install Batten-10k accessories to roof panels; backing plates, rake supports, bearing plates,

eave plates, rib covers, outside closures, eave trim, rake trim, peak box, and ridge end
caps.

• Fabricate and install flashing and counter flashing.
• Install exhaust fan curbs.
• Fabricate and install hat channels, soffits and fascia.

mailto:drkidd@flash.net
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Page20f2

• Install sub-girt for metal wall panels.
• Install Artisan I (L-12) 12" panels on outside of structures and inside the gymnasium.
• Fabricate and install gutters and downspouts.
• Install gutter outlet tubes and splash blocks.
• Upon completion, provide 20 year standard II finish warranty by manufacturer and 2 year

installer workmanship warranty. • .

Exclusions: Concrete deck, wood blocking, wood nailers, wood cants, rough carpentry, wood
nailers under copings, mechanical and exhaust vents, vent curbs, thy curbs, pipe supports, roof
hatch, roofladder, louvers, thru-wall flashing, plumbing vents, lightning rod flashings (none
shown), waterproofing, damp-proofing, fireproofing, support beams, and payment and
performance bonds.

Base bid price 5689,708.00
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BID FORM for
Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofing Package for the
Modified Bitumen Roofing, Metal Roofing and Siding

March 13,2001

Date:~/IO, k2:?/
f!tvtjJ ,,z -t. 12ev~;j.;(., t>rc A.v.;.7f IV.

i
(Name)

/t,~I} (I';/--'T/?Jf.LJiPI1fI1rff.e-1:
(Address)

New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County
Williamson County Bid Number: OlWC311

Georgetown, Texas

PROPOSAL OF: __ --jL.-=----' __ --'-.,:::--...::l'--_--'-..:.:..:..:..-.......:..:::..~ _

TO: Williamson County

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the Bidding Documents which also include the General Conditions,
Instructions to Bidders, Prevailing Wage Rates, Workers Compensation and General Liability Insurance
Requiremenls. Performance and Payment Bond Requirements, Geotechnicallnvesligation Dala, Summary
of Work, Allowances, Altemates, Products and Substitutions, and all Addenda as well as the premises and
all conditions affecting the Work, the undersigned will furnish alliahor, materials, equipment, supervision
and applicable taxes required to complete the enlire Work described in the Scope of Work. The Bidder
also agrees that the Work proposed is in complete compliance and in accordance with the Bidding
Documents except and if identified otherwise herein:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA: Nos, I
Dated: e»<

BASE BID AMOUNT Lump Sum Base Bid $ 65:z" /L/~
I

BR" Rid written amount 5j~h lJ~ F.'""1';''' ~/uJo "h~V~iUp, pit:-
. !kiJpflAttj f'i::>1.T&'btt41-= .4u~ """k,- j;D(fAfo?

Bid Form - Page I of 1 (January 31, 2(01)
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Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofing Package for the Modified BitZmen---:..-e-
Roofing, Metal Roofing and Siding
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County, Bid Number OlWC311

PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BONDS: Chapter 2253.021 of the Texas Government Code
govems the requirements for performance and payment bonds for government entities making public work
contracts. Bonds must be from a surety listed in the most current Department of Treasury Federal
Register. A performance bond Is required if the contract Is in excess of $50,000 and Is to be made for
the full amount of the contract. A payment bond Is required If the contract Is In excess of $25,000
and is to be made for the full amount of the contract. The bonds are to be executed prior to beginning
work on the project on the forms included in these bid documents and must be exe~u\ed by a corporate
surety or sureties in accordance with the Texas Insurance Code. If the contract is less than $50,000 the
performance bond will not be required as long as the contract provides that payment is not due until the
work is completed and accepted by the County.

(I/the bid amount is less than $50,000, the/allowing bond information is optjpnal.)
If required, can you furnish payment and perf9l'J11l1ncebonds? YES V .If'A NO;.- _
If so, provide name Surety Company: V!'!.!!!f/Z.11k- 5'<.otLe'7"l( ae: ,......,"f!1t'ek
Provide name of local Bonding Agency KlM""" IJI!.4/) - 7eA-S 1it f'rJM#J'" t:-
Bonding Agency's phone number 9"1"'1'.Tlt.:z. 7it·}
Bond Premium amount (not included i-n-th....e""b'-as.Le~b-id.<.a""m""o"'u'-'n:::t)-:-'--"A:..<..D-D...,$---:/,..,z....-- •...,q=()e:J= ...~"'~-----

I

BID AL TERNA TES: There are no bid alternates that affect this scope of work.

VOLUNTARY ALTERNATE(S) - Acceptance or refusal of Voluntary Alternate(s) rests solely with
Williamson County Commissioner's Court and fTWOODS Construction, the Construction Manager.
Attach additional pages on your lenerhead to thoroughly explain each Ailemate. You must note
specification section(s) and paragraph number(s) that your Alternate revises. If you have more than one
Voluntary Altema.t~ make a notation (such as "see attached") in the area below.
Description: ",'Nt.-

ADDIDEDUCT $ __ ..:...- _

It is understood that the Commissioners Court of Williamson County, Texas reserves the right to accept or reject any
and/or all Bids for any or all materials and/or services covered in this Bid request, and to waive informalities or
defects in the Bid or to accept such Bid it shall deem to be in the best interest of Williamson County. It is further
understood that all proposals shall be valid for a period of ninety (90) days from the date bids are due and may not be
withdrawn during that period.

(end of Bid Form)

Bid Form· Page 2 of 2 (January 31, 2(01)
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BID FORM for
Bid Package 7.6 - COJ@ined Boorm~e fortJlg
Modified Bitumen Roofigg, Metal Roofing and Sidin~

MIRhU,1OO1

New Juvenile Facility for WUliamsoD County
WUliamsoDCounly Bid Number; 01WC311

Georgetown, Texas
D~te: 04-10-ul

PROPOSAL OF: GUEST ROOFING INC.
(Name)

201 DOUGLAS AVENUE WACO TX 76712
(Addless)

Telephone No.: 254-772-1552 Fax No.: 772-4B4~

TO: Williamson County

Genllemen:

Having carefully examined Ibe Bidding Documents which also include the General Conditions,
InslrUctions to Bidders, Prevailing Wage Rales, Worlcers Compensation and General Liability Insurance
Requirements, PerfolllllllCe and Payment Bond RequiremenlS, Geotee:hnlcallnvestigation Dala, SUlllDWY
of W crk, Allowances, Alternates, ProduclS and Substitutions, and all Addenda IS well as the premises and
all conditions affecting the Work, the Undersigned will furnisb all labor. materials, equipment, supervision
and applicable taxes required to complete the entire Work described in the Scope of Work. The Bidder
also agrees thar the WotIc proposed is in complele compliance and in accotdance with lb. Bidding
Documents ellcepl and If identified otherwise herein:

ACKNOWl.EJ2QEMENT OF ADDENDA: Nos. 1 2
Datecl:2-9-01 2-15-01---

BASE BID AMOUNT Lump Sum Base Bid $ $476,155.00

BaseSidwriltenamount FOUR HUNDRED SEVENTY SIX THOUSAND, ONE HUNDRED
FIFTY FIVE DOLLARS

Bid Form· Page 1of I (January 31, 20(1)
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Bid Package 7.6 - Combinccl Roofmg Package for the MocImed Bitumen
Roofing, Metal Roofing and Siding
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County, Bid Number OlWC311

PERFORMANCE AND fA YMENI BONDS; Chapter 2253.021 of lbe Texas Governmeot Code
governs !he requlremenl$ fOr performance and payment bonds for ,ovemment entities maldn, public work
contracts. Bonds must be frOID8 surety listed In the most current DeparlJDent 01 TIUSIll'3' Federal
RegIster. A perfonoauce bond Is required if the contract Is III exc:eu of $50,000 aDd Is co be made for
the full amouat of lbe coatraet. A payment boDd Is required If !be coatract Is III excess of $2$,000
and is to be made for lbe fuU amount of lbe eoatrad. The bonds are 10 be executed prior to beJjnning
~ on !he projcel on lhe fo,,", included 10 !hesc bid documents and must be executed by a OOrporlte
surelY or swelles in acCOIdance wilb lbe TexIS Insurance Code. If !he contract is leSs than $50,000 lbe
performance bond will nol be required as lon, as the contraet provides that paymenl is not due until the
work is completed and acceplCd by liIe Counly.

(I/the bid (UllQ1Olf is I.ss tMIl $50.000. t/u,following bond iJifortlllllion is optiollaL)
If tcquired, can you lIlrnish paymenl and performance bonds? YES X N0c....,..,,,,,,=;;
If so, pl'Ovide name Sllftty ColDpany: ATLANTIC ALLIANCE FIDELITY & SURETY
Ptovide name of local BoacliallAgcacy .!OHM WARp INSURANCE AGENCY
Bonding Agency's phone number ~2 .......5.::l4=-~8'1061.o51.:-:.l8J.:4:!..!..1£.1_,---:---;::-,....".."....=.--- _
Bond Premium amount (nollncluded in the base bid amounl): AOD...$......;9::..1~6=8~.~0~0~ _

BID ALIERNA1ES: There arc no bid ahemalcs that affect this scope of work.

vOr,UNIARY ALTERNATE<S> - Aceeptance or refusal of Voluntary AllcmalC(S) tcsts solely with
Williamson County COmnUJSioner's Coun and FTWOODS Conslnlcdon, the ConstrUction Manaser.
Allach additional pages on your leuemead to thoroughly explain each Altemale. You musl nole
specification sccIion(s) and paragraph number(s) that your Alrmwe revi .... If yOII have mOre than one
Voluntary Altemllc, lOW a notation (such as "sco allachcd") in the area below.
D<:scription: SOPREMA #2542 ALL HOT ASPHALT APPLIED - DEDUCT $20,376.00

GbLVALUME METAL ROOFI SIDINGI & SOFFIT DEDUCT - $7592.00
ADDIDEDUCT $ _

REFERENCES: Provide 01 leasl 3 references (name/company/phone numbed from a similar project
GEORGETOWN ISD-GEORGETOWN 9th. GRADE CENTER 512-943-5000

.. ,. .. PERFORMING ARTS CENTER " II ..

.... .. NEW THIRD MIDDLE SCHOOL 512-930-2601

II is understood thll the Commissioners Court of Williamson County, TexIS reserves the rigbtlO accept or rejccl any
and/or all Bids for any or all materials and/or services covered in thi. Bid request, and 10 waive informalities or
defects in the Bid or 10 accept such Bid it shall deem 10 be in lhe besl interest of Williamson County. It Is furthcr
underslood thll all proposals shall be valid for a period of ninely (90) days from the date bids are due and may not be
withdrawn during that period.

Prillted Name)
Tide PRESIDENT

(end of Bid Form)

Bid Fonn • Page 2 of 2 (January 31, 2(01)
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BID FORM for
IUd Package 7.6 - Combined Roofing Packaie for the
Modified Bitumen Ropjing, Metal Roofing and Siding

March 13, 2001

New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County
Williamson County Bid Number: OlWC311

Georgetown, Texas

D3le: April 10! 2001

PROPOSAL OF: ""K......&-"M__~I_t>X; AND S~ :.;ME.'T=".'ALc=:.. _
(Name)

--~3103.NOR"H IE-3S Rouod Rq:Js, Texas 78664
(Address)

512-218-9499 512'-218-3903Telephone No.: Fax No.: _

TO: Williamson County

Gendemen:

HOVingcarefully e,anuned the Bidding Documents which also include the Oeneral Conditions,
Instructions 10 BIdders, Prevailing Wage Rates. Workers Compensation and General Liability Insuronce
Requirements, Performance and "ayment Bond Requirements. Geotechnical Investigation Data. Summary
of Work, Allowances, AlternaleS. Products and SubMltutlons, and aU Addenda as well as the premlses :md
all condilion& affecting the Work. the undersigned will fumish allinbor, materials, equipment, superv,sJon
and applicable taxes required to complete the eMire Work described in ,he Scope of Work. The Bidde'
al,o agrees that the Work proposed is in complete compliance and in accordance ""ilh the BIdding
O<l<;umen14e'cept and if identili.d otherwise herein:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA: 1Nos, _

Dalod: 2-5-01 '-"'2-"'1t"5;---0T-!--

2

BASE BID AMOUNT Lump Sum BaseBid S 762,558.00

___seven Hundred And Sixtv-TI-K> 'IhQ~and,
'Five Hundred 1\pd Fifty-Eight D::l::=.1C'i1i"ars=,.--;An=a'"""No<=-cEnts.

Base Did wriuen amount

Bid form - Pa~e 1 of 1 (January 31, 2001)
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Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofing Package for the Modified Bitumen
Roofing, Metal Roofing and Siding
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County, Bid Number OIWC311

PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BONDS: Chaprer 2253.021 ofrhe Texas Government Code
governs the requirements for performance and payment bonds for eovernment .nlilies maldne public work
contracts. Bonds musl lit from a surety lisled in th. mosl current Department 01 Troasvry Federal
Reeister. A performance bond is required It the conlractls In excess "USO,OOO and is to be mad. for
tb. full amounl of tbe conlract. A paymenl bond is required if the contracl is in •• cas of $25.000
and Is to be mad. for th. tull amount of the contracl. The bonds are to be executed nrior to beginning
wgtk on tile projecI on tile forms Included in tIlese bid documents and muS!be e.ecu'ed by a corporate
surety orsureties in accordance with lbe Texas Insurance Code. If lhe contraCI is less.than $50,000 the
performance bond will nol be required as lone as the contracr provides 'thal paymenr is·nor due unlil thc
work IS compleled and acceplcd by the County.

(I/rh. bid amount Is I.ss rhan $50.000. rh~/ollowlnl/ bond In/armarion is oprional.)
If required, can you furnish payment and performance bonds? YES XX
If so, provide nllJ1leSurely Company: __ ca\&lOO!J.",·to!;"':l~In~deIm>/;S!~J.~· ty=__ ~,- _
Provide name of local Bonding Agency C. A. Schutze C!::JIJparjy
Bonding Agency's phone number .--:~5J.J ~2-~4~477J.-:::;5J.5",O,,:7L.--:-:=:--:-::-::-:-::-:c:- _
Bond Premium amounl (not included in rhe base bid amount): ADDS J 9 . 063 00

NO _

BID ALTERNATES' There are no bid u1temates rhataffect this scope of work.

VOJ,UNTARY AL TERNATElSI - Acceptance orrefusal of Voluntary Altemare(s) reslS solely wlrh
Williamson County Commissioner's Coun and FTWOODS Construction, the Construction Manaser.
Auach additional pages on your I.Uerhead to tholOuehly explain each Allemate. You must nole
specification section(s) and paragraph number(s) lbat your Altemale 'evises. Jf you have mor.lltan one
Voluntary Alternate. make a notalion (such u "se. altached") in lbe area below.Description: _

ADDIDEDUCT$ __

REFERENCES: Provide at leas' 3 refe .. nces (name/company/phone number) from a similar project

AMERICAN-roNS'1'ROCIORS,Lb& 5elleLs/i1ce em1Lon 512 328 2826

It is understood that the Commissioners Court of Williamson County. Texas reserves Ihe right to ac<;eplor rejeclany
andlor all Bids for Ilny or all mallOria]sandlor services covered in Ihis Bid request, and 10 waive informalities or
delecrs in the Bid or to accept such Bid it shall deem to be in the besl inlerestofWiIliamson County. It is furthcr
undemood that all proposals shall be valid for a period or ninely (90) days from the date bids are due and may not be
withdrawn during lhat period.

Respecrfully submitted."~-(S'lJIlltun:) ,:r~s G, ~s
(Prinuod Name)

Tic~ President
(end of Bid Form)

Bid Form • Paie 2 of 2 (January 31, 2001)
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Scope of Work for
Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofing Package for the

Modified Bitumen Roofing and Metal Roofing and Siding
Prepared by FTWOODS Construction Co., Construction Manager

(March 13,2001)

Conte.ctof .mall furnish and pay a111.bor, services, equipment and materials and perfono at the wo,k necessary 0'
incidentally required unless specifically noted elsewhere for the completion of that p.rt of !lie work covered by the
COnlIJCrdocuments and as foUows:

PrOVideall labor, maleri.ls, equipment and supervision 10 perform and c'omplete including. but not Hntited to. ALL
tS.oltom No, 1,2 and 3 Below) work per the Conlroct document< and Spe<:ific.tion Section (s): (Soe Item No.4
and 5 BeloW)

I, Modified Bituminous Roofing, Sheet Melal, Gunets and DownspOUIS,Roof Hatch Ma'erials and Labor, Roof
Specilllties and Accessones

2. Prefonned Roof and Wall Panels. Preformed Soffit Panels, Shee, Melal, Gutters and Downspouts work
3. HOisting, unloading and nccess (or workers to p"rfonn the work
4. Specification sections: 07410 (Prefonned Roof and Wall Panels). 07420 (Preformed Soffit Pdnels). 07620

(Sheet Met.l, as applies), and 07630 (Guners and DownspoutS)
a. Gune" and downspouts for metal roofed at.as
b. Splash bloeks for downspouts
c. RigId insulalion for metal roof
d. Melal soffit panels
c, Interior melal siding al upper Gym
,. Exterior metal siding

_ g. P.refi~ished window and fascia trim, closure angles, caulking. and /lashing for motal siding, metal
roofing and SOffils.

5. Specification section(s): 07525 (Modified Biluminous Roofing), 01620 (Sheet Melal (as .pplies», 07630
(vullers and Downspout.), and 07700 (Roof Specialties and Accessories) including but nOllimited to:

A.) Fascia trim. guuers and downspouls for modified bitumen roofed areas
E.} Splash bl~ks for dVVoinspolJ\5

C) Roof halch (mate,ials .nd labor)
D.) FJashing/~aJing of all roof peneualions made by otller trades
c.) Pads for pipe supports across roof

This scope of work exclud~ the following:
1. Sales tax
2. Downspout boots (to be furnished and inslalled by others). The 3" PVC connector pipe belween downspout

boots and srorm h~!I.der hne pipe will be 1l1St.slledand connec:ed to the stonn heild.:r by rhe plumber.
3. Light weight insularing concrete
4. Wood blOCking(Roof BJoctJng will be installed by others but must b. eoordinated with this work)
; Roof curbs (from secllon 07700 and 0772 I) for mechanic.1 equipmenl (the," will be furnished and inslalled by

Mechttnical Contractor)
6 Pipe supports on roof (proYided and installed by Plumbing Contractor per Scc,ion 15410.3.0I.G)
'I. Structural Sleel framing cr metal purlins at c.nopy (to be by Steel Supplier. in'talled by Sleet Erector
8. Drywall framing for sotfits

(end at Scope of Work)
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BID FORM for
Bid fadmge 7.6 - Combined Root1Dg,l,acka.,gefor the
Modified Bitumen Roofing, Metal Roormg and Sidin2

l\WdJ 13. 2001

New Juveoile Facllity for Williamsod County
WWIa_ CoUDI)' Bid Number. 01WC311

Georgetown, Texas
Date: April 10, 2001
PROPOSAL OF: _-.;;:.~~.;;.,,;;==-......:...:...:,,:.-_~ _L.D. Tebben Co., Inc.

(Name)

4315 Terry-O Lane, Austin, TX 78745
(AddIes.)

TelepbonoNo.: 512-416-1476 FaxNo.; 512-416-0583
TO: Williamson County

Oendemen:

Having carefully examined the Blcldin# Documents wbicb allo Include the General Conditions.
Ins1J1lCllons to Bidders. PTevailinl Wase Rates, Workers Coll\fleDS&lion and 0eneraI Ulbility Insuranc.
ReqQiuments. P.lfor1llllllCe and Paymenl Bond Requiremenls. Geotechnical Investigation Data. Summai)'
of Work, Allowances, AI_s. Products and SubstiluIiOllS, aIId all ~da .. well a.s the premises and
all condiliollS affecting the Work, \he undersi8Jlecl will furnish all labor, materials, equipment. supervi>ion
and applicable laxe, rtqWRd 1'0 complete the entire Work described in the Stope of Work. The Bidder
also ogrus Ihat tile Worlc proposed Is in complete compliance and in accordance with the Bidding
Documents except and if idenlillecJ otherwise helein:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 01 ADDENDA: ~ 1 . 2
Dead: 2-9-01 2-15-01--'-'--

BASE BID AMOUNT LnmpSumBaseBid $ 786,539.00
~Wd~~~ Seven Hundred Eighty-Six Thousand, Five

Hundred Thirty-Nine and no/l00

Bid Form • Pale I of 1 COpy
(lanl&llly 31, 2001)
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Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofing Package for the Modified Bitumen
Roofing, Metal Roormg aDd SidiDg
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County. Bid Number 01WC31 1

PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BONDS: Chapter 2253.021 of the T~asGovernment Code
governs the requUemenli for performana: and payment bond$ for government entilies making public work
contracts. Bonds mllSt be (tom. surety listed in tbe moat current Dtpartmeat cI. Treaslll')' Federal
Keebler. A performance boad is required if Ib' coalract is in UCISI of $50.000 lIIId is 10 be made for
the full Ulount of lbe "ODlracL A payment boad is required If !be a)ntract is in _ of $25,000
and Is 10 be l1IlIdefor lbe full amount of the coatract. The bonds life 10be executed !!rior to beginning
~ on the project on the fonns included in theso bicl clOCWllOn15anclll1Wlt be _reel by a corporate
sorety or sureties in accordanoe wllh the Texas InsurlJlCe Code. If the conCtllct Is less than $50,000 the
performance bond will not be required as long ... the contract provides !hat payment is not due until !he
work is completed and accepred by !he Counly.

(If 1m, bid Qm()WIl is leJSlhfln $50,000, rhejoUowing baNi illjonNJIion is opliolllJi.)
If required, can you fumish payntent and performance bonds? YES X NO:-- _
Ifso,plovidenameSuretyCompaoy: Universal surety of America
ProvidenameoflocalBGndlllgAgency ANCO Insurance Agency
Bondin: Agency's phone number .::5..;.1.:2=:-=3:.:370::.:-,.-::.9.::8.::3~6:.---:-=~_.."....--rtnr-rrn-_BoDdPnmium llJDOWlt (not included in Ibe base bid lItnount): ADDS l' , I 98 • 00
BID ALTERNATES: The .... are no bid altetnsres that affectlhls scope of work.

VOLUNTARY ALTERNATElS) - Aca:prance or refusal of Voluntary Alternate(s) rests solely with
Williamson County Commissioner .. Court and FTWOODS CoostnlClioD, !he ConsbUcllon Manager.
Attach additional pages 0<1 yOlll' lellerhead fo thoroughly explaill each AJtetnare. You must nore
specification section(s) and paragnoph numbe«s) !bat yOUl Alremate revises. If you have more than Ono
Voluorary Altemate. make a DOtlItion (such as "see attached") in rhe area below.Description: _

ADDIDEDUCT $ _

lI.EFERENCJ!S: Provide at least 3 refcn:nces (nillDcicompany/phone number) from 1similar project.

Vernon Dunag~n, Amtecn Roofing, 5,2-258-)661
Jeff BeIEonor J~m Wh~Eaker, G~I5ane, 512-302-9211
walter Hiett, TxDOT, 210-690-4585

Ie is understood !bat the Commissioners Court of Williamson County, Texas reserves the righl to accept or reject any
and/or all Bids for any or all matetla1s andlor services covered In d1ls Bid request, ancllO waive Informalities or
defects in the Bid or to aca:pt such Bid It shall deem 10be in !he best interest of Williamson County. It is further
undcntood that all proposals shall be valid for a period of ninety (90) days from !he date bids are due and may nCI be
withdrawn during that period.

RespeCll'u1ly submiaed,
L.D. TEbben Co., Inc.

By &r(~
Kyle ~~~e

. !Printed Name)TItleServ~ce Manager
(end of Bid Fonn)

Bid Form - Paze 2 of 2 (January 31, 2001)
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BID FORM for .
Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofing Package for the
Modified Bitumen Roofing, Metal Roofing and Siding

Marclll3,10411

New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County
Williamson County Bid Number: 01WC311

Georgetown, Texas
Date: APRIL 10, 2001

PROPOSAL OF: PORT ENTERPRISES, LTD.
(Name)

P.O. BOX 1299 MANCHACA, TX 78652
(Address)

Telephooe No.: (512) 280-1030 Fax No.: (512) 280-1032

TO: Williamson County

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the Bidding Documents which also include the General Conditions,
Instructions to Bidders, Prevailing Wage Rates, Workers Compensation and General Liability Insurance
Requirements, Performance and Payment Bond Requirements, Geotechnical Investigation Data, Summary
of Work, Allowances, Alternates, Products and Substitutions, and all Addenda as well as the premises and
all conditions affecting the Work, the undersigned will furnish all labor, materials, equipment, supervision
and applicable taxes required to complete the entire Work described in the Scope of Work. The Bidder
also agrees that the Work proposed is in complete compliance and in accordance with the Bidding
Documents except and if identified otherwise herein:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA: Nos. 1 --=-2---,
Dated: 2{5{01 2(14(01 __

BASE BID AMOUNT Lump Sum Base Bid $ 589,618,00

Base Bid written amount FIVE HUNDRED EIGHTY-NINE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED
EIGHTEEN DOLLARS AND 00(100******************************************

Bid Form· Page I of I (January 31,2001)
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Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofing Package for the Modified Bitumen
Roofing, Metal Roofing and Siding
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County, Bid Number OlWC311

PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BONDS: Chapter 2253.021 of the Texas Government Code
governs the requirement. for performance and payment bonds for government entities making public work
contracts. Bonds must be from a surety listed In the most current Department of Treasury Federal
Register. A performance bond Is required If the contract Is In excess of $50,000 and Is to be made for
tbe full amount of the contract. A payment bond Is required If tbe contract Is in excess of $25,000
and Is to be made for the full amount of the contract. The bonds are to be executed orior to beginning
work on the project on the forms included in these bid documents al1d must be executed by a corporate
surety or sureties in accordance with the Texas Insurance Code. If the contract is less than $50,000 the
performance bonlwill nol be required as long as the contract provides that payment is not due until the
work is completed and accepted by the County.

(If the bid amount is less than $50,000, thefollowing bond in/onnation is optional.)
If required, can you furnish payment and performance bonds? YES X NO _
if so, provide name Surety Company: UNITED STATES FIDELITY AND GUARANTY
Provide name of local Bonding Agency FROST INSURANCE AGENCY - DOUG VRAZELL
Bonding Agency's phone number --'(,..3"'6"'1.1.)--J,5518.l!0=-;z9!J.0...2,L5 .,.... _
Bond Premium amount (not included in the base bid amount): ADD.",$--,7,-,.",4,",5C1l6~• .l!O!J.O _

BID ALTERNATES: There are no bid alternates that affect this scope of work.

VOLUNTARY ALTERNATE(S) - Acceptance or refusal of Voluntary Alternate(s) rests solely with
Williamson County Commissioner's Court and FTWOODS Construction, the Construction Manager.
Attach additional pages on your letterhead to thoroughly explain each Alternate. You must note
specification section(s) and paragraph number(s) that your Alternate revises. Ifyou have more than one
Voluntary Alternate, make a notation (such as "see attached") in the area below.
Description: __ ..:N"'/..:A=--- _

ADDIDEDVCT $ -0-

REFERENCES: Provide at least 3 references (name/company/phone number) from a similar project.
SETON SOUTHWEST FAULKNER CONSTRUCTION DWAYNEPOW (512) 448-9800
LEANDER HIGH SCHOOL #2 AUSTECH ROOF CONSULTANTS (512) 443-7255
AUSTIN CONVENTION CENTER SPAW GLASS CONTRACTORS (517) 719-5251
PFLUGERVILLE JUSTICE CENTER pAT. MAC CONSTRUCTION (512) 794-8685
TEXAS SCHOOL FOR THE PEAF MW RIUI PERS (817) 532-241 I

It is understood that the Commissioners Court of Williamson County, Texas reserves the right to accept or reject any
and/or all Bids for any or all materials and/or services covered in this Bid request, and to waive informalities or
defects in the Bid or to accept such Bid it shall deem to be in the best interest of Williamson County. It is further
understood that all proposals shall be valid for a period of ninety (90) days from the date bids are due and may not be
withdrawn during that period.

Title ENT RPRISES ROOFING, INC.
(end of Bid Form)

Bid Form - Page 2 of 2 (January 31, 2(01)



BID FORM for
Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofmg Package for the
Modified Bitumen Roofing, Metal Roofmg and Siding

MardJ 13, 2001

Page 139

New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County
Willlamson Counly Bid Nnmber: OlWC311

(;eorgetown, 1rexas

Da~: 4-10-2001

PROPOSAL OF: Reliable Roofing & Remodeling
(Name)

22050 Bulverde Road San Antonio, Tx 78259

(Address)

Telephone No.: 210-647-7663 Fax No.: 210-497-1027

TO: Williamson County

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the Bidding Documents which also include the General Conditions,
Instructions to Bidders, Prevailing Wage Rates, Workers Compensatioo and General Uability Insurance
Requirements, Performance and Payment Bond Requirements, Geo~chnical Investigation Data, Summary
of Work, Allowances, AI~rnales, Products and Substitutions, and all Addenda as well as the premises and
all conditions affecting the Work, the undersigned will furnish all labor, materials, equipment, supervision
and applicable taxes required to comple~ the entire Work described in the Scope of Work. The Bidder
also agrees thai the Work proposed is in comple~ compliance and in accordance with the Bidding
Documents excepl and if identified otherwise herein:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA: Nos. 1 2
Dated: 2-9-01 2-15-01 ---

BASE BID AMOUNT Lump Sum Base Bid $ 539,419.00

Base Bid written amount Five hundred thirty nine thousand four hundred
nineteen and no cents

Bid Form - Page I of I (January 31, 2001)

•
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Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofing Package for the Modified Bitumen
Roofing, Metal Rooting and Siding
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County, Bid Number 01 we311

PERFORMANCE AND PA YMENT BONDS: Chapter 2253.021 of the Texas Government Code
governs the requirements for performance and payment bonds for government entities making public work
contracts. Bonds must be from a surety listed in lbe most current Department of Treasury Federal
Register. A performance bond Is required if lbe contract Is in ....cess of $50,000 and Is to be made for
the full amount of the cootract. A payment bond Is required if the contract Is in excess of $25,000
and Is to be made for lbe Cull amount of the contract. The bonds are to be executed prior to beginning
work on the project on the forms included in these bid documents and must be executed by a corporate
surety or sureties in accordance with the Texas Insurance Code. If the contract is less than $50,000 the
performance bond will not be required as long as the contract provides that payment is not due until the
work is completed and accepted by the County.

(If the bid amount is less tJum $50,000, the/allowing bond in/ormaJion is optional.)
If required, can you furnish payment and performance bonds? YES x NO, _
If so, provide name Surety Company: Merchants Bonding Companies
Provide name of local Bonding Agency Steven Thomas Agency
Bonding Agency's phone number -=9;..:7;..:2;..-;..:6c::2::5;..-..:9..:7..:7..:7__ -,-=c::----,oz_"';"O"""'-----
Bond Premium amount (not included in the base bid amount): ADDS 16. 183.00

BID AL TERNA TES: There are no bid alternates that affect this scope of work.

VOLUNTARY AL TERNA TEISl - Acceplance Or refusal of Voluntary Altemate(s) rests solely with
Williamson County Comntissioner's Coun and FIWOODS Construction, the Construction Manager.
Attach additional pages on your letterhead to thoroughly explain each Alternate. You must note
specification section(s) and paragraph number(s) that your Alternate revises. If you have more than one
Voluntary Alternate, make a notation (such as "see attached") in the area below.
Description: _

ADDIDEDUCT $_N"'o""n..e'-- _

REFERENCES: Provide at least 3 references (name/company/phone number) from a similar project.
Marquis at Rogers Ranch Callaway Contractors 210-822-0200
Guild Park Hedze Manazerower 210-270-4666
Cotulla Border Patrol Station Can am Construction 4°5-348-9852
Wyoming Springs Medical Center @ Bound Rock Cooper MediCa' Buildings
405-842-6653

It is understood that the Comntissioners Conn of Williamson County, Texas reserves the right to accept or reject any
andlor all Bids for any or all materials andlor services covered in this Bid request, and to waive informalities or
defects in the Bid or to accept such Bid it shall deem to be in the best interest of Williamson County. It is funher
understood that all proposals shall be valid for a period of ninety (90) days from the dare bids are due and may not be
withdrawn during that period.

Respectfully submitted,
~eliable Roofing & Remodeling

(Printed Nanne)
Title ~ .......... ~

(end of Bid Form)

Bid Form - Page 2 of 2 (January 31, 2001)
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BID FORM for
Di.d Pacme 7,6- CombinedJloo~e for~
Modifted Bitqmen RoofJ.l!2.Met@!Roofing and SidinK

_13,2001

New JoveaJ]e Facility for WllliamsoQ County
W1Q!t_ e-&1Jli4 N-"cr. I1WCSll l

Georptowo, Tens

n-: 4-10-01
PROPOSAL OF: Texa~ Roofing Co. of Austin, Inc.

(Name)

P.O. Box 80798 Austin, TX 78708
(Addless)

TeIapboocNo.:252-8920
TO: Willialllson Olunty

FaxNo.: 252-8923

Haviaa c.refutIy .,mjDod Ibe BiddiaB DocumeaIs wbIcII also incWe Ibe 0CacnI Coadilioas,
IamuclioaIlo Bidden, I'IcvalIiDa W. RaliII, Wodcas CompensM'ioD IIId0caerII UIbility __
ReqIliremalll.Pab_IlIcIPa.mentBoDclRequinlaleals.GelJlcCbDklllDY...ripionDlla.S1ImmIry
ofWCIIIt, AIIow-. AIWn_ PIodaclI Md SubllitudoDs, IlIcIIii Ad._ uWI1 uIbe premilcllIIlI
III MDdItjons aII'ecIiDIlhe WCIIIt,Ibe undc:rsiped will f'uraIIb 1ll11bar,IIlaIeriaII, equipment, tupeMsioa
IIId appIlcIbIe Wte$ tequind lo COIIIpIca: Ihe eatire WCIIk deIc:Iibed ia Ibe Scopo of WCIIk. The Bidder
also .- dIallbe WClIk ptoposed iIiD QOmp1ell: compli_1IId iD IWlIdance willi Ibe BicldiD&
~ exceplllld Ifi......;fied otIJcrwIse beIeIa:

ACKNOWI.FPGRM!NT Of ADPENDA: Not. I 2
o.ud:2-5-01 2-14-01~ ___ ,

BASE D.JDAMOUNT Lamp5umBaseBicl $ 649,900.00
BaseBlchrri __ t Six Hundred Forty-Nine Thousand Nine Hundred
and No/IOO Dollars

Bid Form· ..... 1 of I (JIDam)' 31, 2(01)
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Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Rooflng Package for the Modified Bitumen
Roofing, Metal Roofing and Siding
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County, Bid Number OlWC31l

PERfORMANCE AND PAYMENT BONDS; Chlpler 2253.021 of !he Texas Oovemmem Code
1_ dlc ~ (Of performance IIld payment bonds for JOYernmeftl eftliliel; IIII1dna pllbw: worte
COftlrlCts. IloDds must he rr- .1lIret)' listed III the _t C111T1111Depu1menl ofTrusur1 JecIenI
a.pter. A per(OI'lDlllCe boad Is required If the coatnd Is III _ 01 S50,ooo ud is 10 he lUCIe for
!he full .-.at of dle ClOIIInCt. A paJmellI boad Is reqllind If tile COIIlrKt is III _ of S25,CIOO
aad Is 10 be ID8de for the fuII_ of die ~ The bonds are 10 be execulllld prjgr!!! l!eri'pjn,
l!lBon rhc project OIl !he fCX1lll inc:1Ddedi111hcse bid cIocumcollaad IIIIISlbe CJCtlCIlIed by a ClOlpOl'IIe
SIIlClY or sumies in IIlXlClIdaac:o willi die Texas Insunnc;e Code. If die c:oruraet is less lbaa S~.ooo !he
perfOl11l&llClC bood will DOl be reqoircd as loDIlIS die COlIIrIICt proviclea dill paymeIlI is DOl dUll UDIi1 die
work is coqIleIod IIld Kc:qxed by Ihe COUllI)'.

(If rite hid _ is Iusdum 150.000, rltefoUqwm, boIItl infoftMliIJA is opritJML)
If requiled, CaD ~ Ilzrni$h paymonlllld perflXlll&llCe bonds? YES X NO, _
IflO,provIde-Sant1Co'IIIIJ: Capitol Indemnity Corp.
PIovide _ of IocIIlIGn e cApacy~C"".~A,",",Sillc04hll;!u40t*z~e-"A~g~e'-!Jn~coLY _
IloDdiDa A&eacY', J'b-DUmber ,{512)447-5507
...... __ •• D_ (DoliIIcluded iIl·~!he:=":'bue~'"bid~...;';;:.':;:_':"""t):-""'AD=DSC:--'l"'O:-,""O""O':':'O"'. 0"'0,.-----

BIDALmrwrys: t1leIe areDO bid l1_lbIlpffeec Ibis rcope of wodc.

VOLlJNTABY·AL'I'RBNADffll- AClCCplIDCCOf Idusal of Volo.., Abenwie(s).- solely "'lib
WiUi_ ~ ~'. Coon IIld Fl'WOODS COIIIlrUCIioa, lbo ~ MmaF·
AlIacb addiIional JlqeS 011 ~ Ieaerhead to dIorou&bly explain each A........ YOlI__
specificalioa sec:IioD(s) EDdJI8ft&dIlh nll1llber(.) Ihal your A1_.m-. If~ have ..-. lhsn OlIO
Volwlwy A11ema1c,IIDIb • DlIIaliOII (11IclI as "_ atlacbed") illdie area below.
Descripliool: --T,NrTjTA----------------------

ADDIDEDUCT $ _

: Provide arleost 31derenc:es (lIIIIIeIeompany Ilumber) from. similar project.
Swanson - American Constructors 512 328-2026

David Yeagy - Austin ommerc a
Lee Hall - Raymond Construction (972)980-4404

II is UIocIeilifiOOd dw die Collllllislioners CouIt of WiJll.!IKC!!I County, Texas reserves die riaht to accept or rojoclllll'
aadlor all Bids for auy or aD IlIEIeriIb aadIor servlc:es covered in IhiI Bid nqucst, aDd to waive iofonDaII1Ies Of
cIefOClI iD die Bid Of to accept such Bid it shall deem to be inlhe best in_ ofW"allillDSClll CouDty. k Is ~
UDdomoo4lbal . for a period of IliMIY (90) days from die dOl bids aredue IDl! may_ be
wllbdra IIJ dIat pa!

Tillo President
(ead of Bid Form)

Bid Form • Pap 2 of 2 (Janl1Fl)' 31. 20(1)
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BID FORM for'
Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofmg Package for the
Modified Bitumen Roofing, Metal Roofing and Siding

Man:b 13,2001

New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County
WUliamson County Bid NUOlbcr. 01WC311

Georgetown, Texas

Date: April 9 200]

PROPOSALOP: United Bgofjnll and Sheetmetal. Inc,
(Name)

3501 S. Texas Aye. Bryan. TX 77802
(Address)

TclepboncNo.:(979) 268-7663 FaxNo.: (979) 846-8797

TO: Williamson COllllty

Gentlemen:

Having carefully e;wnincd the Bidding Documents which also include the General Conditions,
Instructions to Bidders, Prevailing Wage Rates. Workers Compensation and General liability Insurance
Requirements. Pert'ol1Dance and Payment Bond RequUclllCnts, Geotcclmical Investigation Data, Summary
of Wark, A11o~. Altcmalcs, Products and SubstilUtions, and all Addenda as well as the premises and
all conditions affecting the Work, the undersignt(\ wiJI furnish all labor, materials, equipment, supervision
and applicable taxes required to complete the entire Work described in the Scope of Work. The Bidder
also agrees that the Work PI'OPOScd is in complele compliance and in accordance with the Bidding
Documents eltCCpland if identified otherwise herein:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OJi"ADDENDA: NO$.! --,,-2.,..--
Dated~2/05101 02/14/01~ _

:BASEBID AMOUNT LumpSum:BaseBid $ 678 648 00,
Base Bid written amount
S-:ixbundred seventy eight

Bid Fonn - Palle 1 of 1 (1anuary 31,2001)
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Bid Package 7.6 - Combined Roofmg Package for the Modified Bitumen
Roofmg, Metal Roofing and Siding
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County, Bid Number OlWC311

PERFORMANCE AND PAyMENT BONDS: Chapter2253.021of !he Texas OoVernmellt Code
governs !he requiremenl.$ for perfonnana: and payment bonds for government entities making public work
contracts. Bonds must be from a surety listed In the most current Department of Treasury FederaI
RegIster. A perfonnancc bond is required if the contract is In excess of $50,000 and Is to be made for
the full amount of the contract. A payment bond is required it the contract Is ill excess of $25,000
and is to be made for the full amount of the contract. The bonds are to be exs:c"ted prior to beginning
l!!l!ds on !he project on !he forms included ill !hese bid documents and must be execuled by a corporalC
surety or sureties in accordance with !he Texas Insurance Code. If !he contract is less than $50,000 the
perlonnance bond will not be required as long as the contract provides that payment is nol due until the
work is completed and accepted by !he County.

(l{the bid amount is less than S50,OOO,the{ollowing bond inloTmlltwlI is optioruzl.)
If required, can you furnish payment and performance bonds? YES x NO, _
If so, provide name Surety CompaDJ: GlJl f TpS1Jrance Company
Provide name of local Bonding AgenCY....p.Po,..NUCOu.. ~T~n"swlJ.ranwc",e,,- _
Bonding Agency's phone number .~C~9J..7~9}1-7~7":,,4.....,,,6.;>,5, 5"--:-_--.:-:-::,-- _
Bond Premilllll alllount (not Included in the base bid amount): AOO,,,-S,J.'.l.I0.,..JJ'8:l..10,L.".I.OWOl..- _

BID AL TERNA TES: There are no bid allCmalCs !hat affect this scope of work.

VOJ,UNTARY ALTERNATJUS) - Acceptance or refusal of Voluntary Alternate(s) rests solely with
Williamson County Commissioner's Court and fTWOODS Construction, !he Construction Manager.
Attach additional pages on your letterhead to !horoughly explain each Alternate. You mu$! nole
specification section(s) and paragraph number(s) that your A1tetn8le revises. If you have mOre !han one
Voluntary Alternate, make a notation (such as "see attached") in the area below.
~ption: Thlro_last Roofing Srstem - Section 07525 - See Attached

ADDIDEDUcr $ ..Q.::l~~UI.L.. __

REFERENCES: Provide at least 3 references (name/company/phone number) from a similar project
Ed Dobbins BrazOS CgJJDtr

Ray Morgan Wa gbington Cmmtlr (979) 277-6200

It is understood !hat the Commissioners Court of Williamson County, Texas lCScrYesthe right to accept or reject any
mellor all Bids for any or all materials anellor services covered in !his Bid request, and to waive informalities or
defects In the Bid or to accept such Bid it shall deem to be in the best interest of Williamson County. It is further
understood that all proposals shall be valid for a period of ninety (90) days from the dale bids are due and may not be
withdrawn during that period.

Respectfully submitted,United Roofing & Sheetmetal, Inc.

~)
(Co~)

By -<:~
~ (Sigpa\lIn:)

AI#ZT /lh;r~c
(Pri~Name)

Tide t!r?£ ~!?"u6VT
(end of Bid Form)

Bid Fonn • Page 2 of 2 (January 31, 2001)
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AGENDA ITEM 33

Page 145

Consider awarding, rejecting or extending bid for athletic equipment at new Juvenile Facility.

Moved: Commissioner Limmer
Seconded: Commissioner Boatright
Motion: To award bid for athletic equipment at new Juvenile Facility to AALCO Manufacturing Co.
Vote: 4 - 0 with Commissioner Heiligenstein absent from the dais.

< Attachment>
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BID FORM for
Bid Packge 11.5. AtJiktis;E~

MaId 13,2CIIl

New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County
WOllemson Count)' Bid NUIlIben 01WOll

Georgetown, Texas

Dale: 3-d (P-CJ I

PROPOSAL OF: A4 J.. Co MF6 Co
(Name)

Iv Sl) Auc "H" sr Lou/!i ./'1() G 3 /.J $
(Address)

TekpIloncNo.,8'VO· ~s)-foiSt FlIlINo.: '5) i..;.$'-1"1. ;} 38"(..

TO: WilUamson CountY

Genllcmen:

Havillg cerefuIly oxmIiaed r.be Biddin, Doc:wneul5 \"hidJ also iDdude the Geaeral CoodlIlonI.
lusllllCliOllS to Bidders. PreveI1IDs Wap Rms. Workcn Compenselion 8IId0eDeral Liebtlity Insu:rance
ReqUi!emen1S, Performencc and Payment Bond Requiremenll. GeorechnicellDWIliption Date, SUnuIw:y
of Work, Allowanc:es, Altema1eS. l'roducts ... d SubsdtutiollS, 8IId aU Addeoda as well as the premises end
all COJIclilioosaffcctinJ !he work, the uncletsillned will furnish ell Iebor, IIIaIerieIs, equipment. superviaion
IDc1 applicable taxes required 10complere the entire Work desa1'bed in tbe Scope of Work. The Bidder
also agrees that the Work proposecl is in compll!le compliance and inaecotdence wilh the Bidding

, Documems except and if icbldtied Olberwise herein;

ACKNOWlEDGEMENT OFAPDENDA: N08.__Dated: _

BMEBID AMO!M Lump Sum BaseBid s 3;;>,3/0'" Z¥

8aleB~amo1IDt UfJ.c.Tv rW(J 1JtouS"i.v.1, /HJL£E Ht.I"-/DIt.C.Qq.... ",u • ;

Bid Fonn - Pa:e 1 of 2 (January 31. 20(1)
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Bid Packa~.s . Athletic Equipment
New Juvenile Facility for Williamson County, Bid Number 01WC311

PERFORMANCE ANDJAYMENT BOND§: Chapter 22S3.021 of lbe T_ GoverDIIlCIIt Code
governs !be requitellleolS fer per!0fIIIlIIICe and payment bonds fer government entities makiD, public work
coulI'aCl8. BOIlds mdSt be from a lUray listed lD die molt c:urn:Dt DeplrtIDeIU of Trea:cry ll'edenl
RccfSCer. A perforDWICe bood is requirellll die colltl'act Is illeKe5I of S50,OOO_Is to be ... tor
the fu118DlOl1Dtof the contnlCL A pa:JDllllt bOIId Is required If the contract II ill excess of S2S.OOO
and is to be made for the full amount of the contnIcl. The bouds are III be exCQlted prior to begjnninJ
l!!lIk on !be project On !be forms included in lb_ bid dOCllllleUlSand lJ)U$l be exccaled by a eotpOI3.te
sl/l1!l)'or sureties in accotdauce willi 1be Texas lusul1lllC4! Codt. If !be conaaa is leu Iban $50.000 !be
performance bond will not be requin!d as 10D, as lhe COIllX1Clprovides that payment is not due unrillhe
work is completed and acc:epled by the Coumy.

(q1M Ind amo""t is Idss than 150,000. 1M/oUowln, bt",d jnfonnatiDn is (lfftUmaLJ
If required, ..... you ftlmbh pa)'ment and pel'faJ1lWlCeboads? YES ~ NO,_...,- __
If 50, provide name Surety Compau)': ~ S u,;?i;. ZJ:::
Provide tIlIlDIl of local Bondine Agency ~lL5Uh I? ~S;;r;J S
Bondloll ~cy's phoneoumbcr '? j '=' 5(1,iJ " ',c, "
load Presninm amount (001 included io lhe base bid amount): ADDS 7 7$_"V

BID ALTERNATES: There 111: no bid ~ that affect lhls scope of work.

VOLUNTARY ALTERNA'J!lSl- A~ or refusal ofVoluotary A1let11are(s)fC$lS solely wilh
Williamson COUDty Cotntnissioner's Court and FlWOODS Consauction, lhe Consuucdoo Maoaacr.
AnaclI additional pages on your Jencrhcad llllhoJoughJy explJin each A1temale. Yau must oore
specification section(s) and paragraph number(s) tbat your Alternate revises. If you have more Iban one
Voll1llW'y Alternate, make a.nowion (such ill "see maebed'") in the area below.
Descriplion: _

ADDJDEDucr S _

It is undenlOOd dtat the Commissionen Coon ofW'JlliMlSCln County, TOMS reserves the rilbt Il) accept or ~ClC:l an)'
and/orall Bids for any or alll1l8lerials lIIldIorservlc:es covered in Ibis Bid RtjIleSt, IUd ID wlive ioforma1ltlcs or
defects in tho: Bid or Il) IICCqlt sucb Bid it IIJa11 deetn to be in !be best imaest of WilJiam5O'1 CoIlnty. It is furlher
undeQtood dIaE all PlOPOsaJs shaI1 be valid far a period of ninety (90) daYJ from lhe date bids are due IlId may Dol be
withdIawn duriJI& tIw period.

RespectfIIl1y submiu:2t4. i.CQ I1E e;- Q)

By ~Co~~=:.. ,.L.;.::lrt2~=='=)'__ _

lIipature.t;,cFhf-Y' C. j6tiJl6lL
(l'rilllC4N )

Title :T7<&A W1.t:,A.
1IlDC

(end of Bid Form)

Bid Form - Page 2 of2 (J8IIttary 31. 20(1)



04/1712001

AGENDA ITEM 34

Page 148

Consider approving an interlocal agreement with city of Georgetown for construction of the 30 inch water line
along Cedar Breaks Rd.

No action was taken on this item, which will be added to the April 24, 2001 agenda.

AGENDA ITEM 35

Consider approving contract with Evercom Systems, Inc for new inmate telephone system.

No action was taken on this item, which will be added to the April 24, 2001 agenda.

< Attachment>


