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AGENDA ITEM 25

Consider awarding, rejecting, or extending bid for one or more earth moving heavy equipment for URS.

Moved: Commissioner Limmer
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To award the bid for one or more earth moving heavy equipment machines for URS to Holt Compan f
Texas. yo
Vote: 3 - 0 with Commissioner Heiligenstein absent from the dais.

< Attachment>

FISCAL YEAR 2001 BID TABULATION FOR HEAVY EQUIPMENT page 1 of 4

BID NUMBER 01WC306

THE BIDS FOR HEAVY EQUIPMENT WERE EVALUATED UNDER THE LIFE
CYCLE COST BID. THE AWARD IS BASED ON THE FIVE-YEAR COST OF
OWNERSHIP. THIS IS CALCULATED BY USING THE NUMBERS PROVIDED
BY THE BIDDERS ON THE BID FORM. TAKE THE COST OF THE MACHINE,
PLUS THE GUARNTEED COST OF REPAIRS, PLUS THE COST OF THE
PERFORMANCE BOND, MINUS THE RE- PURCHASE PRICE, THIS GIVES
THE COST OF OWNERSHIP FOR THAT PERIOD.

ITEM: 27,000 LB. ARTICULATED MOTOR GRADER
1. HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS "LOW BID THAT MEETS SPECS."
CATERPILLAR 120H $136,419.00
ONE TRADE IN, 1980 CAT 12G TRADE $32,000.00

NET PRICE $104,419.00
*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $13,589.00

2. ROMCO EQUIPMENT CO. INC. "OUT OF SPEC."
CHAMPION 710A VHP/VOLVO G710 VHP
ONE TRADE IN, 1980 CAT 12G

$129,373.00
TRADE $27,500.00

NET PRICE $101,873.00
*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $9,664.00
EXCEPTIONS: 3-CIRCLE SUPPORT SHOES, SPEC. REQUIRES 4 SHOES.
TRANSMISSION HAS 8-SPEEDS FORWARD AND 4-SPEEDS REVERSE,
SPEC. REQUIRES 8-SPEEDS FORWARD AND 6-SPEEDS REVERSE.

3. RDO EQUIPMENT
JOHN DEERE 670L
ONE TRADE IN, 1980 CAT 12G

$131,852.00
TRADE $2,500.00

NET PRICE $106,852.00
*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP "NO BID"

4. ANDERSON MACHINERY AUSTIN, INC.
NEW HOLLAND RG-140
ONE TRADE IN, 1980 CAT 12G

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $57,559.00

5. TEXANA MACHINERY "NO BID"

$139,634.00
TRADE $23,500.00

NET PRICE $116,134.00



BID NUMBER 01WC306 CONT.

ITEM: 32,000 lB. ARTICULATED MOTOR GRADER
1. HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS
CATERPilLAR 140H
ONE TRADE IN, 1977 CAT 14G
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$172,532.00
TRADE $47,000.00

NET PRICE $125,532.00

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = NEG. $184.00

2. ROMCO EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
CHAMPION 720A VHPI VOLVO G720 VHP
ONE TRADE IN, 1977 CAT 14G

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $14,976.00

3. ANDERSON MACHINERY AUSTIN, INC.
NEW HOLLAND RG-170
ONE TRADE IN, 1977 CAT 14G

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $74,551.00

4. RDO EQUIPMENT
JOHN DEERE 770CH
ONE TRADE IN, 1977 CAT 14G

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP "NO BID"

$154,900.00
TRADE $30,000.00

NET PRICE $124,900.00

$173,873.00
TRADE $22,000.00

NET PRICE $151,873.00

$155,882.00
TRADE $22,500.00

NET PRICE $133,382.00

5. TEXANA MACHINERY "NO BID"

ITEM: 4-WHEEl DRIVE BACKHOE LOADER WITH HAMMER
1. HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS
CATERPilLAR 416C 4X4 W/NPK H-4Xl HAMMER
ONE TRADE IN, CASE 5800 TRADE

NET PRICE
*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $33,353.00

2. TEXANA MACHINERY
CASE 580l TURBO WITRAMAC 150 HAMMER
ONE TRADE IN, CASE 5800

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $37,455.00

$76,828.00
$10,000.00
$66,828.00

$75,420.00
TRADE $12,000.00

NET PRICE $63,420.00



BID NUMBER 01WC306 CONT.
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3. WAUKESHA PEARCE IND.
KOMATSU WB140-2 W/AlLiED MODEL AS 380 STREET HAMMER $70,950.00
ONE TRADE IN, CASE 580D TRADE $7,500.00

NET PRICE $63,450.00
*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $48,565.00

4. RDO EQUIPMENT
JOHN DEERE 310SE W/OKADA 300 SERIES HAMMER
ONE TRADE IN, CASE 580D TRADE

NET PRICE
*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP "NO BID"

5. ANDERSON MACHINERY "NO BID"

ITEM: SELF· PROPELLED 9·WHEEL ROLLER
1. HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS
CATERPilLAR PS150 B
ONE TRADE IN, INGRAM 9-2800

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $22,068.00

2. ROMCO EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
INGERSOl-RAND PT125R
ONE TRADE IN, INGRAM 9-2800

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $40,856.00

3. ANDERSON MACHINERY AUSTIN, INC.
HYSTER HYPAC C-530AH
ONE TRADE IN, INGRAM 9-2800

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $41,349.00

4. ClOSNER EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
DYNAPAC MODEL CP132
ONE TRADE IN, INGRAM 9-2800 "NO BID"

5. TEXANA MACHINERY "NO BID"

$72,555,00
$8,000.00

$64,555.00

$57,230.00
TRADE $7,000.00

NET PRICE $50,230.00

$47,356.00
TRADE $2,500.00

NET PRICE $44,586.00

$66,387.00
TRADE $2,500.00

NET PRICE $63,887.00

$48,388.00
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ITEM: 45,000 LB. TRACK EXCAVATOR WITH HAMMER
1. HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS
CATERPilLAR 320 C W/NPK E210 HAMMER $197,895.00

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $93,251.00

2. TEXANA MACHINERY
CASE 9030 B WITRAMAC V32 HAMMER $193,843.00

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $141,991.00

3. ANDERSON MACHINERY AUSTIN, INC.
NEW HOllAND EC-215lC W/AlLiED 770 HAMMER $212,883.00

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $147,532.00

4. ROO EQUIPMENT CO.
JOHN DEERE 200LC W/OKADA MODEL OKB 312B HAMMER $179,815.00

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP "NO BID"

ITEM: 41,900 LB. CRAWLER LOADER
1. HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS
CATERPilLAR 963C
ONE TRADE IN, 1986 CAT 963 lOADER

$199,989.00
TRADE $32,000.00

NET PRICE $167,989.00

*FIVE YEAR COST OF OWNERSHIP = $74,914.00

2. ANDERSON MACHINERY AUSTIN, INC. "NO BID"

3. TEXANA MACHINERY "NO BID"
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Consider awarding, rejecting, or extending bid for one or more pieces of mowing equipment for URS.

Moved: Commissioner Limmer
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To award bid for one or more pieces of mowing equipment for URS to Taylor Equipment.
Vote: 3 - 0 with Commissioner Heiligenstein absent from the dais.

<Attachment>

FISCAL YEAR 2001 BID TABULATION FOR MOWING EQUIPMENT

BID NUMBER 01WC308

ITEM: TWO MOWING TRACTORS WITH 15' FLEX-WING MOWERS

1. TAYLOR EQUIPMENT
MASSEY FERGUSON MF4243 W/BUSH HOG 3615$28,400.00 X 2 = $56,800.00
THREE UNITS FOR TRADE LESS TRADE $10,500.00

NET COST FOR 2 UNITS $43,300.00

2. WILLIAMSON COUNTY EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
CASE IH C90 W/RHINO SR15 $32,089.00 X 2 = $64,178.00
THREE UNITS FOR TRADE LESS TRADE $9,500.00

NET COST FOR 2 UNITS $54,678.00

3. GEORGETOWN FARM SUPPLY
JOHN DEERE 5510 W/JD1518 CUTTER
THREE UNITS FOR TRADE

$31,380.00 X 2 = $62,760.00
LESS TRADE $3,000.00

NET COST FOR 2 UNITS $59760.00

ITEM: ONE NEW MOWING TRACTOR

1. TAYLOR EQUIPMENT
MASSEY FERGUSON MF4243
TWO UNITS FOR TRADE

$19,680.00
LESS TRADE $7,000.00

NET COST OF UNIT $12,680.00

2. WILLIAMSON COUNTY EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
CASE IH C90
TWO UNITS FOR TRADE

$23,402.00
LESS TRADE 8,000.00

NET COST OF UNIT $15,492.00

3. GEORGETOWN FARM SUPPLY
JOHN DEERE 5510
TWO UNITS FOR TRADE

$21,255.00
LESS TRADE $2,000.00

NET COST OF UNIT $19,255.00


