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ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE

Capitol Aggregates, Ltd. (Delta Plant)
Centex Materials, LP

Colorado Materials, Ltd.

Dean Word Company Ltd.

M.E. Ruby, Jr., Inc.

Vulcan Construction Materials, LP
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM
ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA027 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: __ CAPITOL AGGREGATES, LTD. (DELTA PLANT)

Mailing Address: P.0. BOX 99
City: MARBLE FALLS State: _rtpyag  Zipi___78554
Telephone: (830  )693-3533 Fax: (1830 )693-7231

W——_’ | Date of BID: _AugusT 8. 2000

Signature of Parson Authorized to Sign BID

Name and Title of Signer: _MICHAEL W. HAAS SALES REPRESENTATIVE
(Please Print or Type}

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: NET %_30 days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ 1"all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. [f left blank, low item will apply.)

[x) low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)

List Additional Limitations if applicable:

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 of 8




BID NUMBER: 01WCAO027

WILLIAMSON COUNTY
BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

<11

ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN “AS NEEDED” BASIS.

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 — 3:00 PM
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY BE
MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TC PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND THE
COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE SAME

UNIT PRICE.
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
1 Flexible Base, TxDot Item 247, 60,000 | Ton NO BID NO BID
Type A, Grade 2, Class 2
2 Flexible Base, TxDot item 247, as Ton NO BID NO BID
Type A, Grade 4 needed
3 1" x 3" Hard Stone as Ton
’ NO BID
TxDot Item 432.3 needed NO BID BI
4 3" x 5" Hard Stone, as Ton NO BID NO BID
TxDot Item 432.3 needed
5 12" Rip Rap, TxDot ltem 432.3 Ton O BID RO BID
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
15" 0
12" 0-15
a 10-50
3 80-100
1" 90-100
6 18" Rip Rap, TxDot ltem 432.3 Ton NO BID NO BID
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as
RETAINED : needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
18" 0
15" 20-60
12" 45-80
8" 75-100
6" 80-100
-6" 0-20
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME:
ATTACHMENT Page 10f 2 CAPITOL AGGREGATES, LTD.

(DELTA PLANT)




Pt "

212
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
7 Crushed Limestone, as Ton NO BID NO BRID
Base Screenings needed
8 Crushed Limestone, as Fon
Washed Screenings needed NO BID NO BID
9 Crushed Limestone, as Ton NO BID NO BID
Dry Screenings needed
10 Crushed Limestone, as Ton NO BID NO BID
Fill Material needed
11 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302, 5,000 Ton $10.50 $52,500.00
Type B, Grade 3
12 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302, 5,000 Ton '
Type B, Grade 4 $9.50 $47,500.00
13 Aggregate, TxDol ltem 302, as Ton $10.50
Type B, Grade 5 needed
14 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton $16.50
TxDot Item 302, Type PE, Grade 3 needed ’
15 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot Item 302, Type PE, Grade 4 needed $15.00
16 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot Item 302, Type PE, Grade 5 needed $16.00
17 1 1/2" Concrete Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot Item 421 needed NO BID NO BID
18 3" Crushed Base as Ton NO BID NO BID
needed
19 24" Rip Rap as Ton NO BID NO BID
needed '
20 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 3 as Ton NO BID NO BID
needed
21 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 4 as Ton NO BID NO BID
needed
22 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 5 as Ton NO BID NO BID
needed
BID TOTAL | $1000,000.00 !
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME: ~ CAPITOL AGGREGATES, LTD.
ATTACHMENT Page 2 of 2 (DELTA PLANT)
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA027 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she Is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: Centex Materials, LP
Mailing Address: P,0, Box 2252
City: __ Austin State: _Texas Zip:__ 78768
Telephone: ( 512 ) 327-3652 Fax: (_512 ) _ 328-6536
. Q-" Date of BID: _3§.-8..00
Signature of Person Au d to Sign BID

Name and Title of Signer: Mark Hamilton, Vice President - Sales
(Please Print or Type)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: 0 % days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)

[ 17all or none” basis. (Will accept award of “all” items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)

[ x] low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all” items.)

List Additional Limitations if applicable:
Items 11, 12, 13 gubject to availability, Contingent upon construction/
completion of wet/stone plant located 5,2 miles N on SH 195 from the

IH 35 intersection

All materials FOB Georgetown Quarry

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 of 8




BID NUMBER: 01WCA027

WILLIAMSON COUNTY
BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

<14

ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN “AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY BE
MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND THE
COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE SAME

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

UNIT PRICE.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTy UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
1 Flexible Base, TxDot ltem 247, 60,000 | Ton
Type A, Grade 2, Class 2 3.00/ton 180,000,00
2 Flexible Base, TxDot Item 247, as Ton 2.75/t
Type A, Grade 4 needed »/2fton
3 1" x 3" Hard Stone, as Ton
TxDot ltem 432.3 needed No Bid
4 3" x 5" Hard Stone, as Ton
TxDot ltem 432.3 needed No Bid
5 12" Rip Rap, TxDot ltem 432.3 Ton
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as No Bid
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
15" 0
12" 0-15
g" 10-50
3" 80-100
1" $0-100
6 18" Rip Rap, TxDot Item 432.3 Ton
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as No Bid
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIiZE % RETAINED
18" 0
15" 20-60
12" 45-80
ar 75-100
g" 80-100
- 6" 0-20
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME: (Centex Materials , LP

ATTACHMENT Page 1 of 2
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ITEM DESCRIPTION QTYy UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
7 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Base Screenings needed No Bid
8 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Washed Screenings needed No Bid
8 | Crushed Limestone, as Ton '
Dry Screenings needed No Bid
10 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Fill Material needed No Bid
11 Aggregate, TxDot Item 302, 5,000 Ton
Type B, Grade 3 8.00/ton 40,000,00
12 Aggregate, TxDot item 302, 5,000 Ton
Type B, Grade 4 7.25/ton 36,250.00
13 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302, as Ton
Type B, Grade 5 needed 7.00/ton
14 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton .
TxDot Item 302, Type PE, Grade 3 needed No Bid
15 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 4 needed No Bid
16 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 5 needed No Bid
17 1 1/2" Concrete Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot ltem 421 needed No Bid
18 3" Crushed Base as Ton
needed No Bid
19 24" Rip Rap as Ton
needed No Bid
20 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 3 as Ton
needed No Bid
21 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 4 as Ton No Bid
needed
22 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 5 as Ton ,
needed Neo Bid
BID TOTAL | 256,250.00
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME: Centex Materials, LP
ATTACHMENT Page2of 2
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM
ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA027 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM -
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: _ Optoesdo Hm‘m,s,u_r‘b.
Mailing Address: Peo. Box. Ao

City: ___ mn MNLCQS; T State: (% Zip:_(Y6G7
Telephone: { Hlz )  39L-I5SS Fax: ( 5&) 361558

M%UM Date of BID: __ /~-3[-0Q
Signature of Person Authorized to Sign BID

Name and Title of Signer: __honmg, .M. Swpew s Mameed

(Please Print or Type)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: AONE % days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ 1"all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all” items only. [f left blank, low item will apply.)

low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
List Additional Limitations if applicable:

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 of 8




BiD NUMBER: 01WCA027
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

WILLIAMSON COUNTY
BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

<1'7

ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN “AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY BE
MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND THE
COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE SAME

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

UNIT PRICE.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
1 Flexible Base, TxDot ltem 247, 60,000 | Ton K] 50 v
Type A, Grade 2, Class 2 // ! %‘?D, 600.
2 Flexible Base, TxDot ltem 247, as Ton # / / 50 —
Type A, Grade 4 needed y
3 1" x 3" Hard Stone, as Ton -
TxDot ltem 432.3 needed 4/4,9° -
4 3" x 5" Hard Stone, as Ton s -
TxDot ltem 432.3 needed #/5,
5 12" Rip Rap, TxDot ltem 432.3 Ton 5 .
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as Ne Db
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
157 0
12 0-15
8" 10-50
3" 80-100
1" 90-100
6 | 18" Rip Rap, TxDot ltem 432.3 Ton "
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as N ﬁfls
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
18" 0
15" 20-60
12" 45-80
8" 75-100
6" 80-100
-6" 0-20
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME: Cotofkbo MATERLALS I(,rL,

ATTACHMENT Page 1 of 2
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ITEM DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
7 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Base Screenings needed ¥ / 0 f ?5 -
8 Crushed Limestone, as Ton _
Washed Screenings needed ﬂ‘/ 7,95
9 Crushed Limestone, as Ton <
Dry Screenings needed f / 0, 1 -
10 Crushed Limestone, as Ton : — _
Fill Material needed £/0 .7
1 Aggregate, TxDot [tem 302, 5,000 Ton
Type B, Grade 3 {f Jb 23 634;50_“”
12 Aggregate, TxDot Item 302, 5,000 Ton ;
Type B, Grade 4 # / ﬁ , s #75: 250.%
13 Aggregate, TxDat item 302, as Ton —
Type B, Grade § needad # / 7, & -
14 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton - _
TxDot Item 302, Type PE, Grade 3 needed #02-7, =3
15 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton -
TxDot Item 302, Type PE, Grade 4 needed 4 152 ~
16 | Pre-Coat Aggregate, as | Ton _
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 5 needed K3 ‘QS'
17 1 1/2" Concrete Aggregate, as Ton -
TxDot ltem 421 needed # )4, 55~
18 3" Crushed Base as Ton '
needed /U e 5 A -
19 24" Rip Rap as Ton y
B e No Bk §
20 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 3 as Ton \ -
: needed No 5:5
21 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 4 as Ton 5 N _
needed e i A
22 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 5 as Ton N —
needed No A 2N
BID TOTAL —

ROAD BASE MATERIALS
ATTACHMENT Page 2 of 2

VENDOR NAME: ((0(ORRY ymhés,bm <
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM
ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA027 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Spaecial Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: DeAN M@Zﬁ—‘iﬁ 472,

Mailing Address: __ 2.0, ZOX 69
City: AMJARSLE FHLLS state: 7% ___zip:_ 7865
Telephone: (§70 ) 6932 - 2932 Fax: (F£30) 692 -Fo¥%c
IZ Date of 8ID: _§ -F 22

Signature of Person Authorized to Sign BID

Name and Title of Signer: ) AW 4 %’- ’S-;Wéa&
)

{Please Print or

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLdWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: % days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ ]"all or none"” basis, (Will accept award of “all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)
{ 1low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)

List Additional Limitations if applicable: WM& '

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page6of8
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY
BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS
ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA027 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN “AS NEEDED” BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY BE
MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND THE

COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE SAME

UNIT PRICE.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTty UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
1 Flexible Base, TxDot ltem 247, 60,000 Ton
Type A, Grade 2, Class 2
2 Fiexible Base, TxDot item 247, as Ton Ki’. éo
Type A, Grade 4 needed Tonl wam
3 1" x 3" Hard Stone, as Ton
TxDot item 432.3 needed
4 3" x 5" Hard Stone, as Ton
TxDot item 432.3 needed
5 12" Rip Rap, TxDot ltem 432.3 Ton
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
157 0
12 0-15
8" 10-50
3 80-100
1™ 90-100
6 18" Rip Rap, TxDot Item 432.3 Ton
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
18" 0
15° 20-60
12" 45-80
8" 75-100
6" 80-100
-6 0-20
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME:
ATTACHMENT Page 1af 2 e pibes 5.
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ITEM DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
#» PRICE
7 Crushed Limestone, as Ton

Base Screenings needed
8 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Washed Screenings needed
9 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Dry Screenings needed
10 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Fill Material needed
11 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302, 5,000 Ton
Type B, Grade 3
12 Aggregate, TxDol Item 302, 5,000 Ton
Type 8, Grade 4
13 Aggregate, TxDot tem 302, as Ton
Type B, Grade 5 needed
14 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 3 needed
15 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot item 302, Type PE, Grade 4 needed
16 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot \tem 302, Type PE, Grade 5 needed
17 1 1/2" Concrete Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot item 421 needed
18 3" Crushed Base as YTon
needed
19 24" Rip Rap as Ten
needed
20 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 3 as Ton
needed
21 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 4 as Ton
needed
22 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade § as Ton
needed
BID TOTAL
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDORNAME: 7 4W m C)D ’
ATTACHMENT Page 2 of 2




WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM
ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA027 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 — 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: M. E. Ruby, Jr., Inc,
Mailing Address: 13321 Limecreek Rd.

City: Cedar Park State: Tx. Zip: 78613
Telephone: {512 ) 258-1601 Fax: (512 )_2581762

Date of BID: _0s8_pna_20a0

SignaWo forized to Sign BID

Name anditle of Signer: Mark McKenzie Genecal DG apsae—~
{Please Print or Type) A

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: NONE % days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ 1"all or none” basis. (Will accept award of "all” items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)

[xq low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)

List Additional Limitations if applicable: _ Subject to availability

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

COPY

Page 6 of 8




WILLIAMSON COUNTY
BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT
BID NUMBER: 01WCA027
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN “AS NEEDED" BASIS.

223

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 — 3:00 PM

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY BE
MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND THE
COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE SAME

UNIT PRICE.

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
1 Flexible Base, TxDot ltem 247, 60,000 | Ton

Type A, Grade 2, Class 2 $3.56*
2 Flexible Base, TxDot Item 247, as Ton $3.56%
Type A, Grade 4 needed ’
3 1" x 3" Hard Stone, as Ton
TxDot ltem 432.3 needed
4 3" x 5" Hard Stone, as Ton
TxDot item 432.3 needed
5 12" Rip Rap, TxDot Item 432.3 Ton
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
15" 0
12" 0-15
g" 10-50
3" 80-100
™ 90-100
6 18" Rip Rap, TxDot Iltem 432.3 Ton
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
18" 0
15" 20-60
12" 45-80
8" 75-100
g" 80-100
-6" 0-20
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME: M. E. Ruby,Jr., Inc.
ATTACHMENT Page 1 of 2

*PRICES FOB PLANT
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ITEM DESCRIPTION QrTy UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
7 Crushed Limestone, as Ton

Base Screenings needed
8 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Washed Screenings needed
9 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Dry Screenings needed
10 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Fill Material needed
11 Aggregate, TxDot item 302, 5,000 Ton
Type B, Grade 3
12 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302, 5,000 Ton
Type B, Grade 4
13 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302, as Ton
Type B, Grade 5 needed
14 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot item 302, Type PE, Grade 3 needed
15 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot Item 302, Type PE, Grade 4 needed
16 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 5 needed
17 1 1/2" Concrete Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot Item 421 needed
18 3" Crushed Base as Ton
needed
19 24" Rip Rap as Ton
needed
20 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 3 as Ton
needed
21 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 4 as Ton
needed
22 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 5 as Ton
needed
BID TOTAL
*ALL PRICES FOB PLANT
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME: M. E. Ruby, Jr., Inc.

ATTACHMENT Page 2 of 2
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ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
7 Crushed Limestone, as Ton

Base Screenings needed
8 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Washed Screenings needed
9 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Dry Screenings needed
10 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Fill Material needed
11 Aggregate, TxDot Item 302, 5,000 Ton
Type B, Grade 3
12 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302, 5,000 Ton
Type B, Grade 4
13 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302, as Ton
Type B, Grade 5 needed
14 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot item 302, Type PE, Grade 3 needed
15 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 4 needed
16 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 5 needed
17 1 1/2" Concrete Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot ltem 421 needed
18 3" Crushed Base as Ton
needed
19 24" Rip Rap as Ton
needed
20 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 3 as Ton
needed
21 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 4 as Ton
needed
22 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 5 as Ton
needed
BID TOTAL
*ALL PRICES FOB PLANT
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME: M. E. Ruby, Jr., Inc.

ATTACHMENT Page 2 of 2




WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM
ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA027 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: Vulcan Construction Materials, LP

Mailing Address: P. 0. Box 791550
City: San Antonio State:Texas Zip:_78279-1550
Telephone: { 210 ) _524-3500 Fax: (210 ) _524-3555

%ﬁ M Date of BID: __8/2/00

Signature of Person Authorized to Sigflﬂ

Name and Title of Signer: Pat Kerry, Sales Manager
{Please Print or Type)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: Net %__30 days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ 1"all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all” items only. if left blank, low item will apply.)

[ ] low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)

List Additional Limitations if applicable:

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 of 8




BID NUMBER: 01WCA027

WILLIAMSON COUNTY
BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

227

ROAD BASE MATERIALS & AGGREGATE ANNUAL CONTRACT

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN “AS NEEDED" BASIS.

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY BE
MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND THE
COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE SAME

UNIT PRICE.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTyY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
1 Flexible Base, TxDot item 247, 60,000 Ton
Type A, Grade 2, Class 2 NO BID
2 Flexible Base, TxDot ltem 247, as Ton
Type A, Grade 4 needed NO BID
3 1" x 3" Hard Stone, as Ton
TxDot Item 432.3 needed NO BID
4 3" x 5" Hard Stone, as Ton
TxDot Item 432.3 needed NO BID
S 12" Rip Rap, TxDot item 432.3 Ton
NO BID
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as .
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE % RETAINED
15" 0
12" 0-15
g" 10-50
3" 80-100
1" 50-100
6 18" Rip Rap, TxDot ltem 432.3 Ton 0
NO BID
MUST MEET THE FOLLOWING SPECS FOR % as
RETAINED needed
SIEVE SIZE 9% RETAINED
18" 0
15" 20-60
12" 45.80
8" 75-100
6" 80-100
-6" 0-20
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDQOR NAME:

ATTACHMENT Page 1 of 2
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ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# PRICE
7 Crushed Limestone, as Ton NO RID
Base Screenings needed
8 Crushed Limestone, as Ton NO BID
Washed Screenings needed
9 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Ory Screenings needed NO BID
10 Crushed Limestone, as Ton
Fill Material needed NO BID
11 Aggregate, TxDot item 302, 5,000 Ton NO BID
Type B, Grade 3
12 Aggregate, TxDot Item 302, 5,000 Ton NO BID
Type B, Grade 4
13 Aggregate, TxDot ltem 302, as Ton NO BID
Type B, Grade 5 needed
14 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot Item 302, Type PE, Grade 3 needed See Attached
15 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot ltem 302, Type PE, Grade 4 needed See Attached
16 Pre-Coat Aggregate, as Ton
TxDot Item 302, Type PE, Grade 5 needed See Attached
17 11/2" Concrete Aggregate, as Ton NO BID
TxDot ltem 421 needed
18 3" Crushed Base as Ton
needed NO BID
19 | 24" Rip Rap as Ton NO BID
needed
20 | Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 3 as Ton |See Attached
needed
21 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 4 as Ton See Attached
needed
T
22 Aggregate, Trap Rock, Grade 5 gZeded on See Attached
BID TOTAL
ROAD BASE MATERIALS VENDOR NAME:
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Materials Company

August 2, 2000

Williamson County Auditor's Office
Purchasing Department

710 Main Street ~ Suite 303
Georgetown, TX 78626

Attachment to Bid — 01WCAQ27 — Road Base Materials & Aggregate Annual

Contract

Items 14, 15 & 16
Truck Delivery Unit Price/Ton
Grainger $32.80 Ton
Florence $32.80 Ton
Liperty Hill $31.91 Ton
Taylor $31.47 Ton
Unit Weight: 2100 Ibs/cy
Items 20, 21, 22
Truck Delivery Unit Price/Ton
Grainger $27.84 Ton
Florence $26.96 Ton
Liberty Hill $26.24 Ton
Taylor $25.89 Ton
Unit Weight: 2700 Ibs/cy
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