
AGENDA ITEM 15

Consider granting final plat approval to Great Oaksl620 Commercial.

Moved: Commissioner Heiligenstein
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To grant final plat approval to Great Oaksl620 Commercial.
Vote: Motion carried 5 - O.

AGENDA ITEM 16

Consider granting final plat approval to Vista Oaks, Section 5-8, Phase 2.

Moved: Commissioner Heiligenstein
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To grant final plat approval to Vista Oaks, Section. 5-8, Phase 2.
Vote: Motion carried 5 - O.

AGENDA ITEM 17

Consider granting final plat approval to Vista Oaks, Section 5-C.

Moved: Commissioner Heiligenstein
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To grant final plat approval to Vista Oaks, Section 5-C.
Vote: Motion carried 5 - O.

AGENDA ITEM 18

Consider granting final plat approval to Meadows at Chandler Creek, Section 23.

Moved: Commissioner Heiligenstein
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To grant final plat approval to Meadows at Chandler Creek, Section 23.
Vote: Motion carried 5 - O.

Regnlar Agenda

AGENDA ITEM 19

Consider approving preliminary plat for Mustang Creek North, Section II.

Moved: Commissioner Limmer
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To approve preliminary plat for Mustang Creek North, Section II.
Vote: Motion carried 5 - O.

AGENDA ITEM 20

Consider awarding, rejecting or extending various annual bids.

Annual bids for Unified Road System were received in the office of the County Auditor on August 9,
2000 at 3 o'clock p.m.

ASPHALT

Austin Asphalt Company
Capitol Aggregates, Ltd.
Centex Materials LP
Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc.
Eagle Asphalt Products
Koch Materials Company
MSC,lnc.
Performance Grade Asphalt
Vulcan Construction Materials, LP
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9,2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: _-"AI1ST,N ~ COME!!:J..:J _

Mailing Address: --lJJJ "2. V.O l.el&..k.J?J.. (R.r\1uo?1~b'1.:..)~ _
City: -fj",-6 ~ State: --E..- Zip: 1e lU

Telephone: l..iI1::.J --B3'>- /kQ.B . Fax: ( >12 ) 8 3S, 1..c:3;.JC6-=O~__

~midu1ahw-
Slg_ 01 Permn AuIhorlzed to Sign BID

Name and Title of Signer: Mtel14t1l kwa. !lrfC, liktJfM,lr
i (Please PrInt or Typijf

Date of BID: --=S"-j~():;"';:;"()__

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: % days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
r ] "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)
[.If low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
List Additional Limitations if applicable: _

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED. SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY

BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9,2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30,2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN "AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY BE
MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBUGA TED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND THE
COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE SAME
UNIT PRICE.

SPECIFY F.O.B. SITES.

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
1 Black Base, as Ton Jt24~TxDot Item 330, Type A needed J/A

To reach 95% Lab density
2 Asphalt Concrete, 8,000 Ton

~'Z.SU Jt 200,ooo"j.TxDot Item 330, Type C "
To reach 95% Lab density

3 Hot Mix Cold Lay, as Ton
·3S~TxDot Item 334, Type 0 needed AI/II-

To reach 95% Lab density
4 Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base, as Ton

~3)~TxDot Item 334, Type A needed AI/A
To reach 95% Lab density

5 AC-5 as Ton No B,oTxDot Item 300.2 Table 1 needed .

6 Ac-10 as Ton N,8;/>TxDot Item 300.2 Table 1 needed
7 RC-250 10,000 Gal N .• B ..I>

TxDot Item 300.2 Table 4
8 MC-30 as Gal ;/0 8,b

TxDot Item 300.2 Table 5 needed
9 HFRS-2 OR CRS-2, 100,000 Gal No e,l>TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8,

Circle the one YOU are biddina

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT Paoe 10'2
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ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
10 HFRS-2P OR CRS-2P as Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9, needed )/..,t,l>
Circle the one you are biddina

11 SS-1 Emulsion as Gal ,v.; [;,.!>
needed

If
BID TOTAL 2"0 ()PO

ASPHAlT
ATTACHMENT Paae 2 of2
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM F~

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT ~tCOPr
BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 pri

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: C8..j> If 0/ fit? ~ R l:f:' A IN I L h::(------

Mailing Address: r.o. Go", b;{ 30
City:-'lv,sf.:..<.iN.L..- State: Tx zip:?87'~

Telepho e: (:5JJ...) 3r-5 ....3;)..// Fax: (51;2.)3fS~$'.s~S"

rl1/dJ.. .=-...,.--l~ ~~=1J~~h,----------Date of BID: --"-~.L..-(-"'::"::'---

Na
(PI.lilI. Print or Typo)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: /Vof S JD days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ ] "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank. low item will apply.)[ vi10w item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
List Additional Limitations if applicable: _

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 of8
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY

BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

100

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN "AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY
BE MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND
THE COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE
SAME UNIT PRICE.

SPECIFY F.O.S. SITES. RII tn lJ+ettiA Is FtJB fRDtl.lJce,e...1 pll1NtJ SJI:4o, :lS PI; W4
~"7:H 3.

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
1 Black Base, as Ton

~q?§:TxDot Item 330, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density

2 Asphalt Concrete, 8,000 Ton

~q~TxDot Item 330, Type C ~38J00l>To reach 95% Lab density
3 Hot Mix Cold Lay, as Ton

TxDot Item 334, Type D needed 31./ ~To reach 95% Lab density
4 Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base, as Ton

TxDot Item 334, Type A needed lIP BIDTo reach 95% Lab density
5 AC-5 as Ton

HPBIf)TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed
6 Ac-10 as Ton

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed NIB'1)
7 RC-250 10,000 Gal

}II B(!)TxDot Item 300.2, Table 4
8 MC-30 as Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 5 needed /Vp aiD
9 HFRS-2 OR CRS-2, 100,000 Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8, J/p 'ill])
Circle the one you are biddina

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT Page 1 of2
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ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION

# SITE PRICE
10 HFR5-2P OR CR5-2P as Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9, needed /'If) 13\:)Circle the one you are biddina
11 55-1 Emulsion as Gal

~D 'Blj)needed

BID TOTAL

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT Page 2 of2
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9,2000 - 3:00 PM

"CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

IiII007
COPY

1.02

The undersigned, by hlslher algnature, represents that heJahe la authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the tlenn. and conditione of the attached Invlbltlon for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid aheet(a). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the term. therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: __ ~J;.M..!!.i!!=i.lWi;......J,l£- _Centex Materials LP

Mailing Address: __ ---':..=~=..:::.::..::_ _P.O. Box 2252

City: Austin State: Texas Zlp: 78766

Telephone: ( 512 )-r3~2J..7-::'3~~~52"-- Fax: (412 )_..1<32:.J:l6:l-6l.:l5c.1J36~ _

II~w-~ T :;Y Date of BID: --:...8-..:;.1'..:;.0.:...0_"DIIIIlIft'olI':'0lI_~!J='"n'=81D::----------
Mark Hamilton. Vice President - Sales

. IP- PrInt or Typo)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: ° % days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ 1 "ail or none" basis. (\'IIiII accept award of "ail" items only. If left blank, low Item will apply.)
(x] low it~ basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items')asphalt ,
List Additional L1mnatlons if applicable: Please Note' Our-1plant wi 11 pot he in operation

until 1st Quarter of 2001,

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED. SIGNED AND RETURNED WITIi..B.!Q.

Page 6 ot8



08/03/00 07:35 FAX IilI010
••

WILLIAMSON COUNTY

BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

:103

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN "AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY
BE MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY. MINIMUM AMOUNT AND
THE COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE
SAME UNIT PRICE.

SPECIFY F.O.B. SITES.

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
1 Black Base. as Ton

TxDot Item 330, Type A needed 27.00/TTo reach 95% Lab densitY
2 Asphalt Concrete, 8,000 Ton

I TxDot Item 330, Type C
27.00IT 216,000.00I To reach 95% Lab density

3 Hot Mix Cold Lay. as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type 0 needed No BidTo reach 95% Lab densitY

4 Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type A needed No Bid
To reach 95% Lab density

5 AC-5 as Ton
i TxDot Item 300.2. Table 1 needed No Bid I

6 -: Ac-10 as Ton I

No Bid II TxDot Item 300.2. Table 1 needed
7 RC-250 10,000 Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 4 No Bid
8 MC-30 as Gal No BidTxDot Item 300.2, Table 5 needed
9 HFRS-2 OR CRS-2. 100,000 Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8, No Bid
Circle the one yOU are blddlna

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT

VENDOR NAME: Centex Materials, LP
Page 1 of2
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ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# , SITE PRICE
10 HFRS-2P OR CRS-2P as Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9, needed No Bid
Circle the on. vou are blddlnn

11 88-1 Emulsion as Gal
needed I No Bid

I
BID TOTAL 1216,000.00

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT

VENDOR NAME: Centex Materials, LP
Page2of2
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: _..L.:.I..<l>.ll..I:'-Wl.I\IJ.L.AS~~-J2liI.QD:[JCJ)S.....~:"- _CI.EVEI.ANDASPI1ALT PPOI;H1CTS , INC.

Mailing Address: :......:---:..:.:...-;..:....:;.::..... _P.O.BOX 1449

City: SHEPHERD, State: TEXAS Zip:,-,7,-!7..>/.3-L7..L1_

Telephone: (800 ) ----d.3d.3"'4-::..>Ou1'-'7...J..7 Fax: (936 ) --D.6~28~-=-t6>-t6LUO~2 _

~. v1~J4~~.~=",.... Date of BID: ..::8:.!../.:::.8~tO~0=-- _
Signature of Person Authorized to Sign BID

ROBERT r. NOI.AN , SAI.ES MANAGER
(Please Print or Type)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: 2 % 10 days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ ] "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply,)
[ xl low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
List Additional Limitations if applicable: _

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 of 8



• WILLIAMSON COUNTY

BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

106

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN "AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY
BE MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASEANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND
THE COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE
SAME UNIT PRICE.

SPECIFY F.O.B. SITES.

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
1 Black Base, as Ton

TxDot Item 330, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density

2 Asphalt Concrete, 8,000 Ton
TxDot Item 330, Type C
To reach 95% Lab density

3 Hot Mix Cold Lay, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type D needed
To reach 95% Lab density

4 Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density

5 AC-5 as Ton
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed NB

6 Ac-10 as Ton
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed NB

7 RC-250 10,000 Gal
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 4 1 .1123 11.123.00

8 MC-30 as Gal
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 5 needed 1. 012

9 HFRS-2 OR CRS-2, 100,000 Gal
- 0.7132 71,320.00TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8,

Circle the one you are biddina

ASPHALT
ATIACHMENT Page 1 of 2

VENDOR NAME: CLEVELAND ASPHALT 'PRODUCTS, INC.



•

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
10 HFR8-2P OR CR8-2P as Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9, needed $0.9453
Circle the one you are bidding

11 88-1 Emulsion as Gal $0.7132
needed

BID TOTAL

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT Page 2 of2

VENDOR NAME: CLEVELAND ASPHALT PRODUCTS, INC



·WILUAMSONCOUNTY BID FORM

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

1.08

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The underslgnfid,byhis/hersignature. representsJharhe/sheis authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached invitation for Bid; Specifications,· .
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: _EAGLE ASPHALT PROOUcrs

Mailing Address: __ --"--'---'-'---'-.=:...--=--'-"- . _P. O. BOX 9605

City: CORPUS CHRISTI, State: TEXAS Zip:,..:.7..::.84.:..:6..::.9_

Telephone: (361 ) ....:2:.::8:.::.9-....::1:..:..70.::.;7~ Fax: ( 361 ) .::28.::.;9:.....-~78:::::00::::....- _

~!::2t!~::1:::::..- Date of BID: AUGUST 08, 2000

Name and Title of Signer: -----==--=----'-'--'----'='-----'::.::.:;;<:==-::-0===.",------------JOHNIE GOODMAN - SALES
(Please Print or Type)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: 0 % 0 days. (If I1£l discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ ] "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)
[x] low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
List Additional Limitations if applicable: _

-
DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM

WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 of 8



WILLIAMSON COUNTY

. BID SPECIFICATIONS/BIDSHEETS·

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

109

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: ..OCTOBER1,20QOTHRU SEPTEMBER30, 2001 .

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxOOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN "AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY
BE MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND
THE COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE
SAME UNIT PRICE.

SPECIFY F.O.B. SITES.

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
1 Black Base, as Ton

TxDot Item 330, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density NO BID

2 Asphalt Concrete, 8,000 Ton
TxDot Item 330, Type C

NO BIDTo reach 95% Lab density
3 Hot Mix Cold Lay, as Ton

TxDot Item 334, Type D needed
To reach 95% Lab density NO BID-

4 Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density NO BID

5 AC-5 as Ton
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed $197.50 -

6 Ac-10 as Ton
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed $197.50

7 RC-250 10,000 Gal $1.13/GALTxDot Item 300.2, Table 4 ~11,300.00
8 MC-30 as Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 5 needed $1.05/GAL
9 HFRS-2 OR CRS-2, 100,000 Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8, NO BID
Circle the one YOU are blddlna

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT

VENDOR NAME: EAGLE ASPHALT PRODUCTS
Page 1 of2
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. . . .

ITEM . DESCRIPTION F,O.B•.. QTY UNIT UNIT' EXTENSION
# SITE . PRICE .

10 HFR8-2P ORCR8-2P as Gal
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9, needed
Circle the one YOU are biddina NO BID

11 88-1 Emulsion as Gal
'. .

.' .
.. needed· .' .. '

"NO'BID '.',

BID TOTAL

tifIJl'E: PRICES ARE BASFD 00 5,000 GALI1JN HINIlUf LOADS
FIRST 'lW IIXJRS UNf..(W)OO ARE mEE, 'lHEN $4O.00/UR.
IF HEA'I'm LOADS ARE HEIDEn ADD $1.20/1'00 10 PRICE

-

-

ASPHALT
ATIACHMENT

VENDOR NAME: EAGLE ASPHALT PRODUcrs
Page 2 of2
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9,2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: _----'{(oel-! (Y1A-(~~\ALS Lot!1.?ANLl-l/ _

Mailing Address: __ ....l.....L:::::::..::::--=..---!...=--'-'-.=.L.l:l.-'=--_----' _

~~~~~~~=#;~=====::::-------Date of BID: ---"=+-""-+-~ __

Name and Title of Signer: -rt::f:!2 HOLu.et<:- 1fultJlcAL- n1AE,Kf:-Itwtr k?
(Please Print or Type)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: % days. (If no discount is offere~pply.)
[ ] "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low it~
[ ] low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
List Additiona Limitations if applicable:-----.---r---;--------

~ Al~ re ;"" km ......-.

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 ofB



WILLIAMSON COUNTY

BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

112

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN "AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY
BE MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND
THE COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE
SAME UNIT PRICE.

SPECIFY F.O.B. SITES.

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
1 Black Base, as Ton

TxDot Item 330, Type A needed
~~'l>To reach 95% Lab density

2 Asphalt Concrete, 8,000 Ton
TxDot Item 330, Type C

NOf>'DTo reach 95% Lab density
3 Hot Mix Cold Lay, as Ton

TxDot Item 334, Type 0 needed
t\.~-g'DTo reach 95% Lab density

4 Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type A needed

~.~IDTo reach 95% Lab density
5 AC-5 as Ton

rJOl'DTxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed
6 Ac-10 as Ton

No'?>,,)TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed
7 RC-250 10,000 Gal f'lo ~11)TxDot Item 300.2 Table 4
8 MC-30 as Gal

NoD 1),1)TxDot Item 300.2, Table 5 needed
9 HFRS-2 OR CRS-2, Y>o+t- 100,000 Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8, t.IoI'l90
Circle the one you are biddina

ASPHALT
ATIACHMENT Page 1 of2

VENDOR NAME: Koc..J.{ t'ilA-reR.\A-t-S Co.
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:1:13

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
10 HFR5-2P OR CRS-2P ~ as Gal

• Q5'1TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9, needed
Circle the one YOU are biddina •

11 55-1 Emulsion o~ c.~-( as Gal ~.Co.J.90needed

BID TOTAL

ASPHALT
ATIACHMENT Page 2 of2

VENDOR NAME: Kou-f: (Y1k1£R IAL'S to.
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

114

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9,2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undensigned, by hialher signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: ft1 C S , IN <:. .

Mailing Address: PD B.ox 2.~ _

City: ~ th'u.., State: 1y Zip: 7S10k

Telephone: <..:l1bJ V'r /. 7Lf7'{ Fax: (0/72) v=t'. b"2-7..+

~.: I . Data 01 BID' • ..a{q /00
Name and Title of Signer: ::IOtttJ /L. ttt\R~(S tics tnvs~r.:.:/J::iC.=~~t _

(PillflM PrInt or Type)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: "2.- % (0 days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ ] "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)
[ ] low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
List Additional Limitations if applicable: _

DO NOT SIGN OR §YBMIT THI§ FORM
WITHOUT READING ENJ1RE DQCYMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE CQMPLETED, SIQNED AND RETURNED WITH WQ
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY

BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCAOO2 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9,2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

AU. ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

AU. ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

AU. ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN ·AS NEEDED" BASIS.

AU. QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ~SDMATEDQUMIDDU. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY
BE MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND
THE COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE
SAME UNIT PRICE.

speCiFy FrOrB. SITE§.

>

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
1 Black Base, as Ton

TxDot Item 330, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density

2 Aspha1t Concrete, 8,000 Ton
TxDot Item 330, Type C
To reach 95% Lab density

3 Hot Mix CoIcI Lay, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type 0 needed
To reach 95% Lab densitY

4 Hot Mix CoIcI Lay Black Base, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density

5 AC-5 as Ton
TxDot Item 300.2 Table 1 needed

6 Ac-10 as Ton
TxDot Item 300.2 Table 1 needed

7 Rc-250 10,000 Gal ~
TxDot Item 300.2 Table 4 Al.'1N-l1I' os

8 MC-30 as Gal
TxDot Item 300.2 Table 5 needed

9 HFR8-2 OR CR5-2, 100,000 Gal ~ ,.,.--"'"
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8, If
Circle the one YOU are blddlna

2/11
>

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT

VENDOR NAME: IIA CS I .J;... ( ,
Page 1 of 1
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ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION.. SITE PRICEW10 HFR8-2P OR CR8-2P as Gal
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9, needed ~1f1"Ij

Circle the one vou are blddlna ,£1'0
11 S8-1 Emulaion as Gal ~IE'~ ~

needed 1St

BID TOTAL

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT Page2of2

VENDOR NAME: M [.. ~, y'" (.,
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M
C
S
Inc. e

$MOLECULAR COATING SPECIALIST, INC c

August 7, 2000

Williamson County Auditor's Office
AIIn: Ginny Atkinson- Purchasing
710 Main St. - Suite 303
Georgetown, TX 78626

Dear GiDDy Atkinson,

Thank you for the opportunity to provide our bid for the WjJJiamson County's requirements
for Asphalt Emulsions. MCS has a long history of providing related products and technical
service to many counties in Texas.

Enclosed you will find the MCS response to your bid nwnber 01WCAOO2. MCS, Inc. does
not manufacture state spec emulsions, rather we manufacture specialty emulsions for
specialU,ed road building applications. I .... providiD& 4 alternate products for bid in
our raponse .. coat effective alternative to spee products. Enclosed you will find
pricing, product descriptions, spec sheets and material safety data sheets on the following
products:

Cape Over Seal (Fog sealIFinal seal for Chip Seal Roads)
MC8-6OOC (Prime Sealer and Dust Control)
~ (Base Stabilizer)
ARE-68 (Asphalt Recycling Agent)

These products are specialized asphall emulsions designed 10 outperform slale spec,
general use emulsions as outlined in your bid. We would like to discuss the particulars of
each of the products further.

We are pleased to have this opportunity to present to you the MCS family of
enviromnenta11y friendly asphalt emulsions.

Please let me know if I can provide you with any additional information.

Regards,

Jobn K.1IaniI
Vice President
MCS, Inc.

P.O. BOX 2439 CEDAR HILL. TEXAS 75106 PHONE 972 291 7474 FAX 972291 6224
1001 MT. LEBffiON ROAD CEDAR HlU, TEXAS 75104

"EARTH FRIENDLY PRODUCTS"



Summary of MCS Products Alternate Bid
Bid # 01WCAOO2

Price/gallon
(Delivered)

Price/gallon
(Diluted for use)

Cape Over Seal 51.55 51.55

MCSo'OOC 5U5 5.26 (as PRIME SEAL)
(Prime Sealer and Dust Control) $.14 (as DUST CONTROL)

ABS-6S 51.52 $.76
(Base Stabilizer)

~ 51.56 5.78
(Asphalt Recycling Agent)

All Prices are FOB your county.
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• CAPE OVER SEAL

fNTI!lR.UCTION

CAPE OYER SE4L is a specialized emulsion that is a preventive maintenance product for seal
coat roads. CAPE OYER SEAL has an easy spray on application. that can be also used on low
speed roeds IIlId parking lots. CAPE OYER SE4L can also be used as a sealer over R..A.P. to
stop rock loss, IIlId to turn the road black. CAPE OYER SEAL will help stop citizen comp1aints
couc:eming rocks hitting their c:ars.

• Pays for itsclfby saving rock
• Incrcascs safety by loc:king lose rock into plac:c
• Cements the top ofroclt together
• Seal c:rac:ks with cross linking copolymer rubber asphah
• Provides ultraviolet protection to the road surfilcc
• Provides a black. quick-drying surface
• Easy application with distributor truck
• Sprays on Iikc a fog seal
• Dries fist
• Increased road life
• Low cost application rate
• Stops the build up of rocks on the side of the road

1. Allows final chip seal emulsion IIlId rock to set rapidly.
2. WOrtha distributor truck, spray CAPE OYER SE4L at a rate of .12 - .18 gallons per sq.

yd. inorder to coat IIlId intcr-\oc:k rock surfilcc together.
3. Traffic can be turned back on to the road in 30 miD. to 1 hr.
4. Clean pump of distributor with water.

YOU SIMPLY WON'T FIND A TOUGHER. MORE DURABLE ASPHALT
SEALER THAN CAPE OVER SEAL

MOLECULAR COATING SPECLUJST.IR.
roO. IOX209CE1WlHILL,TX75IN t7ZUI 741. fAXt7ZUliUC~_ -
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CAPE SEAL

spec Sheet

(MCS product name: Cape Seal)

'I1Us Spoc ia.Performance Spocificalion li>r CAPESEAL or.pre-<lpproved equal product to be IlIlld u. 00301coat rod< iII1aIockiaa ......

Tba poacIaot ...... be~ of. poInIIeum ..... oil hue with IIOIectiw pmctraIion 0IIddry _II to li>rm u_ -.I iJr -.I coat JOCk.

Spocifiea!ioa
D -. ti.

Spoc
TultMotbod

~
VIIOOIily S.F. a1'17"F sac ASTMD~

Brown Liquid
10 180mia _

Rooid ... % mia (I) ASTM 0 ~ (1IIOd)

ASTMD~(mod)

ASTMD5

41 66

Miaojbilily Tat (2)

P alion@77c1ollflO"B U _

"--wt.%

VoIaliIo%

% Nm-wIaliIo
SoIubIo ia Trioh1ondJylcae

40 mI AoooIonlod
WoolboriDa (2 ,.,_)

No coapIalioa

o u

52_

34 .......

T.4'-S6
ASSIfTO 1-

millNo-w
1 2 icnIiaa aftw-R....... to wiDcl

DriWDIlaiD (@ 91 .. ph)

AIb%wt.

TTCo555 B
FedmlSpoc

1-

_Qorp&v .......
MatlKllilY porlida a1limo of bid
F..... TOIl (e ' IIIIld Form)
SiowlT_

Oil'*" Siowl Tat· CoIcI W_ Dilulioa
StabilityTat (4 ..... _1Il
I pori Capo Seal) Max % 1140 Siowl

Shabr Tat 2-4 Jus. (diIu1od 4 ..... _ to
I pori Capo Seal)
Mix BomlI Wriot Aclion Sbabr
McldoI7S _ .. Lewl7, _ ~ SiowlIl4O

ASTMD444-60

I~ ....

I~-

(I) ASTM 0244 Modiliod t__alion Tat iJrJlll'COllfofrcaiduo is ..... by IlaaIiag SO..- .... 1Il3OO"FIIIIliI
fiJamiaa _ tbeD 0001 ;.. -'ialOly ODd caIoJdabo .......

(2) Tat pnlOOIIun idea ...... with ASTM ~. Olll:Opllbat .02 Normal Ca1<ium Chloride ao1lIIioa ...... be IlIlld ia P- ofdiIliIIed _.

(I) Tba Capo SeaI-w ..l1li ...... ..........,. ia-pIaoo IIOn'ice u an AapbaIt Prime iJr .............. o(3)eOn with City... e-ay or
Sluo _ .... Raad Oopl.

(2) Ma=iaI of.lxml opooifiea!ioa .. l1li be appnMld li>r ... liom Texas Jiiabway 00paJ1me0t

(3) Ma=iaI .. l1li be. CoIcI Flow SlabiJiood Product.

(4) v......._ pnMdo ........ 5,000 aaJ. Slorap 00IIlaiMr.
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MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET
REV. DATE 9130199

QUICK .... iDiA: JlQADBUlLDINGDoIULSlON
IlANWA£TIaD'I_ WlUClJLAIlCOA11NOSPIlCIALJSTS.INC.(MC.• )
.... ··ICIDllll'.U8ANCNRD.

C1ID.IUau. 1X ?SIlM
DlDCac:YU_ TILII'HOIlaIftlMUll, (972)29}.1414
cmID __ CAlUo (912)291·1414

UC'IIONI • mlN'lDY

___ ~, cos (CapeO¥cr Seal)
c.A.L IftIMUlI, NQNIl, WIXI\JU
C'JfW'CIlU>L"""" &U.IIFIID AlIPHALT
QlD'lCAL.-.Y, tEI'IlOLIlIlWlIYDIlOCARJlON
_ .... VAllWll.llWIXI\JU

JIIUlICIPAL H,ZdDOt1l COIlCPONINTS lMt
(O'F\crAL Ac:.u.o.ION NAMES)

IlllNIlIQlOWN

THUSHOU> UMrr VAUJlt
(UNITS)

IIC'TION'· PftYSlCAL" CHDIlCALCIWIACTIIlDI'IC

-..a_ 212D&1l'. anancGIIAvrrYtH»I.CIl)' ..... I.03V_,._._),N/D V_~(AIR@lI),>1
'~l'Ol.UIL&.Yl'OUI>D, 30·" aYAP.....U(1DO.1.C10)'1...........ca __ LOW VISCOIrI'Y. SMOOTIIIlROWN IJQUID. sumrr PIlTROLIlUM 0ll0Il

IIC'TION'· no ANDIlXPLOSION

IL\III_ IlIAINIlIdIJI.SlONSTA11l AI/IOIIll'lII'IONTIMP: iliA
n·"'U"·IAII!'IINAIIl.,.n"VOLUMI: LOWIR:WA UPPJR: MIA__ ~INIlUIJL8IONSTA11l

.,..,... IN ....... T VAD- JWAU. FlUS USB DRY CHBMlCAL. C02. HALON. WA1'ER.SPRAY (It. STANDARD FOAM. LARGE FIIlES USi
WA11lRIIPIlAY. RlCI ca ITANWlD FOAM (Ill17llWEROENCY RBsI'ONSIl 0IllIlIIIKX*. o.o.T. _'OUIDE NO. %7)

IPIQU,nu __ ...... n· ~ 1N1iloIULS1ON6l'Am-NO'n. IN MrtIt' t nAU; N)VI VISSEL PILOMFIRE AliA IJf YOUCAN IX) IT wmIOUT IUS COOLCONTAINERS
11IAT AIIlIiXl'QlliDTOFUhlBSWl'lHWA'I1IIlJlllQN11IIi SDlE UNI'IL WBLLAFI1lR11IIi FDIlISOUf. STAYAWAYJlIlQNI1NDSOFTANI.:
RlIl WAIlIIVIl FDIlIN CMlIO AIlIiA, USB UIlWANNIlIl HOSIl HOI.DIlR ca Io«lIIITOIl NOZZUl8' IF 11lIlI1S IlolI'aISIIlUl, Wl'lllDRAW FIlOId
AIIlAANDIEr FDIlIlUllN. wmatAW 1WNIlIlIA11lLY IN CAIIl OF IlSlNClIIOIlIlDJlIlQN VIlNl'INO IAnTYmMCIl OR ANY
DII"n.OIlA11ONCJIITANlCDUIl TOPlIUI.(lllI7ll101ER01lNCYRIlII'ONII! almE!lOQK, D.O.T. _.GllID8 NO. %7)

UCTION' ·IH\'IICAL IIAZAIUIII

MATlallALIIo ITAlILE_10 .._ IlllNIl
1IOCOMP"1DIUYYCMA11IIIIALI1O .. wam> NONE
BAI·.MUll'OLnu:aI'l.&1'IOIf ....... HOTOCCVR

IIC'TION'. H&AL11I11AZA1U111

~
l

i1i-I -------------

QID'ICAL UlTlDAlICAIIQNIIG&N OR I'OT&NI1ALCAIlCINOGIN.
AlftW.T nen !S!ON311ADNQIMIN RMilDQADQ MIlO§3!8' F CApCIN!XJIM. pepPI SUM .yptW.tWCIJLD BEA:S Fa.LOWS:

IlAT.1OXICOWGY_'" NO
OSHA YI!S
I.AJI,C. 0UNIE11lRMINIlD

01XPlNlA1JllN' IARC MONOOIlAPIIS ·lAN. 1\115.11IIi llnlDY INDlCAlES nlERE III SumctENTBVIIlIINCE FORCARCINllQIlllIC IN
AIlDlAI.I new BJlIlQIUIi to BXmAC11ll1' S1liAW-REFINIlD Il1TIMIlNS. A1R-ItEFINIlIlBmlIolIlIlI AND
WIXIUUS OF STBAMoIlIiFlN&DANDAIR-IlBFlNIlD 1lI1tlWBNS. DUll TO INADIlQUAlE EVIIlIlNCI! INIIIJMANS, Bur sumclENT EVIIlIlNCI!
D1-...1IlTUMIiJl1S CONSIIlIlIUlDBY OIIlAAS IF rrPRE&Nn A CARCINOGENICRISK TO IM.IANS. nlERE IS INAIlE(lUAlE
EVIIlIlNCI! 11IAT BmlMIlNS ALONIlAIUlCA&CIIlOO&NIC TO HIlloIANS,
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MCS600-C
PRIME SEAL I DUST CONTROL

INTRODUCTIQN

MCS6IHJ.C D a cationic modified petroleum resin and asphah emulsion to be used as a prime or
a dust control agent. InMCS6IHJ.C 's concentrated form, it D mixed with water at a rate of one
piIrl MCS6IHJ.C to (four to twelve) parts water, then sprayed on soil or road base materials.

• Cuts maintenance on unimproved dirt or gravel roads
• Adds density to stabilize the road
• Helps reduce wet weather damage
• Crowns in the road remain intact
• Fewer potholes
• Reduces loss of fines on the road
• Reduces wash board effect
• Cost effective
• Easy to use
• Stops citizens complaints on dust
• Storage stable
• Environmentally friendly

1. Rate of application .15 to .25 diluted gallons per square yard.
2. Prime: Dilute 1 part MCS6IHJ.C to 6 parts water.
3. Dust Control: Dilute 1 part MCS6IHJ.Cto 6-12 parts water.
4. Spray at ambient temperature.
S. Apply with water truck or distributor.
6. Use a bladC to reshape the road for longer life stability.
7. Crown the road for good water drainage.
8. Compact treated road for maximum stabilization.

ENVIRONMENTALLY SAFE FOR PRIME AND DUST CONTROL

MOLECllLAR COATING SPECWJST, lac.
• .0. lOX 24Jt CEDAR HilL. 'IX 75116 m2917414 'AX m29162J4

c:....--. ........a.... ....



123
MCS600-C
Spec Sheet

Prime and Road Sealer

This Spec is. ~ Spooilicatim liJr MCS6OO-C or. -..pprtMld equal product to be ullOd u. Prime ..... Road Sealer.

Tbe pn>duc:t ...... be of. poInlIoum of ..... oil _ with ooIooIiw JIOIlClrOlion ..... dry -"'''' bmu... _. lad p • """ Lab
Coaq.' ._ todIiI Spec be iDoIudod in dIiI bid. Fail ... to do ..... wiD be COIIIidend u.....__ bid.

SpaoifioaIioa
On· .......

Spoo

TukMothod

V-.ity S.F... 77"F Sac ASTM 0244-60
B""", Uquid
IS 200IlIiD _

Ronid ... % IlIiD (I) ASTM 0 244-60 (mod)

ASTM 0 244-60 (mod)

S6

No -.uJaIioa

"'-
3SIlIiD.

40"" 'ad
W.........(2,..-_)

T.4SoS6
ASSHTO

TTC.SSSB
Fodoral Spec

Reejstenc:e to wiad
on- R.iD (@98111pb)

TTC.SSS B
Fodera! Spoo

IDiII No IDaIIriaI
• J ioaii1iw ....-1DiII-wi. pia

1'IrlioIn CIaarp '" Voador
N... aoIify pnnlioIo ...... of bid
F_ T_ (e '04Ilol F_)
SiawTc

IliIalad Siaw Toni. Cold W_ Dilutim
SInbiIiIy T_ (4palla _ to
I pari Road Sealer) Max % f40 Siowl

SbabrTonI2 ........ (_ 4 palla _ to
I pari Road_)
Mix IIunIII Wrill AoIioD Sbabr
NodaI1S _ .. LowI1, _ % Siowl f40

ASTM 0 444-60

1%_

(1) ASTM 0244 Nodiliod E-aoa Tonib:~ ofrenid .. isJIIado by b.liDa 5O...... .-pIeto 3OO"F 1IIIIiI
lilaIDiJIa _ tboa cool iauDedia1oIy ..... oaIcu1nle ........

(2) ToniJlI'lCOliun idcalioal with ASTM 0244-60, elO:OpI that .02 Nonnal CaIci ... Cblorido noluIioa nhaIl be uIIOd in ..... ofcIiIliIIod _.

(I) Tbo Road _1DaIIriaI ..... baw. naIi.-.,. .............. uaD AJpbaIt Priolo liJr • .mai ..... oC3,.... with City... CauaIy ...am.__ Road Dope. .... OC ..... 1ocalioa nod taL pboao ..... be iDoIudod in IbiI bid.

(2) MaIoriaI oCaIxMl spooiIioatim be "PIJl'O"Od liJr ... liom T.... 1lipway Dnpar1JnoDt

(3) MaIoriaI be. Cold Flow bjlp..! Product.

(4) V pnwido.1lIiD. S,OOO pl. SlonBc coa..u..
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MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET
lEV. DATE 9130199

_UPACnIaD'I _., _ "C'1Ull~TIIlOSI'Ilt'IAIJSTS.INC.(M.cs.)"'W.• 11It.LDANCltaD.
CllDAkIllU., TX 75104

.IIIDGIIItCY'M'" m•.,....JIIUM'" (9n) 191..1414__ 1X*t"AUI< 1972):lf1.""

HCl'DN I ..1D1N11n'

'IlIaUHOLD LlMrrVAUJI
(Ullm)

IIICTIllN 4· P" AND IoXPIAlUON

__ II'AIH_'_ITAlIl _JOIlImDNTUlP, ""A
hAM •• N'......... "'nVOUl..... LOWDI MiA UPI'D: MfA___ --...uINEMIILIIOlsrAm
-. IN6IP!W.TI"m -._lIIIlIIRVQENJCAL, aJl. _ WATIiIlSPllAVORsrANlWlDfQo\M.IAIlCIE _lIIIl WATIiIlSI'llAV.
RlOc:AIT_lOlMlI.,......-IIIlSI'QiIEOl~no.T. l'5IOll.40U1DENtl 27)
IIPIClo\I.nI&_~ ~INEMIILIIOlsrATE.
.JIOTP 1"" TIUlJ: WOVEVElllLncN FlU AaIA IP YOJ CANDOn wmtOU1' Rl& CXX1CQ1fAINEIS nlAT AU E:XPCJIEI)lOfLANES
WII1IWATIiIl_1IESIIlEUNIILWIILL_1IE flllEISOlIf. ITAVAWAVfIllN_aT-. __ fW! INQlIlOO_lIIIl
\NMlNII)_II£J,I)Dc:AMONI1CANtlZlUlI;1P11U IIIMPC11S1l1L1l,WI1lIlllAWfIllNAUAANDl.Ill'flllEJllIlH. WI1lIlllAW_1IlL v
INCAaa VIlNrINOWIlI'YDEVlCEORANYDIIlXlLQR"''nllNaTANKllU!toflllB. 1__ lIiNCY_
(J II 41i1'X1[D.QT•.-AlUIl6llQ. 27)

*-..ITABU;
CGII_toAVOIt: IllNl
INCllIIIIPA'IIIILIIY (MA-" to A_~ tOll!__ fQl.__ 'IWlUoI NlJI'OCCI&

1&C1ION' ·1l1AL1'HIInAaDS
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ABS-65
ASPHALT BASE STABILIZER

POLYMERIC ASPHALT SOIL CEMENTING PRODUCT

A BUS is a polymer modified aspbah emulsion used as a soU stabUizer. It is mixed at a lite of
one part ABS-6S to one or more parts water (depending on the per cent of moisture in the road
bllsc) then incorporated with native soU on bllsc type materials fur soU stabilization process.
A~S is used instead ofbauling in base material or using lime or soU cement.

• Reduces road-building costs 50% or more
• Makes the road. last longer
• Reduces potholes in the road
• Reduccs CI1lCk-in the road
• Increases road life while lowering overall maintenance costs
• Easy to apply
• Reduces coDStruc:tion time 40 to 60 percent
• Leaves the road open to traffic
• Encapsulates the road base from water or oU penetration
• Cost effective way to stabilize the road base
• EnYiromnentally Friendly-Meets E,U., I.N,R,C,C, Regulations

Council ofGovemments Spec, ITEM 4,8,
TXDOT ITEM 314

~

Blade or mill the road besc to a depth of 6 inches (8 inches where heavy load-bearing
strength is needed).
Apply diluted ABS-6S to the road besc; incorpollte it with the mixer machine aDd blade.
Rc-apply diluted ABS-6S aDd mix with the mixer machine aDd blade a second time.
Start laying down the road. base in 2-inch lifts aDd compact with a sbcepfoot, lUbber tire aDd
flat wheel vibrating colllpllCtor.
Do final blading to shape the road aDd finish rolling with a steel roller.
A mixture of I partAB$-6S to 2,5 parts water can be sprayed on top oCthe road for a fog
seal prime.
Let the bllsc cure for 48 bolD'S before placing a tinaI riding surface of seaI-coat, aspbah or
concrete.

YOU CAN NOT BUY A MORE COST EFFECTIVE STABILIZER

cX"J
Ck!P

MOUCULAR COATING SPECWJST, be.
roO. lOX J4» CEDAIl HILL. TX 151M ft, m Zt174'14 PAXm ZtIQUc.....- .... _a.-. .........
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, ·1 'ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR STABILIZING ROADBASE MATERIALS

SOIL AND BASE STABILIZER

this Spec is a performance Specification for ASS 65 or a pre-approved equal product to be
used as a Soil Stabilizer.

SPECIFICATIONS

Specification Designation Task Method Requirements
Brown Uquid

Appearance 25 175
VISCOSity S.F. at nOF See ASTM D 244-60 min max

Residue, 'lbminCl' ASTM D-244-60(mod) 50 68
min max

Miscibility Test'" ASTM D244-60(mod) 'No coagulation

Moisture. wt. % 70max

Volatile % 25min

%Non-Volatile T.45-56
Soluble in Trichlorethyene ASSHTO Min 8max

40 ml AcceIenIted TTe-5558 Minimum no material
Weathering (2 year exposure) Federal Spec deterioration after exposure

Resistance to wind TTe-5558 Minimum passeslno wt gain
Driven rain 0 98 mph Federal Spec

ASH%wt 8max
PoIymer%wt 4max

Particle Charge ASTM D 444-60 Positive

Flash Point Tee 250°F
Freeze Test (Concentrated 3-Cycle Pass
Form)

(1) ASTM 0244 Mocitled EVIIpCllllloli Tatro, peIIlIl1lof 18 by ~ 50 grwn __ lll3lXl'F unliI
*-'*V_.,*,llllllI~"i "I tjn ,

The Soil & e... S1lIbizW "....1llUlIl_. allafac1lll, 1n-pIace ., AaphaIt Soil & e... S77' for ..........
013,.... wIlh CIty ... Countr ... a-......,.,.o1aI RoadDapl. R 01auch location n' .rl illi.1llUlIl be IncIudacIIn
Ilia bid.

MOLECULAR COATING SPECIALIST, lac.
P.o.BOX2439CEDARIIILL,TX75116""721'17474 ''''''721'16224-.... .................. -
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MATBRlAL SAFETY DATA SHEET
REV. DATE 9130199

QUICK .... iDiiA: ROADJUD.DINODAUION
_~ __ IC'.LAallClo\'IlNOSI'IlCIALISTS, DIe. (MC.•.)
•..... '.Uft'.LII ..NQNID.

C1lDAllIIILI. 'IX 7$ICN
'M'PO"PICY3' Jam .... NUIlDIIt: em> 291·)1.,..01HR __ CAIU: (m)29I.'J4'M

___ -.- AJlS.65
c.u._ NCllLIoIIX'I\IIlII
nrpcrt' ...... .....-mDAlPHALT
ngyr4' fAMILY: JIB'l"atI.I1JW HYI»tOCARBON
-.a: YMWlUlWlX1tllll

'I1IUSHOUl LIMIT Yo\UlK
(UNITS)

-..u_ 2121l1lO.'. II'ICDICGllAvrrY(1l21HOO~.t7. Ull
Y_ps_IU<-HO~ HID V_~(AIR.I~ >1
1'DCIN'f~.y~ 30·41 IlVAP.llAft(HlO-I.00): I
AWIIAIlA1'IC&ANDOIIO&: LOW VIIOClIIIT r.IUOOTIlBlOWN LIQUID, lILIGIlfl'lmtlXJ!llW OOOR

DCJ1ON" nuAND &XPI.OSION

'L\lIInOINr: NlAINDGUVlllSTAlIl AvroIGNlTlDNTDIP: llIA
n ..MM· .. ·aaara.. Aa_aYVOWIII: LOWD: NlA 1JPPI1l: HlA__ ~lNllWULSICNSTAlIl

..... IN ..... j! lEAD" 1MALL .... 1JIBDRY c::IIBMICAL. 002" HALON. WA'l'llLSPltAY OR ITANDMDJIOAW. LAIOIiJlDtlS usa
WA1IIa II'IlA1. JlOlI OR STAIlDAIlD JIlWl (\\11'1 &lIIalIIINCl1lBSPONSll QUIT .. 8'XX, \).0.T. _4C1U11l1l No. 27)

1PIaAL __ .... III'IUIo ~1NDM.8lONSTAm
-NOTI- IN M""!! IhTI: WOVI VIIIEL PIlOt.e PIlI ADA IF YOU CAN DO rrWI11lOUT I1IX. axx. OONTAIHIItS
rHAT AUEXI'CIIlD toFl.ANllll WITIIWA1IlIlflQd TIlE SIIlIl UNTILWBLLAFI1lIlTIlEFIIIlIS ClUI'. STAYAWAYflQdJ)lllS OFTAJlIC.
POR WAISIVIl FIIIl DlCAIlOOAIlBA, lllIIl UNMANNED IIOSB HCUlIlR ORWONITClll NOZZUlS. IF 1IIIS IS IWPOlIImUl, wrnGlRAW fIQd
AUAANDL8Tnu 1lUIlN. wrnGlRAW _TIlLY INCAlIII OFIlISDlGSOlJNI)fIQd VIDlTINCISAPST'Y CBVICBORANY
D'SC!C! "'ATVlII OF TANK DUll to 1'lII\.(I\II'IIlMDOIDlCY IlIISPCNSIl _ .. BN'*. 0.0.T. _4C1U11l1l No. 27)

MATIlIIIAL'" STAIlUl
~1OA_1IlHl
_.dIEIJY(MA'D8IALI104vom~ IlONIl.tZ·.... ~WII.oLl NOTOCCUJl

nmcrt' Ull'lDAI~oaPOTlN11ALCAIlCINOOBN.
AlBW,TNp 'D" IlADIPtJI5!N1JMIJTIQADiD ASDe" cyrnKXlJiNZ5 "7!R f1N AmW,IWOULDBiItJ JICU.OWS:

NAT.1QXICOLOGYJIIOGP4V NO_ YlIS

I.A&C. 0UNIlIl1'EIlWIN

.1XPL\IIA11IlII: WlC NONOQRAPIlI.lAII. I"'· TIlE snJDY 1NDICA1IlS'Ol&RIi IS SUWICIIlNI' BVlIlINCIl fllIlCAllClNOCllDllC Dl
ANIWALS fIQd&XJ1OlUlllltollXTlACTS OF S1'JlAW.IIlPINB BITUMIlIII, AJR.&EFIIlIlDB11'UWiNlI AND
NIXI1lID CI' S1'JlAW.IIlPINB AND AIUlIlPINIlD 1lmlloIBNlI. DUll 'Il) INAllIlQUATi EVIIlBNCB DlIlllW.Nll, BUT S\JllIllCI\!N\' BVIllEIlCIl
Dl-.a.1II'I1lWBIl1S CONIIIlIlIIlIl BY0lIIfA M IF IT I'RIWIN'B A CAIlCINOOIlNICRISKto 1lUWAIlII. 'Ol&RIi IS 1NAllIlQUA1Il
BVItIlNCII rHAT III'I1lWBIlS AI.cNII AU CABCI\lOCIIDlIC 'Il) IlUWAIlII.
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• ARE-68
ASPHALT RECYCLING EMULSION

!l!11lJJRJlQ1Jl

ARE-6I is a specialized enmlsion recycling agent designed to restore old asphah to like new or
superior properties. YOID'street department will be able to save money by recycling and
rebuilding the old asphah.

• Cuts road building time
• Saves money with recycling
• Saves IUllIling in raw material
• Cuts labor cost
• Builds stronger road base and parking lots
• Builds flexible road base
• Rejuvenates, stabilized, cements, &: waterproofS
• Environmentally friendly
• Restores base integrity
• Increases load bearing strength
• Makes roads last longer
• Use old asphah in place of recycling

d/lUCd110N

1. Blade or mill the asphah surfiu:e to a depth of 6 inches (8 inches where hca"Y load-bearing
strength is needed).

2. Apply dilutedARE-61 to the asphah surface; incorporate it with the mixer machine and
blade.

3. Re-apply diluted ARE-68 and mix with the mixer machine and blade a second time.
4. Start laying down the road base in 2-inch lifts and compects with a sheepfoot, nabber tire

and flat wheel vibrating coDl)lllCtor.
5. Do final blading to sbape the road and finish rolling with a steel roller.
6. A mixture of Ipart ARE-6I to 2-5 parts water can be sprayed on top of the road for a fog

seal prime.
7. Let the base cure for 48 holD'S before placing a final riding surface of seaI-coat, asphah or

concrete.

BUILDS A STRONGER MORE COST EmCIENT ROAD

MOLECULAR COATING SPJ:CIALJST,1ac.
,.0. lOX JOt CIIWl RILL, TX 151M ft.m 2917414 FAXm 2916224

c.IIIII ....... ~ ...... -



ARE-68
SPECIFICATION FOR

ASPHALT RECYUNG AGENT I
Tbe [mul.lan is d .lliled to be • nM:yCIing IIlIIIftlto be miud at ambient 18m.........
wIIh ........ lii .................. native Of' •• I.1:tiw IIIIDriaI ant Of' RlIqcIed Asphalt
......... (RAP.) m.1.JtaL T1Iis pnMIuct wII be. __ misclbll_1IIon.

.... ..................... • I I ••••••••••

JEST ON fMlLIIOtf
ViI( .., 8QbaI FlInII0122F........
Pw1icll ea-ge
SpecIIc GmIIIr 0T1 F.
C..iiiIl MbdIII Test Z4U3 (ASTM)

1U
1.0

.810 1.11
P Ing

10 II

JEST ON.!QUE FROM nmD ' eJ1QN
...... lIIlicir.. 77F. EIdrapoIation function
II...... ,., ..
Rillns, .wt.
CycIic:s.....-
FIaIh PoInt c.o.c. ........ F.

1400
3.1 1G.1
1.2 U

lII.O 1&.0
U 1U
400F.- •......

AIpbaIlIne, ResIns, c,cucs, ---- COIIIInt must be specIIic:aIIf formuIaIId ...- on
laboiillWJ ..... 011uIlIIing IIIIDriaI in .. llIIIonlO nIj..-.ation ....... ant any added
RAP.a I riaL

LaboIabN' ..... wII be .... 011 _ .... to be _,cIId. Apple_.- 011 .... _,cIng
....... must be 1.'"mllle1 br labtIst and W- II. _ ~ -.fCII job. Lab tIst_ .. beconIe""""'" 011 DIipII 8uppllr 11111111
......... lon ......... lPP. ' .. 011 pnMIucI. ftICIll •• 1I1 br DIpII.........
lupplilr must fUmIIh All costa for ,.lIIng ant ion wnl be paid br
suppU.r. lupp .. r fUmiIh oIIlabtlst tala at 0II11iddi111for ....
-rcInI 1 I 110 Attimeollbiddinglupplilr .... fUmIIh.1isI
with _ and pI-. 0II 1ci1s --1IIIIII'OftI 0II11ds pnMlucllla
...... obIained ant who can WIllY Ifado,.., _.... UIIIwIu .. 1IlIcrlbing .... pnMIuct
m_ be included at time 011 bidding.

FOR INFORMATION RELATIVE TO MATERIAL CONTACT:
1f.C.S. P.O.Box 2431 Cedar HUt, T_ 711l1W43t (172)281·7474
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MATI!lUAL SAFETY DATA SHEET
REV. DATE 9130199

OWCK.DI'IU'IU: lCMD·mmn ·' ....
IWIIUI .............. a: CDG1NOIPSCIALTIES.1NC. (M.C.S.)
._ ..•• Mr••RANCH

_IIU., 1X,,104
DlIaGGCYU_ 'ft' ... ONI...... (972)291-"'"__ 1IIIIlCAlUl9m __

IICIIDN I--.no

IIC1'IONJ ..WC'IDI&N'n

'I1IUIIIOLD....,rrVAWI
(UIlITS)

IICIIDN S- PHYllCALIlAIO.1II

IICI'ION' ..1I&AL1II HAZAR.
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMB~R 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fully comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: Performance Grade Asphalt

Mailing Address: P•o. Box 757

City:La Marque State: TX Zip: 77568

Telephone: '7''f-r1f-7I'''-'''-''-'=...!....!C3..\l----- Fax: (409 ) ......::t9.u.86o.-71-l;9L:lS..uO _

==:-±:~~~~7:-:-=-::=:------------Date of BID: _8_-_9_-_00 _
Signature

Name and Title of Signer: Ron Crowder Pres j dent
i.; (Please Print or Type)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: % days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
[ ] "all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)
~x] low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or all" items.)
List Additional Limitations if applicable: _

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 of 8
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WILLIAMSON COUNTY

BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9,2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN "AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY
BE MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND
THE COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE
SAME UNIT PRICE.

SPECIFY F.O.B. SITES.

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
1 Black Base, as Ton

TxDot Item 330, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density

2 Asphalt Concrete, 8,000 Ton
TxDot Item 330, Type C
To reach 95% Lab density

3 Hot Mix Cold Lay, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type D needed
To reach 95% Lab density

4 Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density

5 AC-5 as Ton
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed

6 Ac-10 as Ton
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed .895

7 RC-250 10,000 Gal
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 4

8 Me-30 as Gal
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 5 needed

9 IIFRS-2 OR<"'C'RS-2 ~ 100,000 Gal
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8, .715 $71,500.00
Circle the one you are bidding

ASPHALT
ATIACHMENT

YENDORNAME: Performance Grade Asphalt
Page 1 of 2
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,

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B. QTY UNIT UNIT EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
10 HFRS 2P OR lCRS-2P ./ as Gal

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9, needed .85
Circle the one you are bidding

11 -.§S-'!JEmulsion as Gal
needed .715

BID TOTAL -

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT

VENDOR NAME: Performance Grade Asphalt
Page 2 of2



134
WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID FORM

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

The undersigned, by his/her signature, represents that he/she is authorized to bind the bidder
to fUlly comply with the terms and conditions of the attached Invitation for Bid, Specifications,
and Special Provisions for the amount(s) shown on the accompanying bid sheet(s). By
signing below, you have read the entire document and agreed to the terms therein.

NAME OF BIDDER: Vulcan Construction Materials. I P

Mailing Address: P.O. Box 791550

City: San Anton; 0 State: Texas Zip: 78279-1550

Telephone: (210 ) .:..52=-4'---.:..35:..:0:.;:0 _ Fax: (210 ) ~5"'-'24:t:-:...l3.iL55"-'5L_ _

==~~~~~~~!;:;~---------- Date of BID: _8_/2_1_00 _

Name and Title of Signer: ---:....::..:.....:..:.::.:~.........ll1..Lt~~ILllI;!:':!=_:_____;:___:,__---------Pat Kerry , Sales Manager
(Please Print or Type)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING:

Prompt Payment Discount: Net % 30 days. (If no discount is offered. Net 30 will apply.)
[ l"all or none" basis. (Will accept award of "all" items only. If left blank, low item will apply.)
[ xl low item basis. (Will accept award on "any or aU" items.)
List Additional Limitations if applicable: _

DO NOT SIGN OR SUBMIT THIS FORM
WITHOUT READING ENTIRE DOCUMENT

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH BID

Page 6 018



.•

:135
WILLIAMSON COUNTY

BID SPECIFICATIONS/BID SHEETS

ASPHALT ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NUMBER: 01WCA002 BID OPENING DATE & TIME: AUGUST 9, 2000 - 3:00 PM

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2000 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2001

ALL ITEMS MUST CONFORM TO TxDOT 1993 STANDARDS.

ALL ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO TESTING.

ALL ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN "AS NEEDED" BASIS.

ALL QUANTITIES SHOWN ARE ESTIMATED qUANTITIES. THE ACTUAL QUANTITY PURCHASED MAY
BE MORE OR LESS. THE COUNTY IS NOT OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM AMOUNT AND
THE COUNTY MAY PURCHASE ANY REASONABLE AMOUNT GREATER THAN THE ESTIMATE FOR THE
SAME UNIT PRICE.

SPECIFY F.O.B. SITES.

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.O.B.
t

QTY UNIT I UNIT I EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE
1 Black Base, as Ton

See Next PagTxDot Item 330, Type A needed
To reach 95% Lab density

2 Asphalt Concrete, 8,000 Ton
TxDot Item 330, Type C See Next Pa
To reach 95% Lab density

3 Hot Mix Cold Lay, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type D needed NO BIO
To reach 95% Lab density

•

4 Hot Mix Cold Lay Black Base, as Ton
TxDot Item 334, Type A needed NO BID
To reach 95% Lab density ,

5 AC-5 as Ton NO BID
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed

,

6 Ac-10 as Ton
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 1 needed NO BID

7 RC-250 10,000 Gal
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 4 NO BID

8 MC-30 as Gal NO BID
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 5 . needed

9 HFRS-2 OR CRS-2, I : 100,000 Gal
TxDot Item 300.2, Table 7 & 8. NO BID
Circle the one YOU are bidding i

e

ASPHALT
ATIACHMENT

VENDOR NAME:
Page 1 of 2
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ITEM DESCRIPTION
I

F.O.B. aTY UNIT UNIT ! EXTENSION
# SITE PRICE ,
10 HFRS-2P OR CRS-2P as Gal ,

TxDot Item 300.2, Table 9, needed
!

NO BID
Circle the one you are biddina I

11 SS-1 Emulsion as Gal I, NO BID
needed i ,

BID TOTAL

Items I & 2

Truc k De1i very

Grainger
Florence
Liberty Hi 11
Taylor

Unit Price/Ton

534.88 Ton
534.88 Ton
534.01 Ton
533.58 Ton

ASPHALT
ATTACHMENT

VENDOR NAME:
Page2012
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CONCRETE

LABOR


