
AGENDA ITEM * 16

Discuss and take action on request to amend budget order for Mental Health
Officer from Precinct #1 Constable to take car home, out of county.

Moved: Commissioner Hays
Seconded: Commissioner Limmer
Motion: To amend budget order for Constable, Precinct #1. Mental Health
Officer to take county automobile 1.0.5 miles outside Williamson County to
his home until January 1.,2000, on an as needed basis.
Vote: Motion carried 5 - 0

Moved: Judge Doerfler
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To amend budget order for Constable, Precinct #1. Mental Health
Officer to take county automobile 1.0.5 miles outside Williamson County to
his home until February 1.,2000, on an as needed basis.

AGENDA ITEM * 1.7

Consider awarding, rejecting or extending bid for heavy equipment for
Unified Road System.

Moved: Commissioner Boatright
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To award bids for heavy equipment for Unified Road System:

To Holt Company of Texas "Life Cycle Cost Bid" for

$52,833.00 for One (1.)Backhoe Loader 4-Wheel Drive;
$87,260.00 for One (1.)Whe7l Loader Four Wheel Drive;

$1.1.4,995.00for One (1.)Art~culated Motor Grader;
$ 98,328.00 for One (1.)Smooth Drum Vibratory Compactor;
$109,551.00 for One (1) Padfoot Vibratory Compactor
Vote: Motion carried 5 - 0
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BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER OOWC206
INDUSTRIAL 4 WHEEL DRIVE BACKHOE

ARTICULATED MOTOR GRADER
SINGLE SMOOTH DRUM VIBRATORY COMPACTOR

VIBRATORY PAD FOOT COMPACTOR

page 1 of3

THE BIDS FOR THE HEAVY EQUIPMENT WERE CONSIDERED ON THE LIFE
CYCLE COST BID. THE AWARD WAS BASED ONTHE FIVE YEAR COST OF
OWNERSHIP. THE COST WAS CALCULATED USING THE NUMBERS PROVIDED
BY THE BIDDERS ON THE BID FORMS. THE COST OF THE MACHINE, PLUS THE
GUARANTEED COST OF REPAIRS, PLUS THE COST OF THE PERFORMANCE
BOND, MINUS THE GUARANTEED RE-PURCHASE. THIS VALUE WAS DMDED
BY 60 MONTHS TO PROVIDE A COST OF OWNER SHIP DURING THAT FIVE
YEAR PEROID. THE PRICE SHOWN IS BY THE MONTH ....

ONE - BACKHOE LOADER 4·WHEEL DRIVE &/-rl'i);:nd::
1.HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS "LIFE CYCLE COS;:;;; e. -, ~
CATERPILLAR 416C 4x4 ES $59,408.00 +CAB AIR $1,625.00 = $61,033.00

LESS TRADE $8,200.00
...FIVE YEAR @ $422.55 A MONTH NET COST $52,833.00

2. TEXANA MACHINERY
CASE 580L TURBO
...FIVE YEAR @ $679.60 A MONTH

$53,912.00 + CAB AIR $1,315.00 = $55,227.00
LESS TRADE $6,500.00

NET COST $48,729.00
3. HGACIRDO EQUIPMENT
JOHN DEERE 310E
...FIVE YEAR "NO BID"

$54,392.00 +CAB AIR $1,272.00 = $55,665.00
LESS TRADE $6,000.00

NET COST $49,665.00

$60,620.00 + CAB AIR $2,150.00 = $62,770.00
LESS TRADE $5,000.00
NET COST $57,770.00

4. ANDERSON MACHINERY
JCB 214-3 TURBO 4x4
...FIVE YEAR @ $829.95 A MONTH
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BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER OOWC206

page2of3

eU-Z3A'I
ONE - WHEEL LOADER FOUR WHEEL DRIVE C, ~

1. HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS "LIFE CYCLE COST ID" $91,760.00
CATERPILLAR 9280 WHEEL LOADER LESS TRADE $4,500.00
* FIVE YEAR @ $536.67 A MONTH NET COST $87,260.00

2. TEXANA MACHINERY
CASE 621C
* FIVE YEAR @ $991.05 A MONTH

3. CRESCENT MACHINERY CO.
JCB WHEEL LOADER
* FIVE YEAR "NO BID"

4. HOACIRDO EQUIPMENT
JOHN DEERE 5440
* FIVE YEAR "NO BID"

5. ANDERSON MACHINERY
NEW HOLLAND LW-130
* FIVE YEAR@ $1,536.11 A MONTH

$81,715.00
LESS TRADE $2,500.00

NET COST $79,215.00

$84,750.00
LESS TRADE $2,500.00
NET COST $82,250.00

$86,011.00
LESS TRADE $3,000.00
NET COST $83,011.00

$111,538.00
}~ C\ LESS TRADE $6,500.00

_~ ~~~.j1JffiT COST $105,038.00

ONE _ARTICULATED MOTOR GRADER "'I~ bJY ~

1.HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS "LIFE CYCLE COST BID"
CATERPILLAR 120H
* FIVE YEAR @ $471.00 A MONTH

2. HOACIRDO EQUIPMENT
JOHN DEERE 670C
* FIVE YEAR "NO BID"

3. ANDERSON MACHINERY AUSTIN, INC
NEW HOLLAND RO-140
* FIVE YEAR@ $1,542.10 A MONTH

$127,510.00
LESS TRADE $12,515.00
NET COST $114,995.00

$119,988.00
LESS TRADE $6,000.00
NET COST $113,988.00

$127,614.00
LESS TRADE $13,500.00
NET COST $114,114.00
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BID TABULNATION page 3 of 3
BID NUMBER OOWC206 '\'1

~

'11-'2,

ONE - SMOOTH DRUM VIBRATORY COMPACTOR ~ f-

l. HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS "LIFE CYCLE COST BID"
CATERPILLAR CS563
• FIVE YEAR@ $804.46 A MONTH

$97,795.00
LESS TRADE $1,800.00
NET COST $95,995.00

2.COOPER EQUIPMENT CO.
CHAMPION SUPERPAC 8420 SMOOTH
• FIVE YEAR @ $973.47 A MONTH

3. TEXANAMACHINERY
VIBROMAX 11050
• FIVE YEAR@ $1,042.06 A MONTH

$75,606.00
LESS TRADE $3,500.00

NET COST $72,106.00

$78,000.00
LESS TRADE $1,000.00

NET COST $77,000.00

4. CLOSNER EQUlPEMENT CO., INC.
OYNAPAC CA 2620
• FIVE YEAR "NO BID"

$88,961.00
LESS TRADE $6,000.00

NET COST $82,961.00
5. ANDERSON MACHINERY AUSTIN, INC.
HYSTER HYP AC C-850B
• FIVE YEAR@$1,458.94AMONTH

$100,828.00
LESS TRADE $2,500.00
NET COST $98,328.00

_.... _.~ II.z 3,1JIq
ONE - PADFOOT VIBRATORY COMPACTOR ~~ ~

1. HOLT COMPANY OF TEXAS "LIFE CYCLE COS~ BID" ~ $109,551.00
CATERPILLAR CP5630, • FIVE YEAR@ $912.28 A MONTH

2. TEXANA MACHINERY
VIBROMAX 1105PO, • FIVE YEAR @ $1,079.66 A MONTH

3. COOPER EQUIPMENT CO.
CHAMPION SUPERPAC 8420, • FIVE YEAR@ 1,093.25 A MONTH

4. CLOSNER EQUIPMENT CO. INC
OYNAPAC 262PO,· FIVE YEAR ''NO BID"

$80,500.00

$80,873.00

$93.085.00

5. ANDERSON MACHINERY AUSTIN, INC.
HYSTER C-852B, • FIVE YEAR@ $1,593.28 A MONTH

$105,656.00
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AGENDA ITEM # 18

Hold public hearing on Resubdivision of Lots 5 and 6, Sundance Ranch.

Judge Doerfler opened the public hearing on resubdivision of Lots 5 and 6,
Sundance Ranch at 10:02 a.m. on Tuesday, November 23, 1999.

Wilson Foreman advised the court he and his wife own both Lots 5 and 6 and
have obtained septic system permit from Cities and County Health District.
Both have also signed documentation to never sell one tract without the
other.

Judge Doerfler closed the public hearing on resubdi vision of Lots 5 & 6,
Sundance Ranch at 10:07 a.m. on Tuesday, November 23, 1999.

AGENDA ITEM # 19

Consider approving Resubdivision of Lots 5 and 6, Sundance Ranch.

Moved: Commissioner Boatright
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To approve Resubdivision of Lots 5 and 6, Sundance Ranch.
Vote: Motion carried 5 - 0

AGENDA ITEM # 20 *

Consider granting preliminary plat approval for The Parke at Anderson Mill.

Moved: Commissioner Boatright
Seconded: Commissioner Limmer
Motion: To grant preliminary plat approval for The Parke At Anderson Mill.
Vote: Motion carried 5 - 0

AGENDA ITEM # 21

Consider approving $2,000.00 Change Order from Baker Aicklen for County Road
272 project, strip map.

Commissioner Boatright requested this item be tabled, therefore no action
was taken.

AGENDA ITEM # 22 *

Consider approving $14,000.00 Change Order from Baker Aicklen for County
Road 272 project, Phase III.

Commissioner Boatright requested this item be tabled, therefore no action
was taken.

AGENDA ITEM # 23

Consider approving contract for Drofessional services with Dwight Russell
Associates for services at Taylor barn.

Moved: Commissioner Hays
Seconded: Judge Doerfler
Motion: To approve contract for professional services with Dwight Russell
Associates for services at Taylor barn.
Vote: Motion carried 5 - 0

< Clerk copy here >
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