
BIDS FOR ROAD SIDE CHEMICALS
SHADED AREAS ARE LOW BIDS

-------------------._---._.

CHEMICAL COMPANIES

CHEMICALS TERRA
TIMBERLAND INDUSTRIES

46.80 pr 30
gal

ESTES HELENA •

HyVar X·L 48.50 pr gal AA "1) or mll .

Cide·Kick

Garlon 4

Garlon 3-A

46.25 pr gal 46.25 pr gal

75.82 pr gal

no bid

82.32 pr gal

15.50 pr gal

no bid

57,20 pi (J I 59.64 pr gal 73.80 pr gal no bid

Round-Up 42.36 pr gal
1270. pr drum

Tordon ·K
11-----11------1··

75.69 pr gal

Oust 163.20 pr Ib

Arsenal

< 48.05 pr gal
1337.10 pr
drum

85.20 pr gal 41.95 pr gal

.f- 163.00 pr Ib no bid

.~ 29.95 pr gal no bid

217.60 pr gal no bid

Pathfinder 27.20 pr gal

Rodeo

Cide Kick II

94.46 pr gal

no bid

105. pr gal

16.50 pr gal

96.00 pr gal

no bid

AD 100
Surfactant

. no bid

AGENDA ITEM # 15 July 15, 1997 *
Consider and take appropriate action to rescind action taken in court on July
8, 1997 regarding the replatting of Lots 14, 15 & 16 in Sundance Ranch.

Moved: Commissioner Boatright
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To rescind action taken in court on July 8, 1997 approving replatting
of Lots 14, 15 & 16 in Sundance Ranch.
Vote: Motion carried 4 - a

4.4.



.

AGENDA ITEM # 16 July 15. 1997 *
CQnsider authQrizing advertising and setting date fQr a public hearing fQr
the Re-subdiyisiQn Qf LQt 26. SQuth San Gabriel Ranches.
Moved: CQmmissiQner BQatright
SecQnded: CQmmissiQner Hays
MQtiQn: TQ authQrize advertising and set August 12, 1997 at 10:00 AM fQr a
public hearing fQr the Re-subdivisiQn Qf LQt 26, SQuth San Gabriel Ranches.
VQte: MQtiQn carried 4 - 0

AGENDA ITEM # 17 July 15. 1997 *
CQnsider authQrizing advertising and setting date fQr a public hearing fQr
the Re-subdivisiQn Qf LQt 15, Bear Creek Ranch.
MQved: CQmmissiQner Hays
SecQnded: CQmmissiQner Mehevec
MQtiQn: TQ authQrize advertising August 19, 1997 at 10:00 AM fQr a pUblic
hearing fQr the Re-subdivisiQn Qf LQt 15, Bear Creek Ranch.
VQte: MQtiQn carried 4 - 0

AGENDA ITEM # IS July 15, 1997 *
Consider authQrizing advertising and setting date fQr a public hearing fQr
the ThQmas SubdiyisiQn. a Re-subdiyisiQn Qf LQt 5. SQuth San Gabriel Ranches.
MQved: CQmmissiQner Hays
Secdnded: CQmmissiQner BQatright
MQtiQn: TQ authQrize advertising August 12, 1997 at 10:15 AM fQr a public
hearing fQr the ThQmas SubdivisiQn, which is a Re-subdivisiQn of Lot 5, South
San Gabriel Ranches.
VQte: MotiQn carried 4 - 0

AGENDA ITEM # 19 July 15. 1997 *
Consider accepting rQads fQr maintenance in The Ranch at Cypress Creek.
SectiQns 1.2.3 and 4.
MQved: CQmmissiQner Hays
Seconded: CQmmissiQner BQatright
MQtion: To accept rQads for maintenance in The Ranch at Cypress Creek,
SectiQns 1,2,3 and 4.
VQte: MQtion carried 4 - 0

AGENDA ITEM # 20 July 15, 1997 *
CQnsider awarding bid fQr Anderson Mill RQad Phase II.
Garrett Tuttle, with Baker-Aicklen & Associates, Inc., recQmmended the be
awarded tQ the low bidder-Smith Contracting. There was an errQr on item #13
therefore· the bid is $1,000 less than what was read.
MQved: Commissioner Boatright
SecQnded: CQmmissiQner Mehevec
MQtion: TQ award bid for AndersQn Mill Road Phase II to Smith CQntracting
taking money from Capital Metro budget!s to pay for the shQrtfall.
Vote: MOtion carried 4 - 0
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