
Moved: Commissioner Mehevec
Seconded: Judge DoerflerMotion: To write letter to Texas Workers' Compensation Commission and put on
the July 22, 1997 agenda to set date to receive re-bids.
Vote: Motion carried 4 - 0

AGENDA ITEM # 11 July 15. 1997 *
Hold public hearing on setting speed limit for Oak Grove Road.
At 11:10 AM Judge Doerfler announced public hearing on setting speed limit
for Oak Grove Road open.
Residents along Oak Grove Road addressed the court requesting a 35 mph speed
limit.
At 11:15 AM Judge Doerfler announced public hearing on setting speed limit
for Oak Grove Road closed.

AGENDA ITEM # 12 July 15. 1997 *
Consider approving speed limit for Oak Groye Road.
Moved: Commissioner Boatright
Seconded: Judge Doerfler
Motion: To approve speed limit of 35 mph for Oak Grove Road.
Vote: Motion carried 3 - 0 Commissioner HayS absent from the dais

AGENDA ITEM # 13 July 15. 1997 *
Consider granting preliminary plat approval to Neely Subdivision.
Joe England stated this subdivision is in the Leander ETJ.
additional right-of-way on the county roads and some notes
added.

We will require
will need to be

Moved: Commissioner Boatright
Seconded: Judge Doerfler
Motion: To grant preliminary plat approval to Neely Subdivision with changes.
Vote: Motion carried 3 - 0 Commissioner Mehevec absent from the dais

AGENDA ITEM # 14 July 15. 1997 *
.Consider awarding bids for roadside chemical' and herbigides.

Moved: Commissioner Mehevec
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To award bid for roadside chemicals and herbicides eliminating Qust
and Pathfinder.
Vote: Motion carried 4 - 0

< Clerk copy here >
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BIDS FOR ROAD SIDE CHEMICALS
SHADED AREAS ARE LOW BIDS

-------------------._---._.

CHEMICAL COMPANIES

CHEMICALS TERRA
TIMBERLAND INDUSTRIES

46.80 pr 30
gal

ESTES HELENA •

HyVar X·L 48.50 pr gal AA "1) or mll .

Cide·Kick

Garlon 4

Garlon 3-A

46.25 pr gal 46.25 pr gal

75.82 pr gal

no bid

82.32 pr gal

15.50 pr gal

no bid

57,20 pi (J I 59.64 pr gal 73.80 pr gal no bid

Round-Up 42.36 pr gal
1270. pr drum

Tordon ·K
11-----11------1··

75.69 pr gal

Oust 163.20 pr Ib

Arsenal

< 48.05 pr gal
1337.10 pr
drum

85.20 pr gal 41.95 pr gal

.f- 163.00 pr Ib no bid

.~ 29.95 pr gal no bid

217.60 pr gal no bid

Pathfinder 27.20 pr gal

Rodeo

Cide Kick II

94.46 pr gal

no bid

105. pr gal

16.50 pr gal

96.00 pr gal

no bid

AD 100
Surfactant

. no bid

AGENDA ITEM # 15 July 15, 1997 *
Consider and take appropriate action to rescind action taken in court on July
8, 1997 regarding the replatting of Lots 14, 15 & 16 in Sundance Ranch.

Moved: Commissioner Boatright
Seconded: Commissioner Hays
Motion: To rescind action taken in court on July 8, 1997 approving replatting
of Lots 14, 15 & 16 in Sundance Ranch.
Vote: Motion carried 4 - a
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